
  

UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 
 
In re  
 
 MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, et al., 
 
    Debtors. 
 

 
Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 09-50026 
(REG) 
 
(Jointly Administered) 

 
SUMMARY SHEET PURSUANT TO UNITED STATES TRUSTEE 

GUIDELINES FOR REVIEWING APPLICATIONS FOR COMPENSATION  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES FILED UNDER 11 U.S.C. § 330 

 
FIFTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION 

Name of Applicant: Butzel Long, a professional corporation (“BL”) 

Role in the Case: Special Counsel to the Official Committee of Unsecured Creditors of 
Motors Liquidation Company, f/k/a General Motors Corporation 

 
Date of Retention: July 13, 2009, nunc pro tunc to June 10, 2009 

 
FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION 

Period for which compensation and 
reimbursement are sought: 

October 1, 2010 through and including 
March 31, 2011 

Amount of compensation sought: $703,367.501 

Amount of expense reimbursement sought: $59,500.51 
 

FINAL FEE APPLICATION 

Period for which compensation and 
reimbursement are sought: 

June 10, 2009 through and including     
March 31, 2011 

Amount of compensation sought: $2,046,609.062 

Amount of expense reimbursement sought: $144,757.173 
 

                                            
1  This amount excludes more than $24,000 of fees incurred by BL during April 2011 in connection 
with the preparation of this Application.  BL has not and will not seek compensation for such fees, but 
requests that the Fee Examiner consider this concession in the event that it suggests the disallowance of 
any compensation requested herein. 
 
2  Reflects reductions to fees taken by BL, in the aggregate amount of $17,096.69, both before and 
after the hearings to consider its prior interim fee applications. 
 
3  Reflects reductions to expenses taken by BL, in the aggregate amount of $1,636.83, before the 
hearings to consider its prior interim fee applications. 



  

PRIOR INTERIM FEE APPLICATIONS 

Date of 
Application 

Docket 
No. 

Application 
Period 

Fees 
Requested 

Expenses 
Requested 

Fees Allowed  Fee Hold-
Back 

Expenses 
Allowed  

11/16/09 4450 6/10/09 – 
9/30/09 $237,775.50 $21,265.87 $236,158.74 $23,615.87 $20,996.55 

3/17/10 5293 10/1/09 – 
1/31/10 $258,825.50 $12,188.98 $253,659.37 $25,365.94 $11,109.70 

8/5/10 6542 2/1/10 – 
5/31/10 $429,844.75 $20,791.35 $419,530.954 $48,632.675 $20,662.12 

11/15/10 7754 6/1/10 – 
9/30/10 $433,892.50 $32,647.29 $433,892.50 $43,389.25 $32,488.29 

Total   $1,360,338.25 $86,893.49 $1,343,241.56 $141,003.73 $85,256.66 

 
 
 
 
 
 

                                            
4 On November 23, 2010, the Court entered an order awarding BL $412,109.20 for fees requested 
pursuant to BL’s Third Interim Fee Application and carving out $12,749.75 of fees requested by BL for 
those relating to compensation for the fee review process.  On January 3, 2011, BL and the Fee Examiner 
agreed that only $5,058.00, rather than $12,749.75, should be disallowed for the fee review process, a 
difference of $7,421.75 (the “Fees on Fees Differential”).  Accordingly, the Fees on Fees Differential is 
included in the “Fees Allowed” column pertaining to BL’s Third Interim Fee Application. 
 
5  Includes the Fees on Fees Differential. 



  

SUMMARY OF THE FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION 
OF BUTZEL LONG FOR SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE 

COMPENSATION PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 
 

Shareholders  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional:  

 
 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted6 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate7 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Regina M. Alter  
(New York) 

LIT - 1997 $440.00 0.8 $352.00 

Eric Fisher  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1996 $525.00 - $575.00 297.6 $161,530.00 

Cynthia J. Haffey 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1997 $390.00 0.5 $195.00 

Claudia Rast 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1987 $400.00 20.2 $8,080.00 

Barry N. Seidel  
(New York) 

BK - 1978 $725.00 - $750.00 129.4 $94,727.50 
 

Robert Sidorsky  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $625.00 29.7 $18,562.50 

Total   478.2 $283,447.00 
 
 

Associates 
 
Name and Location  
of Professional: 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

Total 
Hours 
Billed 

Total 
Compensation 

Maria Caceres-
Boneau (New York) 

LIT - 2008 $325.00 - $335.00 186.6 $61,859.00 
 

Katie L. Cooperman 
(New York) 

BK, CORP - 2006 $395.00 - $425.00 764.4 $315,711.00 

David J. DeVine 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2006 $285.00 - $300.00 38.4 $11,488.50 
 

Jennifer A. Dukarski 
(Michigan) 

IP, LIT - 2010 $225.00 1.5 $337.50 

Donald Orlandoni 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2007 $240.00 - $275.00 64.2 $17,525.50 

Laura Tedesco 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 2009 $235.00 6.4 $1,504.00 

Total   1,061.5 $408,425.50 
 

                                            
6  BK – Bankruptcy, CORP – Corporate, IP – Intellectual Property, LIT – Litigation. 
 
7  As of the period beginning January 1, 2011, BL has billed all professionals and paraprofessionals 
at their standard 2011 rates. 



  

 
 

Paraprofessionals 
 
Name and Location 
of Paraprofessional: 

 
 
 

Department 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 
 
Total Compensation 

Frederick Capria  
(New York) 

LIT $245.00 - $270.00 37.7 $9,666.50 
 

Michelle Martinez  
(New York) 

LIT $150.00 1.1 $165.00 

Alexis Richards 
(Michigan) 

LIT $165.00 1.7 $280.50 

Stephanie Shattuck 
(Michigan) 

LIT $180.00 39.6 $7,128.00 

Total   80.1 $17,240.00 
 
 

 
 

Professionals 

 
 

Blended Rate 

 
 

Total Hours Billed 

 
 

Total Compensation 
Shareholders  $592.74 478.2 $283,447.00 
Associates $384.76 1,061.5 $408,425.50 
Paraprofessionals $215.23 80.1 $17,240.00 
Total Fees Incurred  1,619.8 $709,112.50 
Blended Attorney Rate $449.36   
    
Total Fees Incurred 
Less Adjustment8 
Total Fees Requested 

  
 

1,619.8 

$709,112.50 
($5,745.00) 

$703,367.50 
 

 
 
 

                                            
8  BL has only requested 50% of fees incurred in connection with its preparation of monthly fee 
statements. 



  

 
 
 

SUMMARY OF THE FINAL FEE APPLICATION 
OF BUTZEL LONG FOR SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE 

COMPENSATION PERIOD JUNE 10, 2009 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 

Shareholders  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted 9 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 10 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Regina M. Alter  
(New York) 

LIT $440.00 0.8 $352.00 

Richard Brosnick 
(New York) 

LIT - 1997 $490.00 8.5 $4,165.00 

Ross Ellick  
(New York) 

LIT - 1989 $495.00 - $525.00 49.6 $25,977.00 

Eric Fisher  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1996 $525.00 - $575.00 999.4 $529,975.00 
 

Jane Greyf  
(New York) 

CORP - 1999 $590.00 2.1 $1,239.00 

Cynthia J. Haffey 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1997 $390.00 0.5 $195.00 

Christopher Nelson 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1995 $350.00 18.9 $6,615.00 

Samuel M. Ofsevit 
(New York) 

RE - 1981 $475.00 0.2 $95.00 

Thomas B. Radom 
(Michigan) 

BK - 1974 $475.00 3.1 $1,472.50 

Claudia Rast 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1987 $400.00 20.2 $8,080.00 

Barry N. Seidel  
(New York) 

BK - 1978 $725.00 - $750.00 442.8 $321,942.50 
 

Robert Sidorsky  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $625.00 48.3 $30,187.50 

E. Dale Wilson 
(Michigan) 

CORP, RE - 1999 $285.00 - $335.00 8.2 $2,417.00 
 

Total    1602.6 $932,712.50 
 

                                            
9  BK – Bankruptcy, CORP – Corporate, IP – Intellectual Property, LIT – Litigation, RE – Real 
Estate. 
 
10  As of the periods beginning January 1, 2010 and January 1, 2011, Butzel Long has billed all 
professionals and paraprofessionals at their standard 2010 and 2011 rates, as applicable.  



  

 
Counsel  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Robert Sidorsky11  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $535.00 
 

5.0 
 

$2,675.00 
 

Total    5.0 $2,675.00 
 
 

Senior Attorney 
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

William J. Kohler 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 1986 $410.00 7.9 $3,239.00 

Total    7.9 $3,239.00 
 
 

Associates 
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Maria Caceres-
Boneau (New York) 

LIT - 2008 $325.00 - $335.00 331.0 $108,789.00 
 

Katie L. Cooperman 
(New York) 

BK, CORP - 2006 $350.00 - $425.00 2209.4 $878,124.00 

David J. DeVine 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2006 $285.00 - $300.00 38.4 $11,488.50 
 

Jennifer A. Dukarski 
(Michigan) 

IP, LIT - 2010 $225.00 1.5 $337.50 

Orlee Goldfeld  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1999 $360.00 - $435.00 37.7 
 

$13,601.50 
 

Omer Granit  
(New York) 

CORP - 2008 $325.00 32.5 $10,562.50 

Donald Orlandoni 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2007 $240.00 - $275.00 64.2 $17,525.50 

Laura Tedesco 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 2009 $215.00 - $235.00 18.3 $4,062.50 
 

Total    2733.0 $1,044,491.00 
 

 
 
 

                                            
11  On or about January 27, 2010, Mr. Sidorsky became a shareholder.  Prior to this date, he was 
employed as counsel. 



  

 
Paraprofessionals 
 
Name and Location 
of Paraprofessional: 

 
 
 

Department 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Frederick Capria  
(New York) 

LIT $235.00 - $270.00 326.5 $79,679.50 

Vanessa Lozzi  
(Michigan) 

LIT $175.00 2.0 $350.00 

Deanna Mejia  
(Michigan) 

LIT $140.00 6.2 $868.00 

Michelle Martinez  
(New York) 

LIT $150.00 3.7 $555.00 

Michelle Ann Pleban 
(Michigan) 

LIT $155.00 - $165.00 9.7 $1,548.50 

Tonia Borg Renko 
(Michigan) 

LIT $165.00 1.2 $198.00 

Alexis Richards 
(Michigan) 

LIT $150.00 - $165.00 2.1 $340.50 

Kimberly Schoening 
(Michigan) 

LIT $135.00 - $140.00 25.1 $3,438.00 
 

Stephanie Shattuck 
(Michigan) 

LIT $180.00 39.6 $7,128.00 

Total    416.1 $94,105.50 
 
 

Summer Associates 
 
Name and Location of Professional: 

 
 
Department 12 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

Total 
Hours  
Billed 

 
Total 

Compensation 
Andre Garron  
(New York) 

SA* $175.00 5.3 $927.50 

Max Heuer  
(New York) 

SA* $175.00 1.0 $175.00 

Total    6.3 $1,102.50 

                                            
12  SA – Summer Associate, * Not yet admitted to the bar. 



  

 
 

Professionals 
 
Blended Rate 

 
Total Hours Billed 

 
Total Compensation 

Shareholders  $582.00 1602.6 $932,712.50 
Counsel $535.00 5.0 $2,675.00 
Senior Attorney $410.00 7.9 $3,239.00 
Associates $382.18 2733.0 $1,044,491.00 
Paraprofessionals $226.16 416.1 $94,105.50 
Summer Associates $175.00 6.3 $1,102.50 
Total Fees Incurred  4,770.9 $2,078,325.50 
Blended Attorney Rate $456.05   
    
Total Fees Incurred 
Less 50% Adjustment13 
Less Further Adjustments14 
Total Fees Requested 

  
 
 

4,770.9 

$2,078,325.50 
 ($14,619.75) 
($17,096.69) 

$2,046,609.06 
 
 
 

  
 

                                            
13  BL has only requested 50% of fees incurred in connection with its preparation of monthly fee 
statements. 
 
14  Reduction comprised of (i) $1,102.50 for fees incurred by BL summer associates, (ii) $2,811.44 
for vague time entries, (iii) $4,102.50 for multiple attendees at various hearings, (iv) $303.00 for a billing 
rate error, (v) $144.00 for clerical and administrative tasks, (vi) $5,058.00 for the fee review process, and 
(vii) $3,575.25 for compensation matters unrelated to fee applications. 



 

 
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 
 
In re  
 
 MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, et al., 
 
    Debtors. 
 

 
Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 09-50026 
(REG) 
 
(Jointly Administered) 

 
 

FIFTH INTERIM AND FINAL FEE APPLICATION  
OF BUTZEL LONG, A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION,  

AS SPECIAL COUNSEL TO THE OFFICIAL COMMITTEE OF  
UNSECURED CREDITORS OF MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY,  
f/k/a GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION, FOR ALLOWANCE OF 

COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONAL SERVICES RENDERED  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES  
INCURRED DURING THE (I) INTERIM COMPENSATION PERIOD  
OCTOBER 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 AND (II) ENTIRE  

COMPENSATION PERIOD JUNE 10, 2009 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 

TO: THE HONORABLE ROBERT E. GERBER, 
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY JUDGE: 

 
Butzel Long, a professional corporation (“BL”), Special Counsel to the Official 

Committee of Unsecured Creditors (the “Committee”) of Motors Liquidation Company, f/k/a 

General Motors Corporation (together with its chapter 11 filing affiliates, the “Debtors”), for its 

fifth interim and final application (the “Application”), pursuant to sections 330(a) and 331 of 

title 11 of the United States Code (the “Bankruptcy Code”) and Rule 2016 of the Federal Rules 

of Bankruptcy Procedure (the “Bankruptcy Rules”), for (i) allowance of compensation for 

professional services rendered to the Committee by BL during the interim compensation period 

from October 1, 2010, through and including March 31, 2011 (the “Fifth Interim 
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Compensation Period”) in the amount of $703,367.501 and reimbursement of actual, reasonable 

and necessary expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of services in the amount of 

$59,500.51, which amounts have not been the subject of previous interim fee applications, (ii) 

final allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee by BL 

during the period commencing June 10, 2009 through and including March 31, 2011 (the 

“Entire Compensation Period”) in the aggregate amount of $2,046,609.06 and reimbursement 

of actual, reasonable and necessary expenses incurred in connection with the rendition of 

services in the amount of $144,757.17, and (iii) final allowance of all amounts previously held 

back in the aggregate amount of $347,496.93 (the “Holdback”).2  In support of this Application, 

BL respectfully represents as follows: 

SUMMARY OF PROFESSIONAL COMPENSATION  
AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES REQUESTED  

 
1. This Application has been prepared in accordance with the Amended Guidelines 

for Fees and Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of New York Bankruptcy 

Cases dated November 25, 2009 (the “Local Guidelines”), the United States Trustee Guidelines 

for Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 

U.S.C. § 330 adopted on January 30, 1996 (the “UST Guidelines”), and this Court’s Order 

Pursuant to 11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and 

Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered August 7, 2009 (Docket No. 3711) (the 

“Administrative Order,” and together with the Local Guidelines and the UST Guidelines, the 

                                            
1  This amount excludes more than $24,000 of fees incurred by BL during April 2011 in connection 
with the preparation of this Application.  BL has not and will not seek compensation for such fees, but 
requests that the Fee Examiner consider this concession in the event that it suggests the disallowance of 
any compensation requested herein. 
 
2  This amount includes $7,421.75 for the Fees on Fees Differential, as defined and discussed 
herein. 
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“Guidelines”).  Pursuant to the Local Guidelines, a certification regarding compliance with the 

same is annexed hereto as Exhibit A.   

2. This Application has also been prepared in accordance with this Court’s rulings 

on the four (4) prior BL interim fee applications.  Further, BL has endeavored to comply with the 

directions provided by Brady C. Williamson as fee examiner (the “Fee Examiner”) in 

connection with such prior BL interim fee applications.  BL will provide a copy of this 

Application to the Fee Examiner. 

3. As set forth above, by this Application, BL requests (i) allowance of interim 

compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee by BL during the Fifth 

Interim Compensation Period in the amount of $703,367.50 and reimbursement of actual, 

reasonable and necessary expenses disbursed in connection with the rendition of services in the 

amount of $59,500.51, (ii) final allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to 

the Committee by BL throughout these chapter 11 cases during the Entire Compensation Period 

in the aggregate amount of $2,046,609.06 and reimbursement of actual, reasonable and necessary 

expenses disbursed in connection with the rendition of services in the amount of $144,757.17, 

and (iii) final allowance of the Holdback. 

4. BL’s efforts to advise and represent the Committee during the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period and the Entire Compensation Period, and the professional services 

performed and expenses incurred in connection therewith, were actual and necessary to preserve 

and protect the interests of the unsecured creditors of the Debtors.  BL’s charges for professional 

services performed and expenses incurred are reasonable under the applicable standards.   

5. There is no agreement or understanding between BL and any other person, other 

than members of BL, for the sharing of compensation to be received for services rendered in 
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these cases.  During the Entire Compensation Period, BL has received no payment and no 

promises of payment from any source (other than the Debtors) for services rendered or to be 

rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with the matters covered by this Application. 

6. The fees charged by BL in these cases are billed in accordance with BL’s existing 

billing rates, from time to time, and procedures in effect during the Entire Compensation Period.3  

The rates BL charges for the services rendered by its professionals and paraprofessionals in these 

cases are the same rates BL charges for professional and paraprofessional services rendered in 

comparable bankruptcy and nonbankruptcy matters.  Such fees are reasonable based on the 

customary compensation charged by comparably skilled practitioners in comparable bankruptcy 

and nonbankruptcy cases in a competitive national legal market. 

7. In accordance with the UST Guidelines, annexed hereto as Exhibit B and Exhibit 

E are schedules setting forth the following information for the Fifth Interim Compensation 

Period and the Entire Compensation Period, respectively: (i) the name and office location of all 

BL professionals and paraprofessionals who have performed services for the Committee in these 

chapter 11 cases, (ii) the capacities in which each individual was employed by BL during the 

applicable period, (iii) the department(s) in which each individual practices, (iv) the hourly 

billing rate(s) charged by BL for the services performed by such individuals, (v) the year in 

which each attorney was first licensed to practice law, and (vi) the aggregate number of hours 

expended by each individual in these matters and the fees billed therefor.   

8. Annexed hereto as Exhibit C and Exhibit F are schedules for the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period and the Entire Compensation Period, respectively, specifying the 
                                            
3  BL mistakenly billed various professionals at reduced rates for the June 10, 2009 – July 31, 2009 
period (whereby BL provided an unintended benefit of $7,139 to the Debtors’ estates).  BL mistakenly 
billed one paraprofessional at a reduced rate for the June 10, 2009 – October 31, 2009 period (whereby 
BL provided an unintended benefit of $743 to the Debtors’ estates).  BL has not sought compensation for 
these unintended benefits. 
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categories of expenses for which BL is seeking reimbursement and the total amount for each 

such expense category.  A detailed breakdown of all such expenses, including the date incurred, 

amount and description thereof, as well as the individual who incurred such expense and the 

project code related thereto, is also included in Exhibit C.  An itemized schedule of all such 

expenses has been provided to the Debtors, the attorneys for the Debtors, the attorneys for the 

Committee, the Court, the Office of the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New 

York (the “U.S. Trustee”) and the Fee Examiner. 

9.  Pursuant to the UST Guidelines, annexed hereto as Exhibit D and Exhibit G are 

summaries of BL’s time records relating to the charges for services rendered during the Fifth 

Interim Compensation Period and the Entire Compensation Period, respectively, categorized 

according to BL’s project codes hereinafter described.   

10. BL maintains computerized records of the time spent by all BL attorneys and 

paraprofessionals in connection with its engagement by the Committee.  Copies of these 

computerized records have been furnished to the Debtors, the attorneys for the Debtors, the 

attorneys for the Committee, the Court, the U.S. Trustee and the Fee Examiner in the format 

specified by the UST Guidelines.  Copies of these computerized records for the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period are annexed hereto as Exhibit H.4 

BACKGROUND 

11. The Debtors filed voluntary petitions for relief under chapter 11 of the 

Bankruptcy Code on June 1, 2009 (the “Petition Date”) in the United States Bankruptcy Court 

for the Southern District of New York. 

                                            
4 Copies of such computerized records relating to all prior BL interim fee applications are filed on 
the docket.  See Docket Nos. 4450, 5293, 6542 and 7754. 
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12. On June 3, 2009, the U.S. Trustee appointed the Committee, pursuant to section 

1102 of the Bankruptcy Code. 

13. On December 23, 2009, the Court entered an order (the “Fee Order”) appointing 

the Fee Examiner.  On February 16, 2010, the Fee Examiner filed his First Status Report and 

Advisory, which summarizes the applicable standards and guidelines for the Fee Examiner’s 

review of fee applications.  On April 8, 2010, the Fee Examiner filed his Second Status Report 

and Advisory.  

14. On March 29, 2011, the Court entered an order (Docket No. 9941) confirming the 

Debtors’ Second Amended Joint Chapter 11 Plan, dated March 18, 2011 (the “Plan”).  The 

effective date of the Plan occurred on March 31, 2011. 

Retention of BL and Prior Interim Fee Applications 

15. On June 30, 2009, the Committee filed an application (the “Retention 

Application”) with this Court pursuant to section 1103(a) of Title 11 of the Bankruptcy Code 

and Rule 2014(a) of the Bankruptcy Rules for entry of an order authorizing the employment of 

BL as Special Counsel to the Committee, nunc pro tunc to June 10, 2009, all as more fully 

described in the Retention Application (Docket No. 2847).   

16. No objections were filed to BL’s retention and, on July 13, 2009, this Court 

entered an order authorizing the employment of BL as Special Counsel to the Committee.  The 

Court’s Order went on to state: 

Butzel Long shall be compensated for Special Counsel Services performed as of June 10, 

2009, and expenses incurred in connection therewith, subject to the approval of this Court 

and compliance with Section 330(a) of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the 

Local Bankruptcy Rules of this Court, the United States Trustee’s Guidelines for Fees 
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and Disbursements issued by the Office of the United States Trustee, and such other 

procedures as may be fixed by order of this Court, for professional services rendered and 

expenses incurred by Butzel Long; 

A copy of the above order can be found at Docket No. 3124 and is incorporated herein by 

reference. 

17. On November 16, 2009, BL submitted its First Application for Interim 

Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Actual 

and Necessary Expenses Incurred From June 10, 2009 Through and Including September 30, 

2009 (the “First BL Application”) seeking approval of $237,775.50 in fees and $21,265.87 in 

expenses (Docket No. 4450).  After a hearing to consider the First BL Application on April 29, 

2010, the Court entered an order on May 21, 2010 granting the First BL Application in the total 

amount of $257,155.29 and approving a 10% holdback in the amount of $23,615.87 until the 

completion of these chapter 11 cases.  

18. On March 17, 2010, BL submitted its Second Application for Interim 

Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Actual 

and Necessary Expenses Incurred From October 1, 2009 Through and Including January 31, 

2010 (the “Second BL Application”) seeking approval of $258,825.50 in fees and $12,188.98 in 

expenses (Docket No. 5293).  After a hearing to consider the Second BL Application on June 29, 

2010, the Court entered an order on July 22, 2010 granting the Second BL Application in the 

total amount of $264,769.07 and approving a 10% holdback in the amount of $25,365.94. 

19. On August 5, 2010, BL submitted its Third Application for Interim 

Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Actual 

and Necessary Expenses Incurred From February 1, 2010 Through and Including May 31, 2010 
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(the “Third BL Application”) seeking approval of $429,844.75 in fees and $20,791.35 in 

expenses (Docket No. 6542).  After a hearing to consider the Third BL Application on October 

26, 2010, the Court entered an order on November 23, 2010 granting the Third BL Application 

in the total amount of $432,771.32, approving a 10% holdback in the amount of $41,210.92 and 

carving out $12,749.75 related to compensation for the fee review process.  On January 4, 2011, 

BL and the Fee Examiner agreed that only $5,058.00 would be disallowed for fees on fees, 

instead of $12,749.75, a difference of $7,421.75 (the “Fees on Fees Differential”).  The Fees on 

Fees Differential relating to fees requested in the Third BL Application remains unpaid and 

outstanding.  

20. On November 15, 2010, BL submitted its Fourth Application for Interim 

Allowance of Compensation for Professional Services Rendered and Reimbursement of Actual 

and Necessary Expenses Incurred From June 1, 2010 Through and Including September 30, 2010 

(the “Fourth BL Application,” and together with the First BL Application, the Second BL 

Application and the Third BL Application, the “Prior BL Fee Applications”) seeking approval 

of $433,892.50  in fees and $32,647.29 in expenses (Docket No. 7754).  After a hearing to 

consider the Fourth BL Application on December 15, 2010, the Court entered an order on 

December 22, 2010 granting the Fourth BL Application in the total amount of $466,380.79 and 

approving a 10% holdback in the amount of $43,389.25. 

BL Monthly Statements During Fifth Interim Compensation Period 

21. Pursuant to the procedures outlined in the Administrative Order, BL has served a 

statement of its fees and disbursements accrued for its professional services in the above-

captioned matter for the period commencing (i) October 1, 2010 through and including October 

31, 2010 (the “October Statement”), (ii) November 1, 2010 through and including November 
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30, 2010 (the “November Statement”), (iii) December 1, 2010 through and including December 

31, 2010 (the “December Statement”), (iv) January 1, 2011 through and including January 31, 

2011 (the “January Statement”), (v) February 1, 2011 through and including February 28, 2011 

(the “February Statement”) and (vi) March 1, 2011 through and including March 31, 2011 (the 

“March Statement,” and together with the October Statement, the November Statement, the 

December Statement, the January Statement and the February Statement, the “BL Statements”) 

upon the U.S. Trustee, the Debtors, the attorneys for the Debtors and the attorneys for the 

Committee (collectively, the “Notice Parties”).  The Administrative Order provides that the 

Notice Parties shall have at least 15 days after receipt of a monthly statement to review it, and 

shall serve any objections to the monthly statement no later than 45 days following the month for 

which compensation is sought.  During the Fifth Interim Compensation Period, BL has received 

no notice of objection to any of the BL Statements from any of the Notice Parties. 

22. BL has also served the BL Statements upon the Fee Examiner.  During the Fifth 

Interim Compensation Period, BL has received no notice of objection to any of such statements 

from the Fee Examiner. 

SUMMARY OF SERVICES  
   

23. Throughout the Fifth Interim Compensation Period and the Entire Compensation 

Period, BL rendered a substantial amount of professional services in furtherance of its 

representation of the Committee.  

24.  BL’s reputation as a leading law firm in the automotive industry was well-suited 

to its representation of the Committee.  For example, BL was engaged as supplier counsel to 

ensure that the procedures for the assumption and assignment of supplier contracts in the 363 
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transaction were fair and workable, and led discussions and negotiations on that topic with the 

Debtors’ special automotive counsel. 

25. BL was also engaged to act as conflict counsel to represent the Committee in 

matters for which the Committee’s counsel, Kramer Levin Naftalis & Frankel, LLP, was unable 

to represent the Committee due to a conflict of interest or otherwise.  As Special Counsel to the 

Committee, BL rendered its services on an “as-needed” basis.   

Fifth Interim Compensation Period 

26. In connection with its representation of the Committee during the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period, BL’s services have predominantly concerned the adversary proceeding 

commenced on the Committee’s behalf against JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A. (the “JPMorgan 

Adversary Proceeding”)5 and the objection to claims and investigation of claims and causes of 

action against certain holders of notes issued by General Motors Nova Scotia Finance Company 

(the “Nova Scotia Matter”). 

27. The following is a general, non-exhaustive summary of the significant 

professional services rendered by BL during the Fifth Interim Compensation Period only, 

organized in accordance with BL’s internal system of project codes.6 

a. JPMorgan Avoidance Complaint.  On July 31, 2009, the Committee 

commenced the JPMorgan Adversary Proceeding challenging, inter alia, the security 

interest of more than 400 lenders (the “Defendants”) to a certain term loan agreement, 

dated as of November 29, 2006, as amended by that certain first amendment dated as of 

March 4, 2009 (as amended, the “Term Loan Agreement”), and sought to recover in 
                                            
5  In addition to JPMorgan Chase Bank, N.A., there are more than 400 named defendants in the 
JPMorgan Adversary Proceeding. 
 
6  The Prior BL Applications include summaries of the professional services rendered by BL during 
the respective interim compensation periods. 
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excess of $1.4 billion, in the aggregate, from the Defendants.  During the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period, BL’s professional services in connection with the JPMorgan 

Adversary Proceeding included:  conducting legal research; reviewing the Debtor’s 

proposed plan and disclosure statement; preparing for and attending oral argument on the 

parties’ cross-motions for summary judgment; and various other tasks.   

b. General Motors Nova Scotia Finance Company.  On November 30, 2009, 

a claim was filed against the Debtors on behalf of the holders of notes (the 

“Noteholders”) issued by General Motors Nova Scotia Finance Company in the amount 

of $1,607,647,592.49 (claim no. 66319) (the “Trustee Claim”).  On December 10, 2009, 

Greenberg Traurig, LLP, on behalf of certain Noteholders, filed a similar claim against 

the Debtors (claim no. 69551) (the “Protective Claim”).  Including the Trustee Claim 

and the Protective Claim, in total, approximately fifty seven (57) claims (the “Claims”) 

have been filed by or on behalf of the Noteholders.  On July 2, 2010, BL filed an 

objection to the Trustee Claim and the Protective Claim.  On November 19, 2010, BL 

filed an amended objection applying to all Claims.  During the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period, BL’s professional services in connection with the Nova Scotia 

Matter included:  conducting legal research; analyzing the Claims and potential 

objections thereto; drafting and filing an amended objection to the Claims; reviewing 

various responses filed to the amended objection; preparing for and attending various 

Court conferences; drafting a response to various motions filed by, or on behalf of, 

certain Noteholders pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 3018 and attending a hearing on such 

motions; reviewing the Plan; drafting discovery requests, subpoenas and related 

correspondence; attending numerous meet and confers; reviewing documents produced in 
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discovery and reviewing documents to produce in discovery; drafting memoranda; and 

various other tasks.  

28. The professional services performed by BL on behalf of the Committee during the 

Fifth Interim Compensation Period required an aggregate expenditure of 1,619.8 recorded hours 

by BL’s professionals and paraprofessionals.  Of the aggregate time expended, 478.2 recorded 

hours were expended by shareholders of BL, 1,061.5 recorded hours were expended by 

associates of BL and 80.1 recorded hours were expended by paraprofessionals of BL. 

29. During the Fifth Compensation Period, BL billed the Committee for time 

expended by attorneys based on hourly rates ranging from $225 to $750 per hour.    

30. BL seeks allowance of interim compensation for professional services performed 

during the Fifth Interim Compensation Period in the amount of $703,367.50 and for expenses 

incurred in the rendition of such services in the amount of $59,500.51.  Allowance of 

compensation in the amount requested would result in a blended attorney hourly rate of 

approximately $449.36 (based on 1,539.7 recorded hours for attorneys at BL’s regular billing 

rates in effect at the time of the performance of services).  As noted, annexed hereto is a schedule 

listing each BL professional and paraprofessional who performed services in these cases during 

the Fifth Interim Compensation Period, the hourly rate charged by BL for services performed by 

such individual and the aggregate number of hours and charges by each such individual. 

31. In accordance with the Administrative Order, to date,7 BL received payments 

totaling $622,194.51 for the Fifth Interim Compensation Period, consisting of $562,694.00, 

representing 80% of the fees, and $59,500.51, representing 100% of expenses, invoiced pursuant 

                                            
7  Though not received as of the time this Application was filed, BL anticipates receiving, before 
the hearing on this Application, payment of $78,605.40 for fees and $12,189.57 for expenses on account 
of the March Statement. 
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to the October Statement, November Statement, December Statement, January Statement, 

February Statement and March Statement.   

32. The foregoing professional services performed by BL were necessary and 

appropriate to preserve and protect the interests of the unsecured creditors of the Debtors.  

Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the complexity, 

importance and nature of the problems, issues or tasks involved.  The professional services were 

performed with expedience and in an efficient manner. 

Entire Compensation Period 

33. Throughout the Entire Compensation Period, BL rendered a substantial amount of 

professional services in furtherance of its representation of the Committee, and assisted the 

Committee in Plan negotiations to ensure that, among other things, the interests of unsecured 

creditors would be preserved after the effective date of the Plan.   

34. Among other things, BL devoted a substantial amount of time toward addressing 

numerous issues in connection with (i) negotiating procedures for the assumption and assignment 

of supplier contracts, (ii) cross-motions for summary judgment in the JPMorgan Adversary 

Proceeding, (iii) analyzing and objecting to the Claims filed by or on behalf of the Noteholders 

in connection with the Nova Scotia Matter, (iv) negotiating certain provisions of the Plan and 

related disclosure statement, (v) developing strategies regarding certain confirmation objections 

filed by the Noteholders and (vi) participating in the confirmation hearing. 

35. Services rendered by BL during the Entire Compensation Period have been 

grouped into different project categories or task codes.  The number of hours and total 

compensation requested for each of the task codes during the Entire Compensation Period is set 
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forth in Exhibit G.  The services rendered during the Fifth Interim Compensation Period are 

included in the description of services rendered during the Entire Compensation Period. 

36. The majority of the services performed by members and associates of BL were 

rendered by lawyers assigned to BL’s Bankruptcy and Litigation departments.  BL has been 

actively involved in major chapter 11 cases, and currently represents or has represented, among 

others, creditors of the following debtors:  Calpine Corporation, Lear Corporation, General 

Growth Properties, Inc. and Lehman Brothers Holdings Inc.  As a consequence, BL has brought 

to these cases a high level of expertise and experience that inures to the benefit of unsecured 

creditors of the Debtors. 

37. Overall, of the 4,770.9 recorded hours expended during the Entire Compensation 

Period, 1602.6 recorded hours were expended by shareholders of BL, 2733.0 recorded hours 

were expended by associates and 416.1 recorded hours were expended by paraprofessionals.  

Allowance of compensation in the amount requested for the Entire Compensation Period would 

result in a blended attorney hourly rate of approximately $456.05 (based on 4,348.5 recorded 

hours for attorneys at BL’s regular billing rates in effect at the time of the performance of 

services).  As noted, annexed hereto is a schedule listing each BL professional and 

paraprofessional who performed services in these cases during the Entire Compensation Period, 

the hourly rate(s) charged by BL for services performed by such individual and the aggregate 

number of hours and charges by each such individual. 

38. In accordance with the Administrative Order and this Court’s orders regarding the 

Prior BL Applications, to date, BL received payments totaling $1,843,869.30, which amount 

includes $622,194.51 for the Fifth Interim Compensation Period.8 

                                            
8 See supra note 7. 
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39. The holdback of (i) $23,615.87 relating to fees requested in the First BL 

Application, (ii) $25,365.94 relating to fees requested in the Second BL Application, (iii) 

$48,632.67 (which amount includes the Fees on Fees Differential) relating to fees requested in 

the Third BL Application and (iv) $43,389.25 relating to fees requested in the Fourth BL 

Application remains unpaid and outstanding.  Accordingly, BL now seeks approval for all 

amounts allowed pursuant to the Administrative Order relating to the Fifth Interim 

Compensation Period and approval for the Debtors to pay the Holdback.  

ACTUAL AND NECESSARY DISBURSEMENTS OF BL 

40. As set forth in Exhibit C and Exhibit F hereto, BL has requested $59,500.51 for 

expenses incurred in providing professional services during the Fifth Interim Compensation 

Period, and $144,757.17 for expenses incurred in providing professional services during the 

Entire Compensation Period.  These expenses were actual, reasonable and necessary. 

41. During the Fifth Interim Compensation Period and the Entire Compensation 

Period, BL’s attorneys have devoted time during the evenings and on weekends to perform legal 

services on behalf of the Committee.  Such services were essential to meet deadlines.  Consistent 

with firm policy, attorneys of BL who worked late into the evenings were reimbursed for their 

cost for transportation from the office to home.  BL has not charged the Debtors for any 

transportation costs incurred while working on weekends.  The reimbursement amounts do not 

exceed those set forth in the UST Guidelines. 

42. BL has not charged the Debtors for any local, long distance or international 

telephone or facsimile expenses. 
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43. With respect to photocopying expenses, BL applied a credit of $665.36 relating to 

copies in compliance with the Court’s decision that such charges are reimbursable at the lesser of 

$.10 per page and cost.9   

44. None of these categories of expenses exceed the maximum rate set forth in the 

UST Guidelines.  The actual expenses incurred in providing professional services were 

necessary, reasonable and justified under the circumstances to serve the needs of the Committee. 

THE REQUESTED COMPENSATION SHOULD BE ALLOWED 

45. Section 331 of the Bankruptcy Code provides for interim compensation of 

professionals and incorporates the substantive standards of section 330 to govern the Court’s 

award of such compensation. 11 U.S.C. § 331.  Section 330 provides that a court may award a 

professional employed under section 1103 of the Bankruptcy Code “reasonable compensation for 

actual necessary services rendered . . . and reimbursement for actual, necessary expenses.” Id. 

§ 330(a)(1).  Section 330 also sets forth the criteria for the award of such compensation and 

reimbursement: 

In determining the amount of reasonable compensation to be awarded, the court 
should consider the nature, the extent, and the value of such services, taking into 
account all relevant factors, including – 

(A) the time spent on such services; 

(B) the rates charged for such services; 

(C) whether the services were necessary to the administration 
of, or beneficial at the time at which the service was rendered 
toward the completion of, a case under this title; 

(D) whether the services were performed within a reasonable 
                                            
9  In accordance with its usual and customary practice, BL charged for copies at $0.18 per page 
until the Court ruled at the April 29, 2010 fee hearing on the first and second interim fee applications that 
copies were to be charged at the lesser of $0.10 per page and cost.  As a result, BL had effectively 
“overcharged” the Debtors by $665.36 for copies invoiced pursuant to its February Statement, and 
therefore applied a credit of $665.36 against invoice number 8468869. 
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amount of time commensurate with the complexity, importance, 
and nature of the problem, issue, or task addressed; and 

(E) whether the compensation is reasonable based on the 
customary compensation charged by comparably skilled 
practitioners in cases other than cases under this title. 

Id. § 330(a)(3). 

46. BL’s role as supplier counsel terminated on or about July 5, 2009 concurrent with 

the consummation of the 363 sale.  BL has continued to serve the Committee as conflicts counsel 

during the Entire Compensation Period.  The two litigations BL is handling on behalf of the 

Committee as conflicts counsel involve billions of dollars and the outcomes are likely to have a 

meaningful impact on what distributions unsecured creditors receive in this case.   

47. Though the Plan has been confirmed and the Plan is effective, the outcomes in 

these two litigations are not yet final.  Cross-motions for summary judgment in the JPMorgan 

Adversary proceeding have not yet been decided, and the litigation concerning the Nova Scotia 

matter is still pending.  Nonetheless, given the diligent and professional way BL has performed 

its services to date, BL has done all that is necessary under the Bankruptcy Code to earn an 

award of final compensation.  As such, BL argues that the full amount be awarded and the 

Holdback be paid. 

48. In the instant case, BL respectfully submits that the services for which it seeks 

compensation and the expenditures for which it seeks reimbursement in this Application 

were necessary for, and beneficial to, the preservation, protection and prosecution of the 

Committee’s rights and claims in this chapter 11 proceeding.  Such services and expenditures 

were necessary to and in the best interests of the Committee.  The compensation requested herein 

is reasonable in light of the nature, extent, and value of such services to the Committee. 
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49. Compensation for the foregoing services as requested is commensurate with the 

complexity, importance and nature of the problems, issues and tasks involved.  The professional 

services were performed expediently and efficiently.  Whenever possible, BL sought to minimize 

the costs of its services to the Debtors by utilizing talented paraprofessionals to handle more 

routine aspects of case administration.  Groups of the same BL attorneys were utilized for similar 

tasks in these cases to minimize the costs of intra-BL communication and education about the 

Committee’s circumstances.  

50. In sum, the services rendered by BL were reasonable, necessary and beneficial to 

the Committee and were consistently performed in a timely manner commensurate with the 

complexity, importance and nature of the issues involved.  Accordingly, approval of the 

compensation for professional services and reimbursement of expenses sought herein is 

warranted. 



 

CONCLUSION 

WHEREFORE BL respectfully requests the Court enter an Order authorizing (i) the 

compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee and reimbursement of actual 

and necessary expenses incurred during the Fifth Interim Compensation Period in the amount of 

$762,868.01, consisting of $703,367.50, representing 100% of fees incurred during the Fifth 

Interim Compensation Period, and reimbursement of $59,500.51, representing 100% of actual 

and necessary expenses incurred during the Fifth Interim Compensation Period; (ii) final 

allowance of compensation for professional services rendered to the Committee and 

reimbursement of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Entire Compensation Period 

in the amount of $2,191,366.23, consisting of $2,046,609.06, representing 100% of fees incurred 

during the Entire Compensation Period, and reimbursement of $144,757.17, representing 100% 

of actual and necessary expenses incurred during the Entire Compensation Period; (iii) final 

allowance of the Holdback, which includes the Fees on Fees Differential, in the aggregate 

amount of $347,496.93; and (iv) such other and further relief as is just and proper. 

Dated:  May 16, 2011 
  New York, New York 
             
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
Respectfully submitted, 
 
BUTZEL LONG, a professional corporation 
 
 
By: /s/ Barry N. Seidel 

Barry N. Seidel 
Eric B. Fisher 
Katie L. Cooperman  
380 Madison Avenue 
New York, NY 10017 
(212) 818-1110 Telephone 
(212) 818-0494 Fax 

  
 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT A 



 
UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT 
SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK 
 
In re  
 
 MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, et al., 
 
    Debtors. 
 

 
Chapter 11 
 
Case No. 09-50026 
(REG) 
 
(Jointly Administered) 

 
 

CERTIFICATION UNDER GUIDELINES  
FOR FEES AND DISBURSEMENTS FOR PROFESSIONALS  

IN RESPECT OF FIFTH INTERIM AND FINAL APPLICATION  
OF BUTZEL LONG, A PROFESSIONAL CORPORATION FOR  

ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION AND REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES 
 

I, Barry N. Seidel, hereby certify that: 

1. I am a shareholder with the applicant firm, Butzel Long, a professional 

corporation (“BL”), with responsibility as Special Counsel to the Official Committee of 

Unsecured Creditors of Motors Liquidation Company, f/k/a General Motors Corporation (the 

“Committee”), in respect of compliance with the Amended Guidelines for Fees and 

Disbursements for Professionals in Southern District of New York Bankruptcy Cases dated 

November 25, 2009 (the “Local Guidelines”), the United States Trustee Guidelines for 

Reviewing Applications for Compensation and Reimbursement of Expenses Filed Under 11 

U.S.C. § 330, adopted on January 30, 1996 (the “UST Guidelines”) and the Order Pursuant to 

11 U.S.C. §§ 105(a) and 331 Establishing Procedures for Interim Compensation and 

Reimbursement of Expenses of Professionals, entered August 7, 2009 (Docket No. 3711) (the 

“Administrative Order,” and together with the Local Guidelines and the UST Guidelines, the 

“Guidelines”). 
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2. This certification is made in respect of BL’s fifth interim and final application 

dated May 16, 2011 (the “Application”) for allowance of compensation and reimbursement of 

expenses incurred during the (i) interim compensation period commencing October 1, 2010 

through March 31, 2011 and (ii) entire compensation period commencing June 10, 2009 through 

March 31, 2011, in accordance with the Guidelines. 

3. In respect of section A.1 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that: 

a. I have read the Application; 
 

b. to the best of my knowledge, information and belief formed after 
reasonable inquiry, the fees and disbursements sought fall within 
the Local Guidelines and the UST Guidelines;  

 
c. the fees and disbursements sought are billed at rates and in 

accordance with practices customarily employed by BL and 
generally accepted by BL’s clients; and 

 
d. in providing a reimbursable service, BL does not make a profit on 

that service, whether the service is performed by BL in-house or 
through a third party. 

 
4. In respect of section A.2 of the Local Guidelines and as required by the 

Administrative Order, I certify that BL has complied with the provisions requiring it to provide 

the appropriate notice parties, on a monthly basis, with a statement of BL’s fees and 

disbursements accrued during the previous month, as set forth in the Administrative Order. 

5. In respect of section A.3 of the Local Guidelines, I certify that (a) the Debtors, the 

former chair of the Committee and the United States Trustee for the Southern District of New 

York have all been provided with a copy of the Application on May 2, 2011, (b) the attorneys for 

the Committee have been provided with a copy of the Application on May 4, 2011 and (c) the 

chair of the Committee, elected on May 10, 2011, has been provided with a copy of the 

Application on May 10, 2011.



 

Dated:  May 16, 2011 
  New York, New York 
             
 
 

 
 
 /s/ Barry N. Seidel 
      Barry N. Seidel 

 
  
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT B 



  

SUMMARY OF THE FIFTH INTERIM FEE APPLICATION 
OF BUTZEL LONG FOR SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE 

COMPENSATION PERIOD OCTOBER 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 
 

Shareholders  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional:  

 
 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted1 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate2 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Regina M. Alter  
(New York) 

LIT - 1997 $440.00 0.8 $352.00 

Eric Fisher  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1996 $525.00 - $575.00 297.6 $161,530.00 

Cynthia J. Haffey 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1997 $390.00 0.5 $195.00 

Claudia Rast 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1987 $400.00 20.2 $8,080.00 

Barry N. Seidel  
(New York) 

BK - 1978 $725.00 - $750.00 129.4 $94,727.50 
 

Robert Sidorsky  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $625.00 29.7 $18,562.50 

Total   478.2 $283,447.00 
 
 

Associates 
 
Name and Location  
of Professional: 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

Total 
Hours 
Billed 

Total 
Compensation 

Maria Caceres-
Boneau (New York) 

LIT - 2008 $325.00 - $335.00 186.6 $61,859.00 
 

Katie L. Cooperman 
(New York) 

BK, CORP - 2006 $395.00 - $425.00 764.4 $315,711.00 

David J. DeVine 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2006 $285.00 - $300.00 38.4 $11,488.50 
 

Jennifer A. Dukarski 
(Michigan) 

IP, LIT - 2010 $225.00 1.5 $337.50 

Donald Orlandoni 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2007 $240.00 - $275.00 64.2 $17,525.50 

Laura Tedesco 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 2009 $235.00 6.4 $1,504.00 

Total   1,061.5 $408,425.50 
 

                                            
1  BK – Bankruptcy, CORP – Corporate, IP – Intellectual Property, LIT – Litigation. 
 
2  As of the period beginning January 1, 2011, BL has billed all professionals and paraprofessionals 
at their standard 2011 rates. 



  

 
 

Paraprofessionals 
 
Name and Location 
of Paraprofessional: 

 
 
 

Department 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 
 
Total Compensation 

Frederick Capria  
(New York) 

LIT $245.00 - $270.00 37.7 $9,666.50 
 

Michelle Martinez  
(New York) 

LIT $150.00 1.1 $165.00 

Alexis Richards 
(Michigan) 

LIT $165.00 1.7 $280.50 

Stephanie Shattuck 
(Michigan) 

LIT $180.00 39.6 $7,128.00 

Total   80.1 $17,240.00 
 
 

 
 

Professionals 

 
 

Blended Rate 

 
 

Total Hours Billed 

 
 

Total Compensation 
Shareholders  $592.74 478.2 $283,447.00 
Associates $384.76 1,061.5 $408,425.50 
Paraprofessionals $215.23 80.1 $17,240.00 
Total Fees Incurred  1,619.8 $709,112.50 
Blended Attorney Rate $449.36   
    
Total Fees Incurred 
Less Adjustment3 
Total Fees Requested 

  
 

1,619.8 

$709,112.50 
($5,745.00) 

$703,367.504 
 

 
 
 
 

                                            
3  BL has only requested 50% of fees incurred in connection with its preparation of monthly fee 
statements. 
 
4  This amount excludes more than $24,000 of fees incurred by BL during April 2011 in connection 
with the preparation of this Application.  BL has not and will not seek compensation for such fees, but 
requests that the Fee Examiner consider this concession in the event that it suggests the disallowance of 
any compensation requested herein. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT C 



  

SUMMARY OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY EXPENSES 
INCURRED BY BUTZEL LONG FOR THE FIFTH INTERIM  
PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 20111 

 
EXPENSES AMOUNT 
Copies $3,105.602 

Local Travel  $833.743 

Third Party Service Fees $38,840.284 

Express Delivery $655.99 

Computer Research $15,905.76 

Messengers $87.705 

PACER $31.44 

Meal Expenses (x2) $40.00 

TOTAL $59,500.51 

 

                                            
1  See attached detailed breakdown of all expenses including the date incurred, amount and 
description thereof as well as the individual who incurred such expense and the project code related 
thereto.   
 
2  These charges reflect a fee of $0.10 per copy.   
 
3  On each of the following dates, Katie Cooperman incurred $20.00 on transportation leaving the 
office at night after performing required work on the following matters: Nova Scotia (10/13/10, 10/16/10, 
10/18/10, 12/14/10, 1/6/11, 1/11/11, 1/12/11, 1/19/11, 1/26/11, 1/31/11, 2/1/11, 2/2/11, 2/4/11, 2/7/11, 
2/8/11, 2/9/11, 2/15/11, 2/16/11, 2/17/11, 2/18/11, 2/21/11, 2/24/11, 3/8/11, 3/9/11, 3/10/11, 3/23/11); 
JPMorgan (12/1/10, 12/7/10, 12/9/10); Fee Application (11/15/10).  On December 2, 2010, Katie 
Cooperman incurred $30.96 on transportation leaving the office at night after performing required work 
on the JPMorgan matter. On December 3, 2010, Katie Cooperman incurred $30.96 on transportation to 
the Bankruptcy Court transporting documents for the JPMorgan matter.  On each of the following dates, 
Katie Cooperman incurred $4.50 on subway fare to and from the Bankruptcy Court for the following 
matters: Fee Hearing (10/26/10); Disclosure Statement Hearing (10/28/10); Nova Scotia (12/15/2010).  
On December 15, 2010 Katie Cooperman incurred $11.60 on transportation to the office transporting 
documents for the Nova Scotia matter.  On each of the following dates, Eric Fisher incurred expenses on 
transportation leaving the office at night after performing required work on the following matters: Nova 
Scotia (10/13/10-$39.66; 11/15/10- $31.00; 1/21/11-$50.00); JPMorgan (12/3/10-$26.06). 
 
4  These charges reflect disbursements made as follows:  $190.70 and $172.70 to Veritext New 
York Reporting Co. in connection with ordering transcripts, $1,061.25 to Work Product, Inc. in 
connection with binder preparation for the JPMorgan summary judgment hearing, and $8,614.64 and 
$28,800.99 to Xact Data Discovery in connection with the Relativity database hosting and sorting 
discovery for the Nova Scotia matter. 
 
5  These charges reflect six disbursements made by BL, five in the amount of $13.75 and one in the 
amount of $18.95, to Avant Business Services in connection with the hand delivery of documents to the 
Bankruptcy Court. 



October 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011
Disbursements Detail

Project Code Date Description Amount

0001 11/1/10-11/30/10 Copies $49.20
0001 10/28/2010 Travel Expenses-subway to and from court re: DS hearing (Katie Cooperman) $4.50
0001 11/19/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $41.92

Total: $95.62
0002 10/1/10-10/31/10 Copies $1.40

Total: $1.40
0005 10/1/10-10/31/10 Copies $110.10
0005 11/1/10-11/30/10 Copies $68.60
0005 12/1/10-12/31/10 Copies $33.30
0005 1/1/11-1/31/11 Copies $62.50
0005 2/1/11-2/28/11 Copies $103.90
0005 3/1/11-3/31/11 Copies $62.40
0005 9/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.64
0005 9/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $18.01
0005 9/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $17.27
0005 9/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.64
0005 9/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.64
0005 10/26/2010 Travel Expenses-subway to and from court re: fee hearing (Katie Cooperman) $4.50
0005 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $18.14
0005 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $17.39
0005 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.73
0005 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.73
0005 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.73
0005 11/15/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $12.25
0005 11/15/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $12.25
0005 11/15/2010 Travel Expenses-draft fee application (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0005 11/19/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $11.86
0005 11/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $17.45
0005 11/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.78
0005 11/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.78
0005 11/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $13.78
0005 11/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $18.20
0005 1/28/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.03
0005 1/28/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $16.16
0005 1/28/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.03
0005 1/28/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.03
0005 1/28/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $15.15
0005 2/25/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.10
0005 2/25/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $22.00
0005 2/25/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $16.27
0005 2/25/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.10
0005 2/25/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.10
0005 3/2/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.38
0005 3/3/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $16.34
0005 3/11/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $15.35



October 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011
Disbursements Detail

0005 3/11/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.18
0005 3/11/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.18
0005 3/11/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $16.38
0005 3/11/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $12.18
0005 3/14/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $14.35

Total: $979.88
0006 10/1/10-10/31/10 Copies $11.60
0006 11/1/10-11/30/10 Copies $1.20
0006 12/1/10-12/31/10 Copies $65.40
0006 1/1/11-1/31/11 Copies $8.00
0006 8/26/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant Business Services $18.95
0006 10/5/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $114.72
0006 10/28/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Eric Fisher) $8.41
0006 11/19/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $3.40
0006 11/19/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $32.67
0006 11/22/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $49.09
0006 11/22/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $107.37
0006 11/30/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $58.66
0006 12/1/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $362.14
0006 12/1/2010 Third-Party Vendor-Document Copy Charge $1,061.25
0006 12/1/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for oral argument (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0006 12/2/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $23.41
0006 12/3/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for oral argument (Eric Fisher) $26.06
0006 12/3/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $33.20
0006 12/3/2010 Travel Expenses-transport documents to Court-oral argument (Katie Cooperman) $30.96
0006 12/7/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $822.90
0006 12/7/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $127.38
0006 12/7/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for oral argument (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0006 12/9/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for oral argument (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0006 12/9/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $201.97
0006 12/10/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $1,079.76
0006 12/13/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $22.05
0006 12/15/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $49.80
0006 12/16/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $40.69
0006 12/17/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant Business Services $13.75
0006 12/2/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for oral argument (Katie Cooperman) $30.96
0006 1/19/2011 PACER $20.32

Total: $4,486.07
0007 10/1/10-10/31/10 Copies $101.00
0007 11/1/10-11/30/10 Copies $352.80
0007 12/1/10-12/31/10 Copies $644.80
0007 1/1/11-1/31/11 Copies $619.40
0007 2/1/11-2/28/11 Copies $546.60
0007 3/1/11-3/31/11 Copies $249.60
0007 10/13/2010 Travel Expenses-work on Nova Scotia Matter (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 10/15/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $306.69



October 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011
Disbursements Detail

0007 10/15/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $76.21
0007 10/19/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $224.29
0007 10/13/2010 Travel Expenses-draft memorandum to Committee (Eric Fisher) $39.66
0007 10/21/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant Business Services $13.75
0007 10/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $11.80
0007 11/12/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant Business Services $13.75
0007 11/15/2010 Travel Expenses-revise objection (Eric Fisher) $31.00
0007 11/16/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $262.12
0007 11/16/2010 Travel Expenses-draft objection (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 11/18/2010 Travel Expenses-draft objection (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 11/21/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $234.77
0007 11/22/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $107.25
0007 11/23/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $218.56
0007 11/26/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $121.80
0007 11/27/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $50.90
0007 11/28/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $63.29
0007 11/29/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $59.89
0007 12/2/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $207.95
0007 12/3/2010 Transcripts-oral argument transcript $190.70
0007 12/9/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $31.03
0007 12/9/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $92.55
0007 12/9/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $76.21
0007 12/9/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $890.47
0007 12/14/2010 Travel Expenses-prepare for status conference (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 12/14/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $1,760.00
0007 12/15/2010 Transcripts-status conference transcript $172.70
0007 12/15/2010 Travel Expenses-transport documents to office (Katie Cooperman) $11.60
0007 12/15/2010 Travel Expenses-subway to/from Court re:  status conference (Katie Cooperman) $4.50
0007 12/15/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $223.33
0007 12/17/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant business Services $13.75
0007 12/23/2010 Messenger Fees-Avant business Services $13.75
0007 12/30/2010 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $10.62
0007 1/6/2011 Travel Expenses-draft document requests (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/11/2011 Travel Expenses-work on e-discovery issues (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/12/2011 Travel Expenses-prepare for 1/14/11 meeting (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/12/2011 Travel Expenses-review e-discovery (Eric Fisher) $50.00
0007 1/13/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $367.59
0007 1/13/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $117.91
0007 1/17/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $125.53
0007 1/18/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Emily Daniels) $18.75
0007 1/18/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $544.23
0007 1/19/2011 PACER $2.72
0007 1/19/2011 Travel Expenses-revise discovery letter (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/19/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $104.27
0007 1/19/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $304.87
0007 1/20/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $404.92



October 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011
Disbursements Detail

0007 1/20/2011 PACER $6.72
0007 1/21/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $219.93
0007 1/24/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $164.54
0007 1/25/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Fritz Capria) $10.58
0007 1/25/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $423.83
0007 1/25/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $139.08
0007 1/26/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $123.03
0007 1/26/2011 Travel Expenses-draft 3018 objection (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/27/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.78
0007 1/28/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $18.64
0007 1/31/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery letter (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 1/31/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $249.73
0007 2/1/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $201.43
0007 2/1/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $283.49
0007 2/1/2011 Travel Expenses-review discovery (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/2/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $99.07
0007 2/2/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $135.88
0007 2/2/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $81.66
0007 2/2/2011 Travel Expenses-research (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/3/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $252.86
0007 2/3/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $46.82
0007 2/4/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery requests (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/7/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $16.60
0007 2/7/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery requests (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/8/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery requests (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/9/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery requests (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/10/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $129.96
0007 2/11/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $63.28
0007 2/13/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $106.83
0007 2/14/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $41.92
0007 2/15/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/16/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.85
0007 2/16/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.85
0007 2/16/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/16/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $28,800.99
0007 2/17/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Maria Caceres-Boneau) $41.92
0007 2/17/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/18/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $2,976.66
0007 2/18/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/21/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/23/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $600.00
0007 2/24/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $475.00
0007 2/24/2011 Travel Expenses-document review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 2/28/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $3,907.50
0007 2/28/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $257.55
0007 3/1/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Eric Fisher) $7.38



October 1, 2010 through March 31, 2011
Disbursements Detail

0007 3/1/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Eric Fisher) $9.67
0007 3/8/2011 Travel Expenses-revise plan (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/8/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $86.15
0007 3/9/2011 Meal Expenses-discovery review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/9/2011 Travel Expenses-discovery review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/9/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $42.87
0007 3/10/2011 Meal Expenses-discovery review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/10/2011 Travel Expenses-discovery review (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/14/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.93
0007 3/14/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.93
0007 3/17/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Fritz Capria) $40.56
0007 3/19/2011 Third-Party Vendor-Xact Data Discovery $397.93
0007 3/21/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.93
0007 3/21/2011 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Katie Cooperman) $7.93
0007 3/23/2011 Travel Expenses-draft discovery letter (Katie Cooperman) $20.00
0007 3/23/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (D. Orlandoni) $223.37
0007 3/24/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (D. Orlandoni) $129.20
0007 3/24/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (M. Boneau) $56.62
0007 3/25/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (D. DeVine) $264.82
0007 3/29/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (D. DeVine) $1,782.14
0007 3/29/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $16.60
0007 3/30/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (Katie Cooperman) $156.56
0007 3/30/2011 Computer Research-Westlaw (D. DeVine) $78.66

Total: $53,873.11
0008 10/1/10-10/31/10 Copies $5.80
0008 11/1/10-11/30/10 Copies $5.20
0008 1/19/2011 PACER $1.68

Total: $12.68
0010 12/1/10-12/31/10 Copies $2.80
0010 12/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $9.91
0010 12/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $14.40
0010 12/29/2010 Express Delivery Charges-Federal Express (Barry Seidel) $24.64

Total: $51.75

Grand Total: $59,500.51



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT D 



  

SUMMARY OF SERVICES BY PROJECT CODE FOR  
SERVICES RENDERED BY BUTZEL LONG FOR FIFTH  

INTERIM PERIOD OF OCTOBER 1, 2010 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 

PROJECT CODE PROJECT DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT 
(FEES + EXPENSES) 

0001 General Advice 8.3 $4,623.62 

0002 Retention of Butzel Long 14.2 $6,050.40 

0005 Butzel Long Fee Applications 

and Monthly Budgets 

66.3 $26,626.88 

0006 JPMorgan Avoidance Complaint 180.2 $93,267.57 

0007 General Motors Nova Scotia 

Finance Company 

1,306.0 $619,229.11 

0008 Defending Fee Applications 16.6 $7,273.68 

0010 Monthly Fee Statements 

Less 50% Adjustment 

28.2 $11,541.75 

($5,745.00) 

TOTAL  1,619.8 $762,868.01 

 
 

  
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT E 



  

 
SUMMARY OF THE FINAL FEE APPLICATION 

OF BUTZEL LONG FOR SERVICES RENDERED FOR THE 
COMPENSATION PERIOD JUNE 10, 2009 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 

 
Shareholders  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department(s) and 
Year Admitted 1 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 2 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Regina M. Alter  
(New York) 

LIT $440.00 0.8 $352.00 

Richard Brosnick 
(New York) 

LIT - 1997 $490.00 8.5 $4,165.00 

Ross Ellick  
(New York) 

LIT - 1989 $495.00 - $525.00 49.6 $25,977.00 

Eric Fisher  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1996 $525.00 - $575.00 999.4 $529,975.00 
 

Jane Greyf  
(New York) 

CORP - 1999 $590.00 2.1 $1,239.00 

Cynthia J. Haffey 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1997 $390.00 0.5 $195.00 

Christopher Nelson 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1995 $350.00 18.9 $6,615.00 

Samuel M. Ofsevit 
(New York) 

RE - 1981 $475.00 0.2 $95.00 

Thomas B. Radom 
(Michigan) 

BK - 1974 $475.00 3.1 $1,472.50 

Claudia Rast 
(Michigan) 

LIT - 1987 $400.00 20.2 $8,080.00 

Barry N. Seidel  
(New York) 

BK - 1978 $725.00 - $750.00 442.8 $321,942.50 
 

Robert Sidorsky  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $625.00 48.3 $30,187.50 

E. Dale Wilson 
(Michigan) 

CORP, RE - 1999 $285.00 - $335.00 8.2 $2,417.00 
 

Total    1602.6 $932,712.50 
 

                                            
1  BK – Bankruptcy, CORP – Corporate, IP – Intellectual Property, LIT – Litigation, RE – Real 
Estate. 
 
2  As of the periods beginning January 1, 2010 and January 1, 2011, Butzel Long has billed all 
professionals and paraprofessionals at their standard 2010 and 2011 rates, as applicable.  



  

 
Counsel  
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Robert Sidorsky3  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1983 $535.00 
 

5.0 
 

$2,675.00 
 

Total    5.0 $2,675.00 
 
 

Senior Attorney 
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

William J. Kohler 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 1986 $410.00 7.9 $3,239.00 

Total    7.9 $3,239.00 
 
 

Associates 
 
Name and Location 
of Professional: 

 
 

Department and 
Year Admitted 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

 
Total  
Hours  
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Maria Caceres-
Boneau (New York) 

LIT - 2008 $325.00 - $335.00 331.0 $108,789.00 
 

Katie L. Cooperman 
(New York) 

BK, CORP - 2006 $350.00 - $425.00 2209.4 $878,124.00 

David J. DeVine 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2006 $285.00 - $300.00 38.4 $11,488.50 
 

Jennifer A. Dukarski 
(Michigan) 

IP, LIT - 2010 $225.00 1.5 $337.50 

Orlee Goldfeld  
(New York) 

BK, LIT - 1999 $360.00 - $435.00 37.7 
 

$13,601.50 
 

Omer Granit  
(New York) 

CORP - 2008 $325.00 32.5 $10,562.50 

Donald Orlandoni 
(Michigan) 

BK, LIT - 2007 $240.00 - $275.00 64.2 $17,525.50 

Laura Tedesco 
(Michigan) 

CORP - 2009 $215.00 - $235.00 18.3 $4,062.50 
 

Total    2733.0 $1,044,491.00 
 

 
 
 
 

                                            
3  On or about January 27, 2010, Mr. Sidorsky became a shareholder.  Prior to this date, he was 
employed as counsel. 



  

Paraprofessionals 
 
Name and Location 
of Paraprofessional: 

 
 
 

Department 

 
 

Hourly 
Billing Rate 

 
Total 
Hours 
Billed 

 
 

Total 
Compensation 

Frederick Capria  
(New York) 

LIT $235.00 - $270.00 326.5 $79,679.50 

Vanessa Lozzi  
(Michigan) 

LIT $175.00 2.0 $350.00 

Deanna Mejia  
(Michigan) 

LIT $140.00 6.2 $868.00 

Michelle Martinez  
(New York) 

LIT $150.00 3.7 $555.00 

Michelle Ann Pleban 
(Michigan) 

LIT $155.00 - $165.00 9.7 $1,548.50 

Tonia Borg Renko 
(Michigan) 

LIT $165.00 1.2 $198.00 

Alexis Richards 
(Michigan) 

LIT $150.00 - $165.00 2.1 $340.50 

Kimberly Schoening 
(Michigan) 

LIT $135.00 - $140.00 25.1 $3,438.00 
 

Stephanie Shattuck 
(Michigan) 

LIT $180.00 39.6 $7,128.00 

Total    416.1 $94,105.50 
 
 

Summer Associates 
 
Name and Location of Professional: 

 
 
Department 4 

 
Hourly 

Billing Rate 

Total 
Hours  
Billed 

 
Total 

Compensation 
Andre Garron  
(New York) 

SA* $175.00 5.3 $927.50 

Max Heuer  
(New York) 

SA* $175.00 1.0 $175.00 

Total    6.3 $1,102.50 

                                            
4  SA – Summer Associate, * Not yet admitted to the bar. 



  

 
 

Professionals 
 
Blended Rate 

 
Total Hours Billed 

 
Total Compensation 

Shareholders  $582.00 1602.6 $932,712.50 
Counsel $535.00 5.0 $2,675.00 
Senior Attorney $410.00 7.9 $3,239.00 
Associates $382.18 2733.0 $1,044,491.00 
Paraprofessionals $226.16 416.1 $94,105.50 
Summer Associates $175.00 6.3 $1,102.50 
Total Fees Incurred  4,770.9 $2,078,325.50 
Blended Attorney Rate $456.05   
    
Total Fees Incurred 
Less 50% Adjustment5 
Less Further Adjustments6 
Total Fees Requested 

  
 
 

4,770.9 

$2,078,325.50 
 ($14,619.75) 
($17,096.69) 

$2,046,609.06 
 
 
 

  
 

                                            
5  BL has only requested 50% of fees incurred in connection with its preparation of monthly fee 
statements. 
 
6  Reduction comprised of (i) $1,102.50 for fees incurred by BL summer associates, (ii) $2,811.44 
for vague time entries, (iii) $4,102.50 for multiple attendees at various hearings, (iv) $303.00 for a billing 
rate error, (v) $144.00 for clerical and administrative tasks, (vi) $5,058.00 for the fee review process, and 
(vii) $3,575.25 for compensation matters unrelated to fee applications. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT F 



  

SUMMARY OF ACTUAL AND NECESSARY  
EXPENSES INCURRED BY BUTZEL LONG FOR  

JUNE 10, 2009 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 

EXPENSES AMOUNT 
Copies 10,411.80 

Local Travel  $1,724.37 

Third Party Service Fees $50,951.03 

Subpoena Service $76.80 

Deposition Lunch $307.66 

Document Productions $2,053.10 

EPIQ $28,192.11 

Express Delivery $2,196.28 

Computer Research $47,205.64 

Messengers $155.20 

Lien Search $109.00 

Out of Town Meals $294.15 

Out of Town Travel and Lodging $1,950.93 

Overtime $112.31 

PACER $365.60 

Postage $17.49 

Local Meal Expenses $270.53 

TOTAL 

LESS ADJUSTMENT1 

TOTAL REQUESTED 

$146,394.00 

($1,636.83) 

$144,757.17 

 

 

                                            
1  Reduction comprised of (i) $222.00 for travel, (ii) $1,285.60 for copy charges at $0.18 per page 
and (iii) $129.23 for meals. 
 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT G 



  

SUMMARY OF SERVICES BY PROJECT CODE FOR  
SERVICES RENDERED BY BUTZEL LONG FOR  

JUNE 10, 2009 THROUGH MARCH 31, 2011 
 

PROJECT CODE PROJECT DESCRIPTION HOURS AMOUNT 
(FEES + EXPENSES) 

0001 General Advice 46.7 $27,370.47 

0002 Retention of Butzel Long 121.3 $72,091.93 

0003 Supplier Issues 53.0 $35,300.64 

0004 Conflict Issues 2.3 $1,554.14 

0005 Butzel Long Fee Applications 

and Monthly Budgets 

326.1 $120,310.45 

0006 JPMorgan Avoidance Complaint 1,920.0 $883,106.22 

0007 General Motors Nova Scotia 

Finance Company 

2,140.0 $1,018,958.32 

0008 Defending Fee Applications 83.8 $37,401.44 

0010 Monthly Fee Statements 

Less 50% Adjustment 

77.7 $29,291.25 

($14,619.75) 

TOTAL 
 
LESS FURTHER 
ADJUSTMENTS1 
 
TOTAL 
REQUESTED  

 

 

 

 

4,770.9 

$2,210,765.11 

 ($19,398.88) 

          

$2,191,366.23 

 
 
  
 

                                            
1 Reduction comprised of (i) $1,102.50 for fees incurred by BL summer associates, (ii) $2,811.44 
for vague time entries, (iii) $4,102.50 for multiple attendees at various hearings, (iv) $303.00 for a billing 
rate error, (v) $144.00 for clerical and administrative tasks, (vi) $5,058.00 for the fee review process, (vii) 
$3,575.25 for compensation matters unrelated to fee applications, (viii) $222.00 for travel, (ix) $1,285.60 
for copy charges at $0.18 per page, (x) $129.23 for meals and (xi) $665.36 for a credit applied by BL 
relating to copies. 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

EXHIBIT H 

 

 

 

 

 

 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR~EYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profQssionaf corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

... Account NumberOOet4i2i-6---eee-1--- . 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31. 2010 
RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

Shareholder 
Eric Rsher 0.50 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 0.40 hours at 
-Total For Shareholder 0.90 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 0.30 hours at 
Totdl For Associate 0.30 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Currentlnvoice: 
TolerBalance Due: 

Tax lD. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffe:son 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzd.com 

November 16. 2010 

Invoice No. 8484844 

Total 

$525.00 $262.50 
$725.00 $290.00 

$552.50 

$395.00 $118.50 
$118.50 

671..00 
4.50 

675.50 
$675.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

C1 professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

-----Ac£-ountNumber~·0e&l4+2t6-0001 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 

Date 

10/08/10 

10/12/10 

10/20/10 

RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

Tkpr 

BNS 

EF 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Review committee objection re: DS as it relates 
to JPM and Novia Scotia_ 

Review filing by the Junsos concerning motion 
for leave to late file a proof of claim_ 

Correspondence from L Macksoud (KlNF) re: 
Committee call materials (0.1); correspondence 
from J. Sharret (KLNF) re: GUC trust agreement 
comments (0.2). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxlD.No: 

Suite laO 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 2.25 7000 F:313 225 7080 
www.butzeLc:om 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484844 

0040 

0_50 

0_30 

671.00 . 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSEl.ORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. -?;ccoonrNDmber(j0(jlztt2t6{)OO2 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: RETENTION OF BUTZEl LVNI", 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 2.60 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 2.60 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 8.20 hours at 
Total For Associate 8.20 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Caprio 0.20 hours at 
Tolal For Paralegal II 0.20 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax tD. No;; 

Suile 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, MiCl1igan 4&226 

T, 313 225 7000 F: 3132251080 
www.butzcl.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484845 

$525.00 $1,365.00 
$1,365.00 

$395.00· $3,239.00 
$3,239.00 

$245.00 $49.00 
$49.00 

4,653.00 
1.40 

4,654.40 
$4,654.40 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation. 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number:000t-412t6~0002 

(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31. 2010 

RE: RETENTION OF BUTZEL LONG 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

10/21/10 FJC Research re Butzel Retentiofl Application (.1); 
forward images of same to S. Utviflko for prifltOUt 
per K. Cooperman instructioflS (.1). 

10/22/10 E.F. Teleconference with Canadian counsel 
regarding retentiofl process (0.5); conference 
with Cooperman fegarding same(0.3): review 
research requirements for Canadian counsel 
retention (.6); review and revise draft retefltion 

. application for Cafladian counsel (.8). 

10/22/10 KLC Telephone cal! with Canadian counsel re: 
retention process (0.5): office conference re: 
same with Fisher (0.3): research requirements for 
Canadian couflsel retention (1.2); retrieve 
samples re: same (0.5); draft retention 
application for Canadian counsel (2.7). 

10/28/10 E.F. Review retention application regarding 
Canadian counsel. 

10/28/10 KlC Revise retention application re: Canadian 
counsel. 

10/29/10 KLC . Draft declaration re: Canadian counsel 
retentiofl. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

. Tax to.No 

Sune toO iSOWestJeffefSoll 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T,3132257000 F,3132257080 
www.butzeLcom 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484845 

0.20 

2.20 

5.20 

OAO 

1.90 

1.10 

4.653.00 

,. 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS. 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0005 
(Privileged and Confldenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted Ihrough October 3i, 2010 

Tax I.D. NQ :-

Suite 100 lSO WestJefferso(1 
Detroit. MichigalJ 48226 

T~3132257000 F:313225708B 
\'\o'Ww.butzcl.com 

November 16, 2010 

. ..Invoice No. 8484846 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 3.30 hours at $725.00 $2,392.50 
Total For Shareholder 3.30 $2,392.50 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 12.50 hours at $395.00 $4,937.50 
Total For A~sociate 12.50 $4,937.50 

POrdikigal II 
Frederick Caprio 9.70 hours at $245.00 $2,376.50 
Total For Paralegal II 9.70 $2,376.50 

Description Tolal 
Copies $110.10 
Express Delivery Charges $76.20 
Travel Expenses . 

$4.50 
Total Disbursements $190.80 

Current Fees: 9,706.50 
Current Disbursements: 190.80 
Totdl Current Invoice: 9,897.30 
Total Balance Due: $9,897.30 



BU • 7 C"1 ILL L LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNS51..0RS 

a professionol corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformafion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posfed through October 31,2010 

Tax I.D.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffc~n 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T; 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 70&0 
.www.butzel.com 

November 16, 2010 

.. Jnvoice No. 8484846 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 
Date 

10/06110 

10/06/10 

10/07110 

10/12/10 

10/14/10 

10/14/10 

.10/l5/10 

10/18/10 

10/l8/l0 

Tkpr 

KLC 

FJC 

KLC 

KLC 

BNS 

KLC 

KLC 

KLC 

FJC 

. Narrative Description 

Office conference with Caprio re: fourth fee 
application. 

Office conference with K. Cooperman re 
preparation for upcoming fee application [.4): 
compose detailed e-mail and transmit same to 
accounting re files needed for fee application 
submissions [.3). 

0.40 

0.70 

Draft Fourth Interim Fee Application. 0.30 

Draft fourth interim fee application. . 0.40 

Review K. Cooperman letter regarding 0.30 
November budget. 

Draft November budget; correspondence with 0.30 
Seidel re: same. . 

Correspondence to C. Andres [GK) re: 0.10 
November budget. 

Draft Fourth Interim Fee Application (1.8); . 1.90 
correspondence with Capria re: same (0.1). 

E-mails to K. Cooperman and accounting 0.10 
department re materials needed for fee 
application. 

10/20/10 KLC Revise fourth interim fee application re: 
expenses. 

0.30 

10/20/10 F JC Begin set up of files to be used for submission of 
fee application to Bankruptcy Trustee and Fee 

0.50 



BllTZ e 
U I L 

I LONG L TaxlD. No 
ATl'ORNEYS AND COUNSEl.ORS 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
a prof~$.sionof corporation Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 3132257{)OO Fd,1322S 7080 
www.butzcl.rom 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF November 16, 2010 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. - --. .._. .. -_. Invoice No. 8484846 [ . 
Account Number 000141216-0005 

I (Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31,2010 

RE: BUTZEl lONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Dale Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

Examiner. 

10/22/10 FJC Begin review and editing of ASCII text files of 1.60 
invoices for submission to Trustee and Fee 
Examiner in connection with upcoming fee 
application. 

10/25/10 KLC Revise Fourth Interim Fee Application. 3.20 

10/26/10 BNS AJtendcourt regarding BL fee application (9:15- 3.00 
12:30). 

10/26/10 KLC Attend hearing on third interim fee applicatio'n.·· 3.00 

10/26/10 KLC Revise fourth interim fee application (1.2); 1.30 
correspondence to accounting re: same (0.1). 

10/26/10 FJC Continue review and revision of ASCII files of 0.30 
invoices for submission to Bankruptcy Trustee and 
Fee Examiner (.2); telephone call fo K. 
Cooperman re status of same (.1). 

10/27/10 KLC Correspondence with Caprio re: fourth interim 0.50 
fee application; revise same. 

1O/27/l0 FJC Telephone conference with K. Cooperman re 3.40 
status of review of ASCII versions of invoices to be 
submitted to Trustee and Fee Examiner (.1); 
continue review and editing of ASCII files (3.2); e-
mails with Cooperman re same (.1). 

10/28/10 KLC Revise fourth interim fee application (0.2); office 0]0 
conference with Caprio re: same (0.5). 

10/28/10 FJC Upload corrected ASCII invoice files onto Butzei 1.70 
document management system for additional 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

o professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMllTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216-000S 
(Privileged and Conlidentiallnformation) 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: BUTZEllONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Tax [.D. No' 

Suite 100 150WestJefferwn 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F;3l32251080 
www.butzel.(:om 

November 16, 2010 

Il')voice N(). 8484(l46 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

editing (.2); e-mails with K. Cooperman re same 
(.1); office conference with Cooperman re status 
of fee application and additional assignments 
(.5); additional review and editing of additional 
ASCII files of invoices (.9). 

10/29/10 F JC Finalize edits on ASCII files of invoices (l.l); e-mail lAO 
to K. Cooperman re same (.1); begin 
preparation of invoices' Acrobat (,pdf) image for 
submission to Trustee and Fee Examiner (.2) . 

. 10/31/10. KLC Correspondence to Seidel re: fourth fee 
application. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

0.10 

9,706.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number ElEl0141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through Oelober 31, 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Shareholder 
Eric Rsher 16.10 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 15.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 31.30 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 14.70 hours at 
Total For Associate 14.70 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax J.D. No 

Suite 100 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T:313225700(} F:3132257080 
www.bul2'.eLeom 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484847 

$525.00 $8,452.50 
$725.00 $11,020.00 

$19,472.50 

$395.00 $5,806.50 
$5,806.50 

25,279.QO 
145.27 

25,424.27 
$25,424.27 

I 
I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEY'S AND COUNSELORS 

a profes#oncl corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Aceount Number: 000 141216-0006 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnfonnation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 

Date 

10/01 /10 

10/01/10 

RE: jp MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Review revised text of Committee motion to 
. quiellitle (.2); discuss with K. Cooperman (.2) 
and L. Macksoud (.1); final review (.I). 

Correspondence to and from L. Macksoud 
(KLNF) re: revised language for DIP motion; 
telephone call with Macksoud and Seidel re: 
same. 

Taxl.D.No 

Suite 100 150- Wes()efferson 
Delro.it, Michigan 4S226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.~om 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484847 

Hours 

0.70 

0.50 

10/05/10 E.F. Review case conceming UCC termination 0.20 
statement. 

10/05/10 BNS Review and consider Judge Cote discussion in 1.10 
Roswell. 

10/05/10 KLC Correspondence trom L. Macksoud (KLNF) re: 0.80 
relevant case and analysis (0.1); review same 
case (0.4); review same analysis (0.2); 
correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(O.l) . 

10/06/10· BNS Review plan and DS to ensure that litigation 
causes of action are properly preserved for 
benefit of creditors (3.4); conference with K. 
Cooperman regarding same (.5). 

3.90 

10/06/10 KlC Conference with Seidel re: litigation preservation. 0.50 

10/0811 0 E.F. Review commentary conceming Roswell case. 0.30 

10/08/10 BNS Review and consider commentary concerning 0.50 
Roswell decision [DJCote). 

10/14/10 E.F. Review and analyze Treasury's OPPOSition 10 0.90 



RUT7EL LONe; 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

........ A=ount Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31,2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

motion to enforce DIP order (.8); e-mails to 
Cooperman and Seidel regarding same (.1). 

10/14/10 KLC Correspondence from L. Macksoud (KLNF) re: 

10/15/10 BNS 

10/17/l0 KLC 

10/18/10 E.F. 

10/18/10 KLC 

10/19/10 E.F. 

10/19/10 BNS 

10/19/10 KLC 

. Treasury objection to Committee motion to 
enforce DIP (0.1); review Treasury's objection to 
same motion (0.7); correspondence with Fisher 
re: same (0.1). 

Review U.S. Treasury opposition to Committee 
motion regarding ownership of JPM litigation (.9). 

Correspondences to Fisher re: post-judgment 
interest rate (0.3); research applicable rate re: 
JPMorgan judgment (0.9); correspondence to 
and from J. Sharret (KLNF)re: same (0.1). 

Review motion to enforce DIP loan (.9); legal 
research regarding interest rate and e-mails with 
Sharrett and Mayer (KLNF) regarding same (.3); 
e-mailswith Cooperman regarding same (.2). 

Correspondences with KLNF and Fisher re: 
motion to enforce DIP and interest rate. 

Analyze reply and joinder with respect to motion 
to enforce DIP order. 

Review committee reply re: motion to enforce 
DIP Order (.7) and discuss exchange of e-mails 
between Kramer Levin and E. Fisher regarding 
committee interest in JPM litigation (4). 

Telephone call from M. Krdewski (KDW) re: 
November 1 hearing; correspondence to Fisher 

Tax iD.No 

Suite um 150 West jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313225 7000 F: 313225 7080 
www.butzel.eom 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484847 

1.00 

0.90 

1.30 

lAO 

0.30 

0.30 

UO 

0.20 

r" 



BUTZE L LONG Tax lD. No: 
ATToRNEYS AND COUNSELOR.S 

Suite 100 150WestJeffe[S{ln 
o professional corporation Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225'7080 
www.butze1.COnt 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF November 16,2010 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8484847 i'~-
; 

. Account NUnloor 0001412+6"0006 
(Privileged and Confldentiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

re: same. 

10/20/10 E.F. Review pleadings in connection with motion to 0.80 
enforce DIP order with respect to term loan 
proceeds. 

10/21/10 E.F. Attend disclosure statement hearing and 5.00 
argument with respect to enforcement of DIP as 
to Term Loan. 

10/21/10 BNS Attend court hearing to support Kramer Levin 6.00 
motion regarding ownership of litigation {5.); 
discussion with T. Mayer (KLNF) regarding same 
(.5); conference with J. Smolinsky regarding plan 

. provisions (.5). 

10/21/1 0 KlC Attend hearing on motion to enforce DIP, 5.00 

10/22/10 BNS Telephone conference with Jeremy Freeman 0.30 
{Van Eck) regarding court decision on 
committee motion regarding ownership of 
lawsuit. 

10/25/10 EF. Prepare outline for oral argument concerning 2.10 
term loan summary judgment motion. 

10/26/10 E.F. Prepare outline for oral argument (1.9); 2.90 
teleconference and e-mail with Callagy (KDW) 
regarding oral argument (.2); review and revise 
DS language regarding Term Loan (A); 
teleconference with FTI regarding Term Loan 
collateral (A). 

10/26/10 BNS Correspondence with K. Cooperman and E. 0.30 
Fisher regarding implications of delay in summary 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profess/allal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOOl41216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

pROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Tax I.D. No: 

Suite tOO ISO We;stJefferson 
Dctroil~ Michigan 4S226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzeJ.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484847 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

judgment motion to December 3. 

10/26/1 0 KLC Correspondence with J. Sharret (KLNF) re: rider to 1.80 
disclosure statement (0.2); review same (1); 
propose revisions re: same (OA); correspondence 
with Fisher and Seidel re: same (0.1); 
correspondence with Fisher re: oral argument re: 
term loan action (0.1). 

10/27/10 E.F. Call with Committee to provide update about 1.50 
Term Loan litigation (1.0); call with David Jones 
(UST) regarding same (.3); review outline for oral 
argument (.2). 

10/27/10 KLC Revise disclosure statement language re: 1.20 
description of term loan aelion (I); 
correspondence with Fisher re: same (0.1); 
correspondence to J. Sharret re: same (0.1). 

10/27/10 KLC Participate in Committee call re: term loan case 1.00 
update. 

10/28/1 0 E.F. Dratt and finalize letter to Judge Gerber 0.20 
regarding oral argument (.2); 

10/28/10 E.F. Review revised insert concerning Term Loan OAO 
Litigation. 

10/28/1 0 KLC Correspondence to and from J. Sharret (KLNF) re: 0.50 
revised rider to Disclosure statement; review and 
comment on same. 

10/29110 BNS Consider revisions 10 proposed DS language and OAO 
correspondence re: same with K. Cooperman. 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELoRS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31,2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Dale !!sQr. Narrative Description 

10/29/10 KLC Correspondence with J. Sharret (KLNFJ re: 
disclosure statement revisions; review same. 

10/29/10 KLC Correspondence with M. Meises (WGM) re: term 
loan action oral argument. 

10/30/10 E.F. Review e-mails between Cooperman and Weil 
regarding oral argument date. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax LD. No 

SuitedOO 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:31322S7QOO F~31322S708{) 
www.butzel.eom 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484847 

Hours 

DAD 

0.20 

0.10 

25,279.00 



RUTZFL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

A"Ccount Number 000141216-0007" 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: GEINE~:A 

Shareholder 
Eric Rsher 34.40 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 22.30 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 56.70 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 63.10 hours at 
Total For Associate 63.10 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax J,D. No ~ 

Suite tOO 150 WestJcIJernon 
Detroit, Mich.igan48226 

T: 313225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.1)utzel.com 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

$525.00 $18,060DO 
$725.00 $16,167.50 

$34,227.50 

$395.00 $24,924.50 
$24,924.50 

59,152.00 
728.19 

59,880.19 
$59,880.19 



BUTZEL LONG 
-ATTORNEYS AND CQUNSEL..ORS 

o professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

- Account Number: 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

10/04/10 BNS Review BWI case regarding preservation of 
claim. 

10/05/10 BNS Consider Kramer Levin request for update on 
legal budget. 

10/os/io KLC Review disclosure statement re: Nova Scotia 
claims (1.7); telephone call with J. Sharret (KLNF) 
re: same. 

10/06/10 BNS Conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
treatment of NS claims in plan (.7); telephone 
-conference with Cooperman and J. Smolinsky 
(WGM) regarding same (.2); telephone -
conference with Cooperman and J. Sharett 
(KlNF) regarding same (.3); follow-up with T. 
Mayer (KlNF) regarding related claims (.3). 

10/06/10 KLC Review GUC Trust agreement re: Nova Scotia 
treatment (l A); office conference with Seidel re: 
Plan comments (0.7); telephone call with Seidel 
and Smolinsky (WGM) re: same (0.2); telephone 
call with Seidel and Sharret (KLNF) re: same (0.3); 
review disclosure statement re: Nova Scotia 
claims (0.9); prepare summary of Nova Scotia 
action items (0.7). 

10/08/10 E.F. Meet with Cooperman and Seidel to review and 
revise plan and DS provisions pertaining to NS 
claims objections (2.0); review cases concerning 
standing issues (.9). 

Tax J.D. No:-

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 .F: 313 21S 7080 
www.blttuLcom 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 -

Hours 

0.60 

0.30 

1.90 

1.50 

4.20 

2.90 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOItNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporclian 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

"Account Number OD014T2T6~0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31.2010 

Date 

10/08/10 

10/08/10 

10/11/10 

10/11/10 

10/11/10 

10/12/10 

10/12/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVASCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

E.F. 

BNS 

KLC 

E.F. 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Review K. Cooperman memo re: outstanding 
issues (.4): conference with K. Cooperman and E. 
Fisher re: plan and DS issues and objections (2); 
draft riders for plan to address Novia Scotia 
claims (.2). 

Office conference with Seidel and Fisher re: 
Novo Scotia treatment in Disclosure statement 
and Plan (2); revise Disclosure Statement re: 
same (1.l). 

Review and analyze DS issues concerning 
potential NS claims. 

Outline revisions to plan to refl"ct committee 
objection and Nova Scotia claims (.5); 
telephone conference with K.Cooperman 
regarding DS revisions (.3); review K. Cooperman 
draft of DS revisions (.4). 

Correspondence to and from Seidel fe: revisions 
to plan re: Nova Scotia claims (O.2); further revise 
same revisions (l); discuss same with Seidel (0.3); 
correspondence to and from J. Sharret (KlNF) re: 
same (0.2); revise comments to Disclosure 
Statement (1.2). 

Review revisions to Plan and Disclosure 
Statement pertaining to NS claims (.8); e-mails 
with Seidel and Cooperman regarding some (.2). 

Conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
approach to WG&M regarding Plan and DS 

Tax I.D. No: 

Suite 100 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000·F: 313 225 70S(} 
www.butzel.com 

November 16. 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Hours 

2.60 

3.10 

0.90 

1.20 

2.90 

1.00 

0.70 

I 
I 
I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporutioil 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. Accounf Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31,2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

c9mments. 

10/12/10 BNS Further attention to draft DS language regarding 
Nova Scotia claims from Greenberg Traurig. 

10/12/10 KLC Revise insert to Disclosure Statement re: Nova 
Scotia claims (0.6); conference with Seidel re: 
same (0.7); correspondence to and from M. 
Meises (WGM) re: same (0.1); review Noteholders 
proposed language to Disclosure Statement and 
Plan (1.2); correspondence with Fisher and Seidel 
re: same (0.2); revise amended objection re: all 
Nova Scotia claims (304). 

10/13/10 E.F. Call with Wei I Seidel and Cooperman 
conceming plan and DS language pertaining to 
NS claims (.8); meet with Cooperman to discuss 
NS standing issues and results of research 
regarding Commodore/STN and MSPA (.8); 
review and revise memorandum to Committee 
concerning NS standing issues and results of 
research regarding same and regarding 
assumption of lockup agreement (3.3); review DS 
language proposed by Greenberg regarding NS 
claims (.6); discuss same and strategy with Seidel 
and Cooperman (1.1). 

Tax t.D:No 

Suite'WO 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
Www.blltzel.cBrn 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Hours 

0.70 

6.20 

6.60 

10/13/10· BNS Review Nova Scotia noteholders proposed 1.50 
revisions to DS (.4); conference with E. Fisher and 
K. Cooperman to discuss revisions and strategy 
(1.1 ). 

10/13/10 BNS Conference call with Cooperman, Fisher and lAO 

! 
i 
i ,. 

I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND C:OUNSElORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

AccountNUmber 00014T216-DU07 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31:2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax J.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffeison 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzeJ.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

WG&M (Smolinsky, Karotkin and Meisesj 
regarding revisions to plan and DS proposed by 
Nova Scotia,noteholders and agreement on 
process to resolve (.8); analyze strategy 
regarding Nova Scotia litigation 1.6). 

10/13/10 KLC Draft history of events surrounding Lock-Up 11.10 
Agreement for disclosure statement 12.5); office 
conference with Fisher re: standing 
memorandum (0.8); revise insert re: Disclosure 
Statement (3,1); correspondence to and from M. 
Meises (WGMJ re: same 10.2); telephone call with 
Fisher, Seidel and WGM re: same (0.8); discuss 
same with Fisher and Seidel (1.1); revise 
amended objection {2.8}. 

10/14/10 E.F. Confer with Seidel conceming call with 6,00 
Buonomo to discuss assumption and assignment 
issues (.2); revise DS supplement regarding NS 
objection (.9); meet with Cooperman regarding 
DS revision and draft amended objection {1.0}: 
revise draft amended objection (A); revise 
memorandum to Committee conceming 
standing issues P .5); draft e-mail to Committee 
concerning DS supplement and standing issues 
(A); draft memorandum to Committee 
concerning retention of Canadian counsel, 
amendment of objection, standing and plan's 
treatment of NS claims, 

10/14/10 BNS' Telephone call with S. Karotkin (WGM) regarding 1.00 
Nova Scotia disclosure and treatment of Nova 

I 
I 

I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professiollal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOOi41216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31. 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

Scotia claims in plan (.8); confer with E. fisher 
regarding assumption issues (.2). 

10/14/10 KLC Correspondences to and from M. Meises (WGM) 
re: revisions to Plan and Disclosure Statement 
conceming Nova Scotia Objection (004); 
telephone cali with A. Phillips (FTI) re: same 
revisions (0.2); office conference with Fisher re: 
same (1 ); correspondences with Fisher and 
Seidel re: standing options (0.2); revise Plan and 
Disclosure Statement revisions proposed by 
WGM (.9); revise reservation of rights language 
re: KLNF objection to Disclosure Statement (004); 
·telephone cali with J. Sharret (KLNF) re: same 
(0.3); correspondence from J. Sharret re: 
Noteholders objection to Disclosure Statement 
(O.I); review same objection lOA); review 
Greenberg Traurig's second amended 2019 
statement (0.3); correspondence to Fisher re: 
same {O.I J; revise amended objection to all 
Nova Scotia claims (0.6). 

10/15/10 E.F. Prepare for cali with Karotkin by analyzing MSPA 
and standing cases (.9); cali with Buonomo and 
Karolkin regarding NS standing issues and MSPA 
issues (I.2J; revise e-mail to Committee 
concerning various NS issues (.9); telephone call 
with Seidel, Cooperman and WGM (0.3); confer 
with Seidel and Cooperman regarding same 
(0.2) 

10/15/10 BNS Review E. Fisher e~mail to committee regarding 

Tax lO. No 

Suite 100 150 WestJefferson 
Delroit. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
w, ... w.butzel.CCtm 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

4.90 

4.20 

3.20 

\ 

I 

I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proie:;sionai corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 

10/15/10 

10/15/10 

10/18/10 

10/l8/1O 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTlA FINANCE COMPANY 

Ikm Narrative Description 

Novia Scotia status (.3); and e-mail revisions to E. 
Fisher (.1); review draft amended objection (1.6); 
conference call with Karotkin and Buonomo re: 
standing and MSPA issues (1.2). 

BNS Cali with WGM, Cooperman and Fisher; discuss 
same with Cooperman and Fisher. 

KLC Analyze committee update [0.2); revise 
amended objection (OA); review MSPA re: 
potential breach (.1); revise Disclosure Statement 
language (OA); caWwith Buonomo and Karotkin 
re: standing and MSPA issues (1.2); prepare 
summary of Canadian law questions (0.3); 
telephone cali with Seidel. Fisher and WGM (0.3); 
office conference with Seidel and Fisher re: same 
(0.2); research liability re: assumption and 
assignment (1.2). 

E.F. Review GMNS bondholders' objection to DS (A). 

BNS Review Greenberg Traorig amended BR 2019 
statement (.2); review proposed e-mail to 
Commiltee regarding Nova Scotia status (.3); 
correspondence to E. Fisher regarding interest <;>f 
UCC in litigation (.3). 

10/18/10 KLC Review Smurfit docket (0.6); review 
AbitibiBowater docket (OA); review relevant 
pleadings from Smurfit (1.1); review relevant 
pleadings from AbitibiBowater (0.6); 
correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(0.1); correspondences with Greenberg Traurig 

Tax J.D. No' 

Suite 100 ISOWesrJeff'ersoll 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848. 

0.50 

4.30 

0.40 

0.80 

2.90 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proFessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

ACCoUnt Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiollnformoffon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax I.D. No 

Suite 100 IS(} West Jefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.bulzel.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Dote Tkpr Narrative Description . Hours 

re: scheduling (0.1). 

10/19/10 E.F. Analyze Smurfit pleadings with respect to ULe 3.20 
issues (I.!); analyze Abitibibowater pleadings 
with respect to same (A); meet with Cooperman 
and Seidel to prepare briefing for Committee 
conceming NS objection and strategy (1.2); call 
with M. Williams (GDC) conceming NS objection 
(.2); e-mail with Bae and Zirinsky(GT) conceming 
discovery schedule [.3). 

1O/l9/1O BNS Review recent case re: step transfers (.2);1.40 
cOhference with E. Fisher and K. Cooperman to 
outline presentotion to committee on 10/20 (1.2). 

10/19/10 KLC Office conference with Fisher and Seidel re: 5.50 
committee call and next steps (1.2); 
correspondence to M. Meises (WGM) re: same 
(0.1); analyze revised 2019 re: note trades (0.6); 
research postpetition conditions re:objection 
(1.8); correspondence form Seidel re: two step 
transfer case (0.1); review same case (0.4); 
review Bowater docket re: hearing on ULC claim 
(0.3); correspondence with Seidel re: relevant 

. pleadings (0.1); correspondence with Fisher re: 
Greenberg/Akin call (0.1); research applicable 
Canadian cqunsel involved inULC matters (0.5); 
correspondence to Seidel re: total nova scotia 
claims (0.3). 

10/20/10 E.F.· Prepare outline of all NS issues for Commitlee 4.80 
meeting (2.8); participate in, and present at, 
Committee call concerning status of NS 

\ 
I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS£l.ORS 

a prQfessio()of corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

A=ount NumberOO014iL\$c()OOl 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax:l.D.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffer.s.on 
Detroit; Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132157080 
www.bulzel..com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

objection and litigation strategy (1.7); meet with 
Seidel regarding same (.3). 

10/20/10 BNS Participate on committee call regarding Nova 2.00 
Scotia issues (1.7); cOnference with Fisher 
regarding same (.3). 

10/20/10 KlC Participate in Committee call re: Nova Scotia. 1.70 

10/20/10 KLC Correspondence with Meises (WGM) 2.20 
re:disclosure statement revisions (0.1); review 
same (1) and summarize comments (1.1). 

10/20/10 KLC Review transcript from relevant hearing re: 0.80 
Bowaler ULC claim. 

10/21/10 BNS Consider Bowatertranscript regarding 0.60 
allowance of ULC claims. 

10/22/10 E.F. Call with Charles Reigh (Canadian Counsel) 1.00 
regarding Canadian legal issues related to the 
Objection (1.0). 

10/22/10 BNS Discuss double counting and ULC issues with 0.50 
Abitibi counsel. 

10/22/10 KLC Correspondence to and from M. Meises (WGM) 0.20 
re: Disclosure Statement revisions. 

10/25/10 E.F. Review Bowater pleading concerning ULC claim. 0.50 

10/26/10 E.F. Teleconference with Greenberg and Akin 0.80 
concerning briefing schedule for objection. 

10/26/10 BNS Prepare for (.3) telephone conference with D. 1.50 
Golden and Greenberg Traurig (N. Mitchell) 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proFessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidemiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31. 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Ta~ lD. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3tJ2257000 F:3132257080 
w\l'w,butzel.com 

November 16. 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

regarding procedural issues on Nova Scotia 
objection (.8); conference with K. Cooperman 
regarding strategy and process (A). 

10/26/10 KLC Telephone call with Akin and Greenberg re: 2.20 
scheduling (0.8); discuss same with Seidel (OA); 
review revised Disclosure Statement language 
(004); propose revisions re: same (0.1); 
correspondence to M. Meises (WGM) re: same 
(0.1); review Smurfit docket re: relevant hearing 
(0.3); correspondence to J. Sharret (KLNF) re: 
transcript (0.1). 

10/27/10 E.F. Revise DS language regarding NS objection. 0.80 

10/27/10 KLC Draft letter to BJ Gerberre: Nova Scotia agreed 6.10 
upon schedule (1.7); draft proposed stipulated 
order re: Nova Scotia (1.7); review hearing 
transcript re: Smurfit ULC claim (1.9); review 
redacted Canadian counsel memorandum re: 
ULC claim (0.6); correspondence to Canadian 
counsel re: budget issues (0.2). 

10/28/10 E.F. Revise DS language regarding NS objection. 0.50 

10/28/10 E.F. Review draft letter to Judge Gerber regarding 0.30 
scheduling. 

10/28/10 E.F. E-mails with Canadian Counsel regarding 0.50 
memorandum for the GM Nova Scotia notes as it 
relates to NS objection (.3); e-mail to Committee 
update conceming follow-up call with 
Greenberg Troung and Akin Gump conceming 
the Nova Scotia claims objection (.2). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proFe,stonof corpocotiOfl 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

ACCount Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted fhrough October 31,2010 

10/28/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Review draft letter to BJ Garber regarding 
scheduling_ 

10/28/10 KLC Correspondence with and telephone calls with 
. N. Levine (Akin) re: comments to letter and order 
(0.2); revise same (1.5); telephone call to 
Chambers re: pre-trial conference date (0.2); 
correspondence with Akin and Greenberg re: 
same (0.1); correspondence from N. Mitchell 
(Greenberg) re: comments (0.1); review same 
[0.1 }. 

10/29/10 KLC Correspondence to BJ Gerber re: letter and 
stipulation; finalize same; correspondence to 
Akin and Greenberg re: same; correspondence 
with Caprio re: disc for order. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Ta:d.D.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T:3l32257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzcl.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484848 

0.30 

2.40 

0.50 

59,152.00 
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I 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS· 

a professional corporalion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

.. Account Number OOOT 41216-0008 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.50 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 1.80 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 2.30 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 11.50 hours at 
T 0101 For Associate 11.50 

Paralegal II 
FrederickCapria 0.30 hours at 
Total For Paralegal II 0.30 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax 1.0. Nil 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 2257000 F: 313 2257080 
www.butzel.com 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484849 

$525.00 $262.50 
$725.00 $1,305.00 

$1,567.50 

$395.00 $4,542.50 
$4.542.50 

$245.00 $73.50 
$73.50 

6,183.50 
5.80 

6,189.30 
$6,189.30 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELOR-S 

a proFessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0008 

(Privileged and ConfidenHallnformalion) 
PROFESSIONAL SEINICES posted through October 31, 2010 

Date 

10/05/10 

10/05/10 

10/06/10 

10/07/10 

10/08/10 

10/11/10 

10/11/10 

10/12/10 

10/12/10 

10/13/10 

RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

KLC 

KLC 

BNS 

E.F. 

KLC 

E.F. 

KLC 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Consider C. Andres letter regarding BL 3rd fee 
application (.2). 

Correspondence from Fee Examiner re: third fee 
application (0.1); review same correspondence 
(0.9); correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: 
same (0.1); correspondence to Fee Examiner re: 
expenses (0.2). 

Correspondence to Fee Examiner re: third fee 
application expenses (0.1); draft reply to Fee 
Examiner correspondence (0.8). 

Draft response 10'fee examiner re: third fee 
application. 

Review K. Cooperman draft of response to c.. 
Andres re: BL 3rd Fee Application. 

Review correspondence to fee examiner 
regarding third fee application. 

Correspondence to fee' examiner re: third fee 
application. 

Review draft Fee Examiner's Report to Third 
Interim Fee Application. 

Correspondence from Fee Examiner re: draft 
report re: third fee application; review same 
report; correspondence to Seidel and Fisher re: 
same. 

Draft second response to fee examiner re: Ihird 

Tax J.D. No 

Suite 100 150WestJefferson 
Detmn, Michigan 48226 

T: 3 (3 225 7000 F: 313 2251080 
w\'t'w.hut:reLcom 

November 16. 2010 

Invoice No. 8484849 

Hours 

0.20 

1.30 

0.90 

3.80 

OAO 

0.20 

0.20 

0.30 

0.50 

0.90 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AN.D COUNSELORS 

. a profe:;5;~nal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORA liON 

Account Number 000141216-0008 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 

Date Tkpr Narrative Descripjjon 

interim fee application (0.8); correspondence 
with Fisher re: same (0.1). 

10/14/10 KlC Correspondence to C. Andres (GK) re: response 
to draft pleading re: third interim fee application; 
correspondence with Seidel and Rsher re: same. 

10/19/10 KlC Draft reply to fee examiner objection to third fee 
application (1.1); correspondence with Fisher 
and Seidel re: same (0.2). 

·,,10/20/10 BNS Revise BL response to fee examiner re: BL 3rdFee 
Application (A); correspondence with K. 
Cooperman regarding same (.3); review revised 
response (.3). 

10/20/10 KLC Review reply to fee examiner objection to third 
fee application (2.1); coordinate filing of same 
with EPIQ (0.3). 

10/21/10 FJC Prepare image of Affidavit of Service of Reply to 
Fee Examiner's Objection for electronic filing (.2); 
electronically file same (.1). 

10/25/10 BNS Review Weil response to fee examiner regarding 
fees on fees (.2). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax [.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
'YWW.butzel.c{Jm 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484849 

1.30 

1.00 

2.30 

0.20 

6,183,50 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prcfessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0010 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 
RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.50 hours at 
BarryN. Seidel 0.70 hours at 
Tatol For Shareholder 1.20 

. Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 2.10 hours at 
Total For Associate 2.10 

---; ' .. 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Capria 1.30 hours at 
Total For Paralegal II 1.30 

Current fees: 
Less 50%Fei;; Adjustment: 
CUrrent Disbursements: 
Total Curfent Invoice: 
Total Solonce Due: 

TaxLD. No' 

Suite 100 150 W<,st JeffersoD 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257QOO F:31322570S0 
www.butzel.com 

November 16,2010 

Invoice No. 8484850 

$525.00 . $262.50 
$725.00 $507.50 

$770.00 

$395.00 $829.50 
$829.50 

$245.00 $318.50 
$318.50 

1,918.00 
. 1959.00) 

0.00 
·959:00 
S959~OO 

-.-.': .,., 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0010 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through October 31, 2010 

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

Ta::cI.D.No 

Suite 100 l50 Wcsr. Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigall48226 

T:3132257000 11:3£32257080 
www.butzel.c1)m 

November 16, 2010 

Invoice No. 8484850 

Date Tkpr Narrgtive Description Hours 

10/06/10 KLC Revise September proformas. 0.90 

10/12/10 KLC Draft September monthly fee statement. 0.30 

10/14/10 KLC Revise September monthly statement. 0.80 

10/20/10 FJC Review monthly fee statement, checking 1.30 
charges and totals (1.2); e-mail to K. Cooperman 
re same (.1). 

10/22/10 BNS Review September monthly fee statement. 0.20 

10/22/10 KLC Correspondence to Seidel re: September 0.10 
monthly statement. 

10/28/10 E.F. Review BL September monthly fee statement. 0.50 

10/28/10 BNS Review BL September monthly fee statement. 0.50 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1,918.00 



• 

BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSElOR:S 

(1 profess;onal corporot[otl 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0001 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 
~E: GENERAL ADVICE 

~mel<e:er 
Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 1.90 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 1.60 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 3.50 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 2.10 hours at 
Total For Associate 2.10 

TaxLD. No~ 

Sllite 100 l50 West Jefferson 
Detroil, Mlchigan 48226 

T: 3Jl22S 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.blItzel.com 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486976 

Tota~ 
$525.00 $997.50 
$725.00. $1.160.00 

$2,157.50 

$395.00 $829.50 
$829.50 



BUTZE.L LONG 
A T TOR N :E Y SAN 0 C 0 U N- S- e 1. 0 R. S 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0001 
(Privileged and ConfidenHallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 
. RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

Date TkjJr Narrative Description 

11 /05/10 E.F. Teleconference with Commiltee (1.0) 

11/05/1 0 BNS Attend committee meeting by phone. 

11/23/1 0 E.F. Meet With Cooperman regarding budget (O.3); 
e-mail with Cooperman regarding same (O.2); 
meet with Seidel regarding GUC budget (0.3). 

11/23[10 BNS Telephone conference with T. Mayer regarding 
GUC budget (.3) and discuss with E. Fisher (.3). 

11/23/10 KLC Discuss budget with Fisher; correspondence with 
Fisher re: same. 

. 11/24/10 E.F. Review GM's claims work proposal. 

11/30/10 KLC Correspondence from KLNF re: budget matters 
(O.2); review same matters (0.6); participate in 
Committee calljl). . 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax LD.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jc:ff"eoon 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T: 313 225 )000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butz.el.~om 

December 8, 201 0 

Invoice No. 8486976 

Hours 

1.00 

1.00 

0.80 

0.60 

0.30 

0.10 

1.80 

2,987.00 



BUTZELLONG 
A T TOR N E Y SAN 0- C 0 U NSf: LOR S 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
G.ENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0002 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 
RE: RETENTION OF BUTZEL LONG 

r nmekee~er ~ 
Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.30 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.30 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 1.30 hours at 
Total For Associate 1.30 

Tax-I.D.No· 

Suite lOO 150WestJeff'emn 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 70BO 
WlYw.butzcl.com 

December 8,2010 

. Invoice No. 8486977 

TOfa~ 
$525.00 $157.50 

$157.50 

$395.00 ·$513.50 
$513.50 

1· 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS'ElORS 

a professIonaJ cDrporoliort 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number. 000141216-0002 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformotion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

Date 

11/12/10 

11/15/10 

11/16/10 

RE: RETENTION OF BUTZEt LONG 

Tkpr Narrative Description 

E.F. Review Canadian-Counsel retention application 
and declaration.-

KLC Revise retention application re: Canadian 
counsel (OAJ and same declaration (OAJ. 

KLC Revise Canadian_Counsel retention application 
and declaration; correspondence to Seidel re: 
same. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxJ.D_No~ 

Suj[e 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F; J 13 225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

DecemberS, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486977 

Hours 

0.30 

0.80 

0.50 

671.00 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professiolto} corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. Account Number 000141216-0005 . 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 
RE: BUrZEL FEE AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

I':mekeeper 

Tax LD.No· 

Suite 100 150WestJcfferson 
Detroit,. MichigM 4&226 

T: 313 225 1001} F: 313 225 7{}80 
v.'Ww.bulZel.com 

December 8.2010 

Invoice No. 8486978 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNI:YS AND COUNSE-LORS 

a PfQf~Hjonot corporation 

. UNSECURED CREDITORSCOMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confldentiallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010· 

. RE: BUTZElLONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Dote 

11/01/10 

11 /01 flO 

11/01/10 

. 11/08/10 

11/08/10 

11/11/10 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

FJC 

BNS 

KLC· 

FJC 

Narrative Descriplion 

Review Butzel Long 4th Interim Fee Application 
(A) and discuss with K. Cooperman (.2)~ 

Office conference with Seidel re: fourth fee 
application: revise same; discuss same with 
Caprio; correspondence to C. Andres (GK) re: 
same; correspondence to notice parties re: 
same. 

Telephone calls w.ith K. Cooperman re submission 
of ASCII files to Bankruptcy Trustee (.1); prepare 
setup ASCII files for submission to Trustee (.1); 
transmit same to Trustee (.1); prepare complete 
ASCII and Acrobatl ;pdf versions 9f Fourth Fee 
Application for transmission to Trustee (1.9); 
transmit all to Trustee via e-mail (.1). 

Draft chart for 3rd fee application order (1.8); e-
mail to R. Brooks (WG&M) re: same [.2). 

Correspondence with Seidel re: third fee 
application order; review calculations re: same. 

E-mails with K. Cooperman and M. Martinez re 
final versions of invoices and redacting of same 
[.1); e-mails with case team re upcoming fee 
application filing and procedures re same (.2); 
print out hard copies of invoices and forward 
same to Martinez for redacting (.2); process 
image of redacted invoices in preparation for 
filing of fee application (.3J. 

TaxLD.No 

Suite iDO 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:31>2257000 F:3132257~80 
www.hutzcl.com 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486978 

Hours 

0.60 

0.50 

2.30 

2.00 

0.30 

0.80 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNsetoRs 

a professional corporation· 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216-0005 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

Dafe 

11/11/10 

11/14/10 

11/15/10 

11/15/10 

11/15/10 

RE; BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Tkpr 

MM 

KlC 

BNS 

KLC 

FJC 

Narrafive Description 

Redact invoices re: fee application. 

Revise fourth interim fee application in 
preparation of filing. 

Review monthly budget letter and 
correspondence re: same to K. Cooperman. 

Correspondence withCapria re: fourth interim 
fee application (0.3); revise same (0.6); draft 
budget (0.2); correspondence to fee examiner 
re: same (0.1). 

E-mails with K. Cooperman re revisions to fee 
. application (.2); foNtard hard copies of exhibits 
to fee application to S. Litvinko tor preparation of 
courtesy copies (.1); revise ASCII version of fee 
application to reflect changes made by case 
team and in preparation of sUbmission of same 
to Trustee (1.2); revise Acrobat [.pdf] images of 
fee application for filing and service (.5); 
.electronically file fee application (.6); begin 
creating hard copy of executed fee application 
for courtesy copies (.3); scan signature pages 
(.1); merge signature page images into image of 
fee application (.2); forward executed image to 
Kramer Levin for service of same (.1); finalize 
creating hard copies of executed fee 
application for submission to judge and trustee 
(A). . 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxLD. No· 

Suite 100 lSI)Wc:stJcffcrsQn 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T: 313225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.colD 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486978 

1.10 

0.90 

0.10 

1.20 

3.70 

4,934.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORN,EYS AND COUNSELOR.S 

oil professional corporQtiQn 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000 1412 16-0006 
(Privileged and Confldenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 
JP MORGAN AVOIDANC~ COMPLAINT 

I~ ~ 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 11.80 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 1.80 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 13.60 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman "12.80 hours at 
Total For Associate 12.80 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite 100 150 Westlefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48126 

T; 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzeJ.eorn 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486979 

$525.00 " $6,195.00 
$725.00 $1,305.00 

$7,500.00 

$395.00 $5,056.00 
$5,056.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0006 

. (Privileged and Confidenliallnformatio-n) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 

RE: jp MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Dafe Tkpr 

11/01/10 .E.F. 

11/01/10 BNS 

11/01/10 BNS 

11/01/10 KLC 

11 /10/10 E.F. 

11/16/10 E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Review order regarding recusal (.6); confer with 
Cooperman regarding same (.2); e-mails with 
Cooperman and Seidel regarding same (.2); e­
mail to Callagy (KDW) regarding same (.1); draft 
memorandum to Committee regarding same 
(A) . 

Telephone conference with J. Freeman 
regarding status of JPM litigation. 

Review BJ Garber order regarding recusal (.5); 
discuss same with K. Cooperman (. J) review e­
mail to committee regarding same (.1). 

Correspondence to and from bondholder re: 
oral argument date (0.1); review order submitted 
by BJ Gerber re: potential conflict (0.3); discuss 
same with Seidel (0. J); cunfer wilh Fishel Ie: same 
(0.2); review revised Disclosure Statement 
language re: term loan (OA); correspondence 
with J. Sharret (KLNF) re: same (0.1). 

Teleconference with Macksoud (KlNf) regarding 
DIP loan issues (A); prepare for oral argument 
(.3). 

Analyze issues concerning right to proceeds of 
case. 

11/18/10 KLC Begin preparing materials for review before oral 
argument. 

11/19/10 KLC Prepare materials for review in connection with 
oral argument. 

TaxLD.No~ 

Suite]oo 150. weSt Jefferson 
Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
'Www.buneLcom 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486979 

0.10 

0.70 

1.20 

0.70 

0.90 

0040 

0.70 

1 
j. 

-j 

I , 



BUTZE.L LONG Tax J.D. No. 
A.T-T"ORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 150WestJefferson . 
a professional corporolion Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T, 313 225 7000 J1, 313 22>7080 
www.botzcl.CQm 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486979 
Account Number 000141 21 6-0006 

(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

J 1/22/10 

Tkpr 

KLC 

Norrative Description 

Prepare summary of materials re: oral argument 
preparation (0.6); update research re: same 
{I A) . 

11/24/10 EF. Prepare budget for transmission to Treasury (.9); 
e-mails with Seidel and Mayer (KLNF) regarding 
same (.3). 

2.00 

1.20 

11/28/1 0 . KLCReview summary judgment case law in 3040 
preparation of oral argument. 

11/29/1 0 EF. E-mails with Sharret (KLNF) regarding Term Loan 2.50 
budget (.2); review results of legal research (1.4) . 
and briefs to prepare for oral argument (.9). 

11 /30/l 0 E.F. Review key cases to prepare for oral argument 5.00 
(1.8); review pleadings to prepare for oral 
argument (1.8); draft outline for oral argument 
(1.1); e-mails to Cooperman regarding legal 
research for oral argument (.3). 

11/30/1 0 BNS Participate on committee call regarding JPM 1.00 
and GUC Trust funding issues. 

11/30110 . KLC Calculate leesre: term loon litigation (004); 5.10 
correspondence to J. Sharret [KLNF) fe: same 
[OJ); research effect of SDNY authority on SDNY 
Bankruptcy Court (1.2); review all pleadings in . 
adversary proceeding re: oral argument 
preparation (304). 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES 12,556,00 

~ . , 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEyS AND COUNS£I.ORS 

a proiess(onal corporati?fI 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMlTIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOO0l41216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information ) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVASCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

I Timekeeper 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 52.50 hours at 
Bony N. Seidel 21.70 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 74.20 

Associate 
Maria Caceres-Boneau 32.30 hours at 
Katie L. Cooperman 68.10 hours at 
Total For Associate 100.40 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Co pria 1.40 hours at 
Total For Paralegal II 1.40 

TaxLD. No 

Suit-e 100 lSOWcstJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.but7..e1.tom 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Tot~ 

$525.00 $27,562.50 
$725.00 $15,732.50 

$43,295.00 

$325.00 $10,497.50 
$395.00 $26,899.50 

$37,397.00 

$245.00 $343.00· 
$343.00 



BUTZE.L LONG 
·ATTORNEYS AND COUNSE:LORS 

a plofesfJion~f corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30. 2010 
RE: GENERALMOTORS.NOVA SCOTIA FINANCEGOMPAN.Y 

TaxI.D_No: 

Suite 101} ISO WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 708() 
www.butzel.com 

December 8; 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 



BUT ZE L LONG 
A T T 0 -II. N E Y 5 AND C 0 U N SEt 0 R 5 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFI;SSIONAl SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

11/01/10 E. F. Review revisions to DS regarding Nova Scotia 
issues. 

11/01/10 KLC Correspondence to and from M. Meises (WGM) . 
re: comments to Disclosure Statement re: Nova 
Scotia; review same; correspondence with Seidel 
and .Fisher re: same. 

Tax tD. No:-

Suite 100 lS{l West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F, 3132257080 
www.blltzeLcom 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Hours 

0.30 

0040 

11/02/1 0 E.F. Meet with Cooperman to prepare for call with 1.90 
Alix regarding status of litigating objection [.5): 
call with Alix regarding status of objection (.4); 
meet with Cooperman and Seidel regarding 
potential objection to individual NS claims (1.0). 

Il/02/10 BNS Conference call with Alix, FTI, E. Fisher and K. lAO 
Cooperman regarding status of Nova Scotia 
objections (A); conference with K. Cooperman 
and E. Fisher regarding strategy and procedure 
regarding objections (1.0). 

11/02/1 0 KLC Prepare for call with Atix and FTI re: Nova Scotia 4.20 
claims [0:5); participate in same call with Rsher 
and Seidel (0.4); prepare for same with Rsher 
(0.5); correspondence to D. Lockard (Alix) re: 
same (004); correspondence with M. Meises 
(WGM) re: Disciosl!re statement revisions re: 
Nova Scotia (O.l); review same revisions [1.3); 
conference with Fisher and Seidel re: objection 
(1 ). 

11/04/10 BNS E-mail to J. Bae (GT) regarding scheduling of 0.20 
meeting. 



BUTZEL LONG 
. AT "T 0 R N E Y 5 AND C 0 U N S. E !. 0 R S 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 . 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA fiNANCE COMPANY 

TmLO.No . 

Suite 100 ISU West Jefferson 
DetrOit, Michigan 48226 

T: JI3 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.C3m 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

11/08/10 U. 

11/08/10 BNS 

1.1/09/10 E.F. 

11/09/10 BNS 

Review (1 J and revise (0.9) NS objection. ·1.90 

Review revised OS language. proposed by Nova 0.60 
Scotia noteholders. 

Revise amended objectioh. 4.70 

Review additional disclosure for os (A); 1.50 
telephone conference with D. Golden (GT) 
regarding filing of amended objection (.2); e­
mail exchange with S. Karotkin regarding cap on 
Nova Scotia noteholder claim (.1); e-mail to E. 
Fisher regarding strategy regarding filing of 
amended objection (.3); review T. Mayer update 
of DS hearing and budget (.5). 

11/09!1 0 KLC Correspondences from Seidel and Greenberg 0.20 
Traurig re: comments to Disclosure statement re: 
Nova Scotia. 

11/10/10 E.F. Review letter from Steinberg (K&S) concerning 3.50 
objection (.5); revise NS objection (1.7); meet 
with Seidel regarding Steinberg letter and NS 
Objection (1.3). 

11/10/10 BNS Review revised objection to Novo Scotia claims 3.70 
(l.8); review letter regarding New GM position on 
Nova Scotia claims (.6J; conference with E. Rsher 
regarding New GM Letter and amended 
objection (1.3). 

11/10/10 KL<:: Correspondence from A. Steinberg (King and 0040 
Spalding) re: Nova Scotia objection re: New GM; 
review same. 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND cOUNSE'/.ORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
. (Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

Date 

11/11/10 

11{11/1O 

11/12/10 

11/12/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TJ<pr 

E.F. 

KLC 

E.F. 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

·Meet with Cooperman regarding revisions to NS 
objection (1.1); e-rnails with counsel regarding 
objection schedule (.5); review stipulation {.3} . 
and letter (.3) regard[ng same; call with . 
Steinberg conceming New GM position on 
objection (.5); levise objection to incorporate 
comments (1.9). 

Office conference with Fisher re: objection 
revisions (1.1); telephone call with A. Steinberg 
(K&S) Rsher re: letter (0.5); revise amended Nova 
Scotia objection (2.7); correspondences with 
Fisher re: same (O.2); draft modified stipulation re: 
objection deadlines (0.7); draft letter to BJ 
Gerber re: same (0.2); correspondence with 
Greenberg Traurig and Akin Gump re: meeting 
conceming objection (0.3); begin review of 9 
additional claims re: objection (0.8). 

E-mail to Kramer regarding letter from New GM's 
counsel atKing & Spalding (.2); e-mail update to 
Committee regarding same (.3). 

Analyze individual claims re: Nova Scotia (0.6); 
revise stipulation re: Noteholders and Trustee· 
(0.5); correspondence with Greenberg and Akin 
re: schedule (02); correspondence to Bj Gerber 
re: revised stipulation (0.2); correspondence to 
and from B. Huffman (Alix) re: Nova Scotia claims 
(0.3). 

Tax l.D. No:' 

SUite too 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T; 31:>225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
'www.butzel.\:Qm 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Hours 

4.60 

6.60 

'0.50 

1.80 



BUT Z E. L LO N G 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporotion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 

Date 

1.1112110 

11/15110 

.11/15/10 

11/15/10 

11 /16/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr 

FJC 

E.F. 

BNS 

KLC 

E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Download stipulation !orbriefing schedule(.I); 
burn same to disk and forward to K. Cooperman 
(.1 ) . 

Revise memorandum to Committee concerning 
. meeting with Noteholders (2.7); attend meeting 
with Noteholders and New GM (2); discuss same 
with Cooperman and Seidel (1 .1 ); revise 
objection (2J and review legal research 
regarding same (l). . 

Attend meeting at G. Traurig regarding possible 
settlement (2.0): follow-up discussion regarding 
strategy and issues with E. Fisher and K. 
Cooperman (1.1). 

Meeting with Akin, Greenberg and King & 
Spalding (2); discuss same with Fisher and Seidel 
(1.1); review Lock-Up Agreement re: 
subordination (1.4J; correspondence with Fisher 
re: same (0.2); correspondence with G. licoll 
(Greenberg) re: article and case (0.2); 
correspondence with Greenberg, Akin and KS fe: 
scheduling (O.l); review Calpine docket re: 
duplicative claim issue (0.6). 

Call with Williams (GDCJ and Cooperman 
regarding New GM partial settlement proposal 
(.3); call with Mayer and Seidel·regarding same 
(.5); meet with Cooperman regarding objection 

. (.3); revise objection (S.2); meet with 
Cooperman and Seidel regarding Committee 
update conceming Nova.scotia offer(.S); meet 

T3XI.D.No~ 

Suire 100 150 West Jefferson 
DetrQit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.\).utzcl.com 

December s:20io . 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Hours 

0.20 

8.80 

3.10 

5.60 

10.70 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOItNEYS ANO COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) . 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30. 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

with·Seidel re: same (0.6); e-mail with 
Cooperman regarding update language (0.2); 

. teleconference with Ffl and Cooperman 
regarding evaluation of same (OA). 

11/16/10 BNS Review E. Fisher draft of memo to Committee 
regarding meeting with New GM P); e-mail to T. 
Mayer regarding same (.2); conference with E. 
Fisher and K. Cooperman regarding issues and 
strategy; (.8); revisions 10 draft memo [A); further 
discussion with E. Fisher regarding 
recommendation to Committee (.6); telephone 
call with T. Mayer and E. Fisher (.5). 

11 /16/l 0 KLC· Revise amended objection (6.3); office 
conference with Fisher and Seidel re: Committee 
update concerning Nova Scotia offer(.8); 
correspondence from Greenberg re: assumption 
and assignment cases (O.l); review same cases 
(0.6); further research confirming effect of 
assignment on Old GM (0.9); correspondence 
with Fisher re: update language (O.l); review 
same (0.6); telephone call with Fisher and Gibson 
·Dunn re: settlement (0.3); discuss same with Fisher 
(0.3); correspondence with M. Meises (WGMJ fe: 

. brief[ng schedule (0.2); correspondence with 
KlNF re: settlement (0.2); telephone call with FTl 
and Fisher fe: evaluation of same (004); review 
section 502(d) cases in connection with 550 re: 
objection (2.4); correspondence with Fisher re: 
same (0.2); analyze Lock-Up agreement fe: 
consent to bankruptcy implications (0.5). 

TaxI.D.No' 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Delroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

December 8.2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

3.40 

14.60 



BUTZE.L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS-ELORS 

a proff)ssiQoal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenfiallnfonnation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date I!mr Narrative Description 

Tax J.D. No 

Suite 100 150WestJefferson 
Denoil. Michjgan 48226 

T: 313 22S 7000 F: 313 22S 7080 
• ·www.blltzel.oom 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

11/17/10 EF. Revise objection (1.2); meet with Cooperman 5.10 
and Seidel regarding New GM call (l); 
participate in Committee call regarding New 
GM partial settlement proposal [l.3); meet with 
Cooperman and Seidel regarding revisions to 
objection (1.6). 

11/17/10 BNS Parlicipate on Committee call regarding status 3.90 
and strategy [1.3}; conference with E. Fisher and 
Ko Cooperman regarding strategy for call with 
New GM[I}; conference with E. Fisher and K. 
Cooperman regarding legal theories for Nova 
Scotia claims objections [1.6). 

11/17/10 KLC Further revisions 10 objection [4.9); participate in 8.80 
Committee call with Fisher and Seidel re: 
settlement (1.3); office conference with Fisher 
and Seidel re: objection [1.6); discuss New GM 
strategy with Fisher and Seidel (I). 

11/18/10 E.F. Revise objection [l}; meet with Cooperman and 2.70 
Seidel regarding same [.7); e-moails with 0 

Cooperman conceming repayment of loan to 
New GM {A}; review underlying documents 
regarding same [.3); e-mails with Cooperman 
regarding standing research arid equitable 
subordination (.3). 

11 /18/10 BNS Review revised draft of amended objection (.8); 2.10 
conference with E. Fisher and K. Cooperman 
regarding same (.7); further consideration of 
502(d) argument (.6). 



BUTZEL LONG 
A T T 0 ~ N E Y SAN D C 0 \J N 5 E L'O R S 

a professionaf corporation 

UNSECURED CREDiTORS COMMIITEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATiON 

Account Number 00014 12 I 6-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted throvgh November 30, 2010 

Dale 

11/18/10 

11/18/10 

11/18/10 

11/19/10 

11/19/10 

11/19/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr 

KLC 

MCB 

FJC 

EJ. 

BNS 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Analyze MSPA re: breaches in connection with. 
prepetition loan (3.6); correspondence with 
fisher re: same (OA); draft notice for amended 
objection (1.2); conference with Fisher and 
Seidel re: objection (.7); office conference with 
BoneaU re: objection and research project !2.3); 
revise amended objection (3.2); 
correspondence with Alix Partners re: Guarantee 
claims (0.3); correspondence with EPIQ re: 
service of amended objection [0.2). 

Review amended objections in preparation for 
meeting with Cooperman regarding related 
research (2.7); conference with K. Cooperman 
to discuss research re: objection (2.3). 

E-mails with K. Cooperman re preparation of 
exhibits for electronic filing (. J); prepare images 
of exhibits (A); print out hard copies of exhibits 
(.1); forward all to Cooperman (. I); revise exhibit 
image 1.2). 

Revise Nova Scotia objection (2.1); revise notice 
regarding objection (.5); review results of 
research regardi(lg equitable subordination (.9). 

Conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
possible additional revisions regarding amended 
objection to Nova Scolia noteholders. 

Office conference with Seidel re: amended 
objection (1.2); final revisions to objection (1.6); 
finalize objection and exhibits (1.6); file amended 

TaxI.D. 'No 

Suite tOO t50 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michlgan 48226 

T, 3l31?.5 7000 F, 313 225 7080 
www.butzelcom 

December 8. 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Hours 

11.90 

5.00 

0.90 

3.50 

1.20 

4.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORN.EYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216·0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 

11/19/10 

11 /21 /1 0 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

MCB 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

objection (0.3); draft letter to Judge Gerber re: 
same· (0.2); correspondence to Greenberg, Akin 
and New GM re: same (0.1); corre$pondence to 
Committee re: same (OJ); correspondence with 
EP1Q re: service of same (0.2). 

Review amended objection re: research issues. 

Correspondence with Fisher and Boneau re: 
equitable subordination .. 

TaxlD.No· 

Suite 100 t50WestJefCerson 
Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T:31322S7000 1':31322:57080 
wwVt'.Dutzcl.com 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

1.20 

0.20 

11/21/10. MCB Review Collier's section re equitable 7040 
subordination (1.3); research re equitable 
subordination (3.5j;·researchinsiders in the 
equitable subordination context (2.2); 
correspond with K. Cooperman and E. Fisher re 
equitable subordination (A) . 

. 11/22/10 E.F. Meet with Cooperman to discuss research issues 1.00 
to be included in settlement recommendation to 
Committee (.7): review DS as it pertains to NS 
objection (.3). 

11 /22/10 KLC Office conference with Fisher re: reseqrch 2.40 
strategy (0.7); office conference with Boneau re: 
equitable subordination lOA); correspondence 
with M. Meises (WGM) re: revised Plan and os 
language re: Nova Scotia {D. I); review same 
revisions (OA); revise same language (0.3); 
correspondence from L. Macksoud (KLNF) re: 
binding prepetilion agreement {0.2}; 
correspondence witt"! Rsher re: same (0.2). 

11/22/1 0 MCB Meeting with K. Cooperman to discuss whether 3.80 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS"ELORS 

a profeHjona{ corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141 21 6-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax 1.D. No 

Suit-e 100 ISO W-;st Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 3J3 225 7080 
www.hutzel.com 

December 8, 20 10 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description . Hours 

insiders (.4); research re equitable subordination 
(3.4) . 

11/22/10 F JC Prepare image of objection to be filed 0.30 
electronically (.1); electronically file objection 
(2). 

11 /23/ 10 E.F. Meet with Cooperman and Boneau regarding 2.90 
equitable subordination (004); review analysis 
regarding settlement 'offer (2.5). 

11/23/10 KLC Telephone call with L. Macksoud (KLNF) re: 4.40 
prepetition allowance of claims (OA); revise 
summary of same (0.3); correspondence to L 
Macksoud (KLNF) re: same (0.1); analyze void 
contract as defense to assumption (OA); office 

. conference with Fisher ahd boneau re: equitable 
subordination (004); draft analysis re: settlement 
offer (2.8). 

11/23/10 MCB Meeting with E. Fisher and K. Cooperman re 3.80 
research (A); research cases re: subsidiary as an 
insider (3.1); review definition of affiliate (.2). 

11/24/10 E.F. Conference with Seidel regarding budget for OAO 
Nova Scotia and JPM litigation (A). 

11/24/10 . BNS Conference with E. Fisher regarding budget for 
Nova Scotia and JPM liiigation (A) and e--mail to 
T. Mayer {KLNFJ regarding same (.1); follow-up 
telephone conference with T. Mayer {.Il. 

0.60 

11/24/10 MCB Draft summary of cases, noting key points reo 0.70 
insider status. 

. ! 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AN.D COUNSELORS 

. a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30.2010 

Date 

11/26110 

11/27110 

11/28/10 

11/28/10 

11/29/10 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

MCB 

MCB 

KLC 

MCB 

MCB 

Narrative Description 

Research re the special influence of an insider. 

Read cases re special inflvence of an insider. 

. Review research re: recharacterization and sales 
re: nova scotia objection. 

Read cases re: close relationship of an insider. 

Complete research whether a creditor has a 
close relationship or special influence. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax tD. No . 

Suite 100 J 50 West JeffeJson 
Detroit., Michigan 48226 

T: 313 2257000 F: 313225 7080 
www.butzeJ.com 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486980 

Hours 

2.60 

2.80 

2.10 

3.)0 

1.90 

81,035.00 

" 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS ANO COUNSEL.ORS 

a profes6ionaJ corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 0001412 16-0010 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30, 2010 
RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS . 

fnmekeeper 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.20 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 0.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0040 

Associate 
Katie l. Cooperman 2.60 hours at 
Total For Associate 2.60 

TaxI.D.No· 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, JlJ 225 7000 F, 3[3 225 70BO 
www.but:tel.C()Dl 

December 8,2010 

Invoice No. 8486981 

TO~ 

$525.00 $105.00 
$725.00 $145.00 

$250.00 

$395.00 $1,027.00 
$1,027.00 



.~ 

BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

(] professional corporatIon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0010' 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through November 30,2010 

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

TrotI.D.No: 

Suitt 100 150 WestJcffcrson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 70&0 
www.butzel.c:om 

December 8, 2010 

Invoice No. 8486981 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours . 

11/14/10 KLC Revise proformas re:October monthly statement. 1.10 

11/19/10 KLC Revise October invoices. 0.50 

11/24/10 E.F. Review October monthly fee statement. 0.20 

11/24/10 BNS Revise October monthly fee statement. 0.20 

11/24/10 KLC Draft October monthly fee statement (0.9); 1.00 
correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(0.1 ): 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 1.277,00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0001 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

Tax ID. No 

Suite 100 ISO WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T,31322S7000 F,1132257080 
www.butzel..com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490413 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.30 hours at $525.00 $157.50 

$157.50 Total For Shareholder 0.30 

157.50 
OuirentDisbklrsements: ... ,. ····.·;0))0 

Invoice is payable upon receipt 

For your information, the·firm stores closed files for seven years, after which they are generally destroyed. 

i 

i 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

D professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0001 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

Date 

12/07 flO 

RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

Tkpr 

E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Review e-mails from Macksoud (KLNF) 
conceming GM hearing update. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Invoice is payable upon receipt 

Tax ID. No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jeffezson 
Detroit, Michigan48226 

T:3l32257000 F;3132257080 
www.blltzel.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490413 

0.30 

157.50 

For your information, the firm stores closed files for seVen years, after which they are generally destroyed. 

I 

I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profes5ional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0005 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 201 0 

Tax tD.No 

SuitelOO 150WestJeffexs01l 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.blltzelcom 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490414 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 0.10 hours at $725.00 $72.50 
Total For Shareholder 0.10 $72.50 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 1.30 hours at $395.00 $513.50 
Total For Associate 1.30 $513.50 

Current '~ees: . 586.00 
Current DiSbursements: 166.65 
Total Current Invoice: 752.65 
Total Balance Due;. $752.65 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTO.RNEYS ANO COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMffiEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

12/15/10 

12/15/10 

12/20/10 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

KLC 

NarraHve Description 

Review and consider monthly BL budget. 

Draft December budget; correspondence with 
Seidel re: same; correspondence to C. Andres 
(GK) re: same. 

Review order re: fee increases; correspondence 
to accounting re: 2011 rate structure. 

Tax 10. No' 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffe!'SOll 
Detroit, Michigau48226 

T:3132257000 F:31322S1080 
.www.butzel.com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490414 

0.10 

0.30 

0040 

12/21/10 KLC Correspondence with Yu (WGM) re: fee order 0.60 
(0.1); review same order (0.2); review court order 
re: fee increases (0.2); correspondence from 
Accounting re: 2011 rate structure (0.1). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 586.00 

!, 
r 
! 
i 
I 
I 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS£LORS 

a pro((1ssioaal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31,2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Shareholder 
""Eric Fisher 31.10 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 12.50 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 43.60 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 59.90 hours at 
Total for Associate 59.90 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Capria 0.80 hours at 
Total For Paralegal It 0.80 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

.Tax LD. No: 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 311 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.burzel.-clJm 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

$525.00 $16,327.50 
$725.00 $9,062.50 

$25,390.00 

$395.00 $23,660.50 
$23,660.50 

$245.00 $196.00 
$196.00 

49.246.50 
3,989.76 

53,236.26 
$53,236.26 



BUTZEL LONG 
"A T TOR N E Y S A. N 0 C 0 U N S E lOR S 

a profassiQnaJ corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0006 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

Date 

12/01/10 

12/01/10 

12/01/10 

12/01/10 

12/02/10 

RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Tkor 

E.F. 

BNS 

KLC 

FJC 

E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Meet with Seidel to prepare outline for oral 
argument (.8); meet with Cooperman" 10 prepare 
outline for oral argument (2); review cases and 
pleadings (2.6); review agenda for hearing (.2); 
revise letter to Judge Gerber regarding Roswell 
(.2). 

Review summary judgment pleadings (.6); 
conference with E. Fisher to prepare for summary 
judgment argument (.8); telephone conference 
with H. Blum (Gerber's chambers) (0.1). 

Research authenticated record interpretation 
under UCC (0.7); research agent's testimony re: 
legal conclusions (1 .1); prepare binders per BJ 
Gerber request (1.4); telephone call With Caprio 
re: same (.2); conference with Caprio re: same 
[.1); draft index re: same (2.2); draft table of 
contents re: same (1.4); office conference with 
Fisher re: oral argument preparation [2); revise 
agenda (1.5); draft letter re: Roswell case (0.3). 

Telephone call with K. Cooperman re 
preparation for summary judgment motion 
hearing (.2); office conference with Cooperman 
re same (.1); review index-of all court filings from 
court docket (.2). 

Prepare oulline for oral argument (4.6); review 
briefs re: same (0.8); review key cases re: same 
(1.9); meet with Cooperman to review 
submissions to court [.6); meet with Cooperman 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Deti'Oit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132251000 F:3132257080 
www.butzel.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

5.80 

1.50 

10.90 

0.50 

11.00 

, 
'" 
1 
j. 



BUTZEL LONG 
AT"ORNEYS AND COU~SEI.ORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31. 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite 100 150WestJeff'elSOJl 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T.: 313 22S 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.bulzeLcom 

January 19. 2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

to prepare for oral argument (.9); meet with 
Seidel and Cooperman to prepare for oral 
argument (2.2). 

12/02/10 BNS Review cases in preparation for summary 2040 
judgment motion (.2); conference with E. Fisher 
and K. Cooperman to prepare for hearing on 
summary judgment (2.2). 

12/02/10 KLC Correspondence to chambers re: pleadings 10.70 
(0.4); correspondence to Kelley Prye re: same 
(0.2); revise table of contents (0.8); revise index 
re: agenda (004); office conference with Fisher 
and Seidel re: oral argument preparation (2.2); 
office conference with Rsher re:.same (.9); office 
conference with Rsher re: court submissions (0.6): 
draft outline re: summary judgment questions 
(3.3): review research re: authenticated record 
(0.2); review pleadings in preparation of oral 
argument (1.8). 

12/03/10 E.F. Prepare for oral argument re: revisions to outline 8.10 
(2.1); and review of cases (1.6); and briefs [1.1); 
participate in oral argument on summary 
judgment motions (2.5); meet with Cooperman 
and Seidel conceming oral argument (.5); 
discuss same with Cooperman (.3). 

12/03/10 BNS Review cases in preparation for summary 3.80 
judgment (.7); attend summary judgment motion 
argument before BJ Gerber (2.5); conference 
with E. Fisher and K. Cooperman to review 
hearing and construct strategy (.5); conference 



BUTZEL LONG 
ArTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 0001412 J 6-0006 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

TaxI.D.No: 

Suite 100 150 West}eff'erson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F~ 313 2251080 
www.butzel.cnm 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

with J. Smolinsky (WGM) regarding summary 
judgment motion (.J). 

J2/03/10 KLC Attend oral argument (2.5); discuss same with 5.00 
Fisher and Seidel (.5); discuss same with Fisher 
[.3); correspondence with transcript vendor (0.3); 
review appeal process re: by agreement (J A). 

12/06/10 E.F. Review oral argument transcript. 0.50 

12/06/10 KLC Read transcript from summary judgment oral 1.20 
argument (0.8); summarize same (004). 

12/07/10 E.F. Analyze cases cited by JPM at oral argument 2.50 
(1 .2) and review results of research regarding 
Article 9 (0.9) and potential appeal (004). 

12/07/10 KLC Review cases cited by JPM at oral argument 7.60 
[1.8); research appeals by joint consent to 

12/08/10 BNS 

12/08/10 KLC 

12/09/10 E.F. 

second circuit [3. J}; research authorization cases 
in connection with Article 9 of UCC(2.6}; review 
Committee update re: hearing (O.l). 

Review commitfee draft letter regarding plan 
and treatment of term loan proceeds. 

Draft summary of cases cited by JPM at oral 
argument. 

E-mail update to Committee regarding JPM Term 
Loan Avoidance Action (0.2); conference with 
Seidel re: same [0.3J. 

0.30 

1.20 

0.50 

12/09/10 E.F. Review CalJagy letter to Judge Gerber 0.30 
concerning additional authorities. 

I 
! 



BUTZE L LONG Tax I.D. No . 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
a proFessional corporation Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.bulzel.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE Of January 19, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8490415 
Account Number 000141216-0006 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
t PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT I 
I , 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

I 12/09/10 BNS Conference with E. Rsher regarding memo to 0.30 
I committee regarding summary judgment !' • 

argument. ! 
r; 

12/09/l0 KLC Research responsive cases to JPM submission 
, 

4.80 
post oral argument re: escrow instructions and 
authority. 

12/10/10 E.F. Review cases regarding agency to respond to 0.90 
KDW letter [0.5); discuss same with Seidel (004). 

12/10/10 BNS Review KD&W cases (.8) and discuss research 1.90 
ideas with K. Cooperman [.7); conference with E. 
Fisher regarding same (A). 

12/10/10 KLC Draft Committee update re: JPM submission 5.70 
(0.8); correspondence to Seidel and Fisher re: 
same [0.2); research intention of act versus 
intention of result [3.5); discuss same with Seidel 
(0.7); research attorney liability re: mistake [0.5). 

12/12/10 KLC Summarize authority cases re: escrow instructions 6.70 
(2.3); summarize authority cases re: attomey 
mistake (1.8); review applicable UCC cases re: 
mistake (2.6). 

12/13/10 BNS Consider response to KD& W post summary 1.20 
judgment submission (.4); review additional 
cases identified by K. Cooperman [0.8). 

12/13/10 KLC Prepare summary of responsive research re: 1.70 
JPM's submission to Judge Gerber (104); 
correspondence with Seidel and Fisher re: same 
[0.3). 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND 'COUNSELORS 

a profe5sionof corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Conlidenliallnlormation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31.2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Date Tkpr NarratIve Description 

12/14/10 KLC Review additional mistake cases. re: responding 
to JPMorgan letter to Judge Gerber. 

12/15/10 E.F. Review Letter to Judge Gerber concerning 
additional authority. 

12/15/1 0 KLC Draft letter to BJ Gerber re: submission in 
response to JPMorgan's authorities (OA); 
correspondence with Capria re: citations for 
same (0.2); prepare same submission (0.6). 

TaxlD.No: 

Suite 100 I50 West Jeff'er.mn 
Detroit) Mich.igan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 2251080 
www.butzel.com 

January 19. 2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

Hours 

1.10 

OAO 

1.20 

12/15/1 0 F JC Cite check caselaw per K. Cooperman's request . 0.30 
{.2}; forward results to Cooperman (.1). 

12/16/10· E.F. Review (.2) and revise {.2} letter to Court 0.60 
regarding supplemental authority; discuss same 
with Seidel (0.2). 

12/16/10 BNS Review Cooperman draft of letter to BJ Gerber 1.10 
regarding additional case support (.3); review 
cases (.6); discuss with E. Fisher (.2). 

·12/16/10 KLC Further research re: additional authorities in 1.70 
response to JPM submission (1 A); revise letter to 
BJ Gerber re: same (0.1); correspondence with 
Fisher and Seidel re: same (O.l); correspondence 
to Committee re: same (O.l). 

12/17/10 E.F. Finalize letter to Court. 0.30 

12/20/10 KLC Telephone call from chambers re: letter to BJ OAO 
Gerber (.2); confer with Fisher re: service issues 
(.2). 

12/21/10 E.F. Confer with Cooperman regarding service of 0.20 



BUT Z E L LO N G 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216--0006 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformolion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Tkpr Narrative Description 

process issues. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax. I.D. Nt> 

Srute 100 ]50 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3J322S7080 
www.bnb.:elcom 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490415 

49,246.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Shareholder 
Claudia Rast 3.70 hours at 
Eric Fisher 39.10 hours at 
Robert Sidorsky 0040 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 8.30 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 51.50 

Associate 
. Donald Orlandoni 3.70 hours at 

David J. DeVine 2.10 hours at 
Maria Caceres-Boneau 32.90 hours at 
Katie L. Cooperman 38.80 hours at 
Total For Associate 77.50 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

TaxlD. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:31322S7080 
WW1V.butzelcom 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

$400.00 $1,480.00 
$525.00 $20.527.50 
$625.00 $2S0.OO 
$72S.00 $6,017.50 

$28,275.00 

$240.00 $888.00 
$285.00 $598.50 
$325.00 $10,692.50 
$395.00 $IS,326.00 

$27,50S.00 

55,780.00 
4,026.81 

59,806.81 
$59,806.81 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

RE: GENERAl MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr 

12/01/10 MCB 

12/02/10 MCB 

12/03/10 MCB 

12/04/1 0 MCB 

12/06/10· E.F. 

12/06/10 BNS 

12/06/10 KLC 

12/07 flO KLC 

12/07 flO MCB 

12/08/10 E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Review equitable subordination cases involving 
special influence. 

Research excessive fees and equitable 
subordination (2.4); research breach of fiduciary 
duty and equitable subordination (2.3); review 
cases analyzing close relationship (1.4). 

Review cases involving non-statutory insider 
status. 

Summarize important facts from cases discussing 
non-statutory insider status. 

Review results of equitable subordination legal 
research. 

Telephone conference with K. Cooperman 
regarding revised DS regarding Nova Scotia 
claims. 

Correspondence with M. Meises (WGM) re: 
revisions to Plan (0.1); call with Seidel re: same 
(0.2); review revised Plan (0.3) and DS (004) re: 
Nova Scotia. . 

Telephone call with D. Lockard (Alix) re: Nova 
Scotia claims. 

Review code re insider and affiliate status. 

Meet with Boneau regarding subordination 
research (.2); meet with Cooperman regarding 
NS strategy for status conference (.5). 

TaxLD. No 

Suite 100 }50 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzcl.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

Hours 

2.10 

6.10 

2.20 

4.70 

0.90 

0.20 

1.00 

0.20 

2.10 

0.70 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORN'EYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31,2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Dote 

12(08/10 

12/08/10 

12/08/10 

12/09/10 

12/09/10 

12/09/10 

12/09/10 

12110/10 

12/10/10 

Tkpr 

BNS 

KLC 

MCB 

E.F. 

BNS 

KLC 

MCB 

E.F. 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Review draft memo to committee regarding 
12/3 argument on NS summary judgment 
motions. 

Office conference with Fisher re: Nova Scotia 
strategy for status conference . 

. Meeting with E. Fisher to discuss subordination 
research (.2); research re fiduciary owed to 
shareholders (1.5). 

E"mails with Richards Kibbe conceming Morgan 
Stanley's extension to respond to objection (.2); 
review draft bullet point summary regarding 
502(d) (.3J. 

Correspondence to E. Fisher regarding memo to 
committee (0.2); review same memo (0.2). 

Draft bullet point summary re: 502(d) in 
preparation of status conference re: Nova 
Scotia. 

Research wholly-owned subsidiary and fiduciarY· 
duty re: sole-shareholder (2.1): review cases 
directors and officers fiduciary duty (1.3); 
research shareholder suits re: shareholder 
detriment {2.9J. 

Review results of research regarding fiduciary 
duty. 

Telephone conference with S. Karotkin regarding 
status of dispute with noteholders (.2); 
correspondence to K. Cooperman and E. Fisher 

TaxID.No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzef.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

. Hours 

0.20 

0.50 

1.70 

0.50 

0040 

1.70 

6.30 

1.10 

0040 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prohn;~ional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31.2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

regarding same (.2). 

12/10/10 MCB Review fiduciary duty cases (3.1);drafl 
summaries of important points for E. Fisher and K. 
Cooperman (4.2). 

12/12/10 E.F. Review memorandum regarding equitable 
subordination (.2); review 502 (d) cases to 
prepare for court conference (.7); e-mail to 
Cooperman regarding same (.2); review 
equitable subordination cases to prepare for 
court conference (.8); e-mail 10 Boneau 
regarding same (.2). 

12/13/10 E.F. Prepare outline for pre-trial conference (.7); 
analyze casesregarding 502(d) (.7). 

12/13/1 0 KLC Review binders with relevant pleadings for status 
conference (004); review response to NS 
objection filed by New GM (0.8). 

12/13/10 MCB Review e-mail from E. Fisher (.1); procure cases in 
response to Fisher request (.1); review cases in 
anticipation of meeting with E. Fisher to discuss 
equitable subordination (.2). 

12/14/10 E.F. E-mails with FTI regarding NS pre-trial conference 
(.1); e-mails from Cooperman regarding' 
Noteholders response to objection (.2); e-mail to 
seidel regarding same (.1); analyze responses 
filed by Noteholders, trustee and New GM (2.9); 
prepare outline for pre-trial conference (.6). 

12/14/10 E.F. Analyze new GM response (1.2); prepare outline 

Tax LD. No· 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffernon 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132251000 Fd1322S7080 
www.bnrzel.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

7.30 

2.10 

1.40 

1.20 

0.40 

3.90 

10.10 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COll'~SeLOR5 

a profe~s;oRal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr. Narrative Description 

for oral argument at pre-trial conference 
{2.1 lcall with Cooperman, Noteholders' counsel 
and Trustee's counsel regarding same (.5); meet 
with Cooperman to prepare for oral argument 
(4. I); call with Phillips (FTI) and Cooperman 
regarding economics of Lock-up Agreement (.3); 
review materials prepared by FTI regarding same 
(.4); analyze Greenberg response to objection 
(1.1); analyze Akin response to objection (A). 

12/14/10 BNS Review trustee response to objection. 

12/14110 BNS Telephone conference with R. Stark regarding 
filing of response (.1); conference with 
Cooperman regarding preparation for hearing 
(.6); participate on conference call with FTI (.3) 
and AKIN/ Greenburg (.5); follow-up telephone 
conference with D. Golden (AKIN) (.2). 

12/14/10· KLC Correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: NS 
hearing prepciration (0.2); office conference with 
Seidel re: hearing preparation (.6); office 
conference with Fisher re: same (4.1); review 
Greenberg Traurig response (1.3); review Akin 
Gump response (1.1); review Delta case cited re: 
duplicate claims (0.7); telephone call with Fisher 
and FTI re: hearing (0.3); telephone call with 
Fisher, Akin and Greenbergre: same (.5); 
telephone call with Steinberg (K&S) re: same 
(0.2); correspondence to B. Zirinsky (GT) re: NS 
deponents (0.21; correspondence from L. 
Marinuzzi (Morrison Foerestor) re: NS joinder (0.1); 

TaxlD. No. 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 2251000 F: 313 225 70S0 
www.butt~r.£om 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

Hours 

0.70 

1.70 

12.10 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professionof corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF . 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31,2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxI.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.botzel.com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

telephone call from l. Marinuzzi re: same (0.1); 
research imputing conduct among claimants 
(2.5); correspondence to Fisher re: same (0.2). 

12/15/10 RS Review trustee response to objection (.2); office 0040 
conference with K. Cooperman regarding status 
(.2). 

12/15/10 . E.F. Prepare for pre-trial conference (4.0J; e-mails 10.00 
with Cooperman and Seidel regarding same (.2J; 
meet with Cooperman and Seidel concerning 
same (.5J; meet with Cooperman regarding 
same (2.2J; call with HI regarding hearing (0.3J; 
e-mails with HI regarding same (.2); e-mails with 
Cooperman regarding research of imputing 
conduct among claimants (.2); participate in 
pre-trial conference regarding NS Objection 
(2.0); e-mail update to Committee concerning 
pretrial conference (A). 

12/15/10 BNS Review noteholder responses to claims 3.70 
objections (1.2); conference with K. Cooperman 
and E. Fisher to prepare for status conference 
(.5); attend status conference on scheduling of 
discovery (2.0). 

12/15/1 0 KLC Correspondence with Fisher re: research in 6.30 
advance of NS hearing (0.2J; discuss same with 
Fisher (2.2J; research adjudication of liability 
under 502 (O.2J; research standard for executory 
contracts (0.2); research equitable subordination 
re: rule 3007 (0.3); research statute of limitations 
re: same (0.5); attend status conference re: NS 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31,2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax tD. No. 

Suite roo ISO West Jcffc::1Wll 
Detroit, Micbigan 48226 

T;3132257000 F:31322570SO 
WWW.bntzel.tcIm 

January 19. 2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

Date I.!sQr Narrative Description Hours 

scheduling (2); conference with Sidorsky re: 
hearing status (.2); prepare for hearing with Fisher 
and Seidel (O.5) . 

. 12/16/10 EF. Analyze answers of research regarding equitable 0.90 
subordination. 

12/17/10 E.F. Participate in Committee call to provide 1 .30 
information regarding NS status conference with 
court. 

12/17/10 BNS Participate.on portion of committee conference 0.50 
call including update on NS hearing on 12/15. 

12117/10 KLC Review transcript from status conference (0.7); 2.10 
correspondence with Fisher re: same [.1); 
participate on committee call re: Nova Scotia 
update {1.3}. 

12/19/l 0 E.F. Review oral argument transcript concerning NS 0.70 
objection. 

12/20/10 E.F. E-mails with GT and AG regarding discovery 0.80 
. scheduling issues [.5}; meet with Cooperman 
regarding discovery issues (.3). 

12/20/1 0 KLC Correspondence with Greenberg Traurig and 0.50 
Akin Gump re: discovery schedule; 
correspondence with same re: telephone call to 
discuss schedule; correspondence with Fisher re: 
same. 

12/20/1 0 KLC Revise stipulation re: Old GM consent to standing 1.10 
re: Nova Scotia objection (.8); meet with Fisher 
re: discovery issues (.3). 



BUTZE L LONG TaxI.D.No 
ATTORNEYS' AND ·COUNSELORS 

Suile lOG IS!} West Jefferson 
CI professional corporation Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.<:om 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF January 19, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8490416 1< 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and ConfidentlallnformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31. 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Descriplion Hours 

12/21/10 E.F. Meet with Cooperman to prepare for discovery 1.10 
call wilh GT and AG and to discuss discovery 
plan (.3); call with Cooperman, Orlandoni and 
Devine to discuss Nova Scolia discovery 
assignment (A); revise discovery requests to 
noleholders (A). 

12/21/10 DJD Conference call with E. Fisher, K. Cooperman D. 0040 
Orlarldoni regarding GM Nova Scotia malter. 

12/21/10 DVO Telephone conference with Fisher, Cooperman 0040 
and DeVine regarding GM Nova Scolia matler 

12/21/10 KLC Revise stipulation re; consent conceming 1.80 
objection fl. 1 ); meet with Fisher re: call with AKIN 
arid GT re: discovery (.3); call with Fisher, DeVine 
and Orlandoni re: Nova Scotia aSSignment fOAl. 

12/22/10 E.F. Call with Greenburg and AKIN re: schedule (.5); 1.50 
discuss same with Cooperman {0.6J; revise letler 
to court regarding discovery issues (A). 

12/22/10 KlC Telephone call with Greenberg and Akin re: 1.90 
discovery schedule (0.5); discuss same with fisher 
(0.6); draft leiter to Judge Gerber re: same (0.3); 
revise same letter (0.3); correspondence with 
Greenberg and Akin re: same (0.2). 

12/23/10 E.F. Call with Cooperman and Rast to discuss 2.10 
electronic discovery issues pertaining to 
document requests (A); meet with Cooperman 
to revise document requests to Noteholders (1.7). 

12/23/10 CR Telephone conference with Eric Fisher and Katie 1.70 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporatfon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr Narrative Description 

Cooperman to discuss eDiscovery requirements 
[A); review Litigation Hold letter (.3) and sample 
electronic discovery interrogatories (.2); 
telephone call to Gabi Finnan of Iron Mountain 
re use of ESI database [.1); review ESI materials to 
use for meet and confer with opposing cousel 
(.7) 

Tu LD.No 

SuitelOO l'50WestJeffersoD 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F, 313 22S 7080 
www.bntzeJ.com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

12/23/10 DJD Analyze Committee's First Amended Objection 0.90 
to Claims in connection with assignment to case. 

12/23/10 KLC Telephone call with Fisher and Rast re: electronic 2.90 
discovery protocol (004); correspondence with 
Rast re: same (0.3); office conference with Fisher 
re: document requests to Noteholders (1.7); 
revise same document requests (004); 
correspondence with Akin and Greenberg re: 
Jetter to Judge Gerber (0.1). 

12/27/10 CR Telephone call to Gabi Finnan of Iron Mountain 0.50 
re eDiscovery database setup [.1); telephone 
conference with .Stephanie Shattuck re 
eDiscovery database setup and requirements 
[A). . 

12/27/10 DVO Review objection to claims and attached 3.30 
exhibits [1.9) in connection with assignment to 
case; draft summary of questions re: same (l); 
analyze underlying finandal transactions [A). 

12/28/10 BNS Review MLC pleading regarding Eurobond. 0.30 
setoffs for analogy to Novia Scotia bonds. 

12/28/10 CR Correspondence with vendorre: Stratify proposal 0.60 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 
for eDiscovery database (.2); review proposal 
(A). 

12/28/10 DJD Analyze Akin Gump's Response to Objection. 

12/28/1 0 KLC Further revisions to document requests to 
Noteholders. 

Tax I.D. No: 

Suite 100 ]50 WestJefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 4&226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.bnlze1.com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490416 

0.80 

5.10 

12/29/10 BNS Review scheduling letter regarding discovery. 0.20 

12/29/10 CR Telephone conference with Stephanie Shattuck 0.90 
re database to use for ediscovery (2); email 
Gabi Rnnan at Iron Mountain with questions on 
her ESI database proposal (.2) and respond to 
her response (.2); email to Eric Fisher and Katie 
Cooperman re: status of ESI database proposal 
(.3). 

12/30/10 KLC Revise document requests to Noteholders. 0040 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 55,780.00 

I 
i 
I· 

I 

I 
I 
i 
! 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proFessiolial corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0008 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 0.10 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.10 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 0.50 hours at 
Total For Associate 0.50 

..... " 

Current Fees; 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax 1.D. No: 

Suite lOO 150 west Jeff'ernm 
Detroit,. Michig1l.u 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 22$1080 
www.butzel.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490417 

$725.00 $72.50 
$72.50 

$395.00 $197.50 
$197.50 

270.00 
5.20 

275.20 
$275.20 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0008 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformaiion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

Date 

12/03/10 

12/08/10 

RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 
Tkpr 

KLC 

BNS 

Narrative Descrlption 

Correspondence with Fee Examiner re: limited 
objection to fourth fee application; 
correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: same; 
review same objection. 

Review examiner objection to BL fees. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax tD.No: 

Suite lOO 150 West Jeffersoo 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 700n F: 313.2251080 
www.butzel.com 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490417 

0.50 

0.10 

270.00 

1 
; 

I 
I 

·1 
i 
i 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professjonal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number00014,1216-oo10 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 
. RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 0.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.20 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 2.60 hours at 
Total For Associate 2.60 

Current Fees: 
Less 50% Fee Adjustment; 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite loo 150WestJei'feJSon 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.oom 

January 19, 2011 

Invoice No. 8490418 

$725.00 $145.00 
$145.00 

$395.00 $1.027.00 
$1.027.00 

Ll72.00 
[586.00) 

2.80 
588.80 

$588.80 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Q profe$!$ional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0010 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through December 31, 2010 

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 
Date I!mr Narrative Description 

12/07/10 KLC Revise November proformas inconnection with 
November monthly fee statement. 

12/21/10 KLC Draft November monthly fee statement. 

12/23/10 KLC Revise November monthly statement. 

12/28/l0 BNS Review November monthly fee statement. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax LD~No: 

Suire 100 150WeStJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257QO{) F.313225708G 
www.butzel.com 

January 19,2011 

Invoice No. 8490418 

Hours 

1.00 

1.30 

0.30 

0.20 

1,172.00 

I 
I 

I 
I 

~\ 

I 

I 
I 

I 
! 
i 

I 
I 

I , 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prqfessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0002 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: RETENTION OF BUTZEL LONG 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.30 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.30 

Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 1.30 hours at 
Total For Associate 1.30 

Current Fees: 
... .. .. 

Current Disbursemen1s: . 
Total C LJrrent Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

TaxlD. No' 

Suite 100 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit:, Michigan 48226 

Td132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butze1.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492119 

$575.00 $172.50 
$172.50 

$425.00 $552.50 
$552.50 

725.00 
.0.00 

725.00 
$72&.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0002 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 

RE:RETENTION OF BUTZEl LONG 
Date 

01/03/11 

01/31/11 

Tkpr Narrative Description 

E.F. Revise motion to retain Canadian counsel. 

KLC Revise Canadian counsel retention application 
re: recenf events and filings (0.8); revise 
declaration re: same (004); correspondence to 
Fisher re: same (0.1). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax 1.0. No· 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffezson 
De:troi!, Michigan 48226 

T, 3132151000 F, 313 2151080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492119 

Hours 

0.30 

1.30 

725.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0005 
(Privileged and ConfidentiallnformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite 100 150 West JeffeJ.soLl 
Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T; 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www_b1Jl'ZeL~om 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492120 

RE: BUTZEl LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 1.20 hours at $750.00 $900.00 
Total For Shareholder 1.20 $900.00 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 5.50 hours at $425.00 $2,337.50 
Total For Associate 5.50 $2,337.50 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Caprio 0.30 hours at $270.00 $81.00 
Total For Paralegal II 0.30 $8l.00 

Description Total 
Copies $62.50 
Total Disbursements $62.50 

. 

. 
Current Fees: 3,318.50 
Current Disbursements: 62.50 
Total Current Invoice: 3,381.00 
Total Balance Due: $3,381.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORJ.oI~YS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

Date 

01/03/11 

01/05/11 

01/06/11 

01/06/11 

01/07/11 

01/17/11 

01/26/11 

01 /26/11 

01/26/11 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 
Tkpr 

KLC 

KLC 

BNS 

KLC 

KLC 

KLC 

BNS 

KLC 

FJC 

Narrative Description 

Telephone call with C. Andres (GK) re: January 
budget; correspondence with Seidel and Fisher 
re: budget estimate concerning Nova Scotia. 

Draft letter re: 2011 fee increases in connection 
with BJ Gerber's 11/23 ruling (OA); draft chart re: 
same increases (2); correspondence with 
accounting and billing attorneys re: 2011 rate 
confirmation (0.5). 

Review draft leiter regarding 2011 rates and 
discuss with K. Cooperman. 

Correspondence with Seidel re: rate increase 
disclosure; discuss same with Seidel. 

Finalize rate increase disclosure; correspondence 
to C. Andres (GK) re: same. 

Draft February budget; correspondence with 
Seidel re: same; correspondence to Fee 
Examiner re: same. 

Review draft supplemental disclosure regarding 
2011 increase of BL rates (.3); conference with K. 
Cooperman regarding same (.5). 

Office conference with Caprio re: fifth fee 
application (O.3); revise 2011 supplemental fee 
disclosure re: December proformas (0.1); discuss 
same with Seidel (0.5). 

Office conference with K. Cooperman re 

Tax I.D.No.-

Suite 100 150WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michiga1l48226 

T: 313225 "JOO(} F:31322570SG 
www.butzel.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492120 

Hours 

0.50 

2.90 

DAD 

0.50 

DAD 

0.30 

0.80 

0.90 

0.30 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS ANO COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0005 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE; BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Tkpr Narrative Description 

procedures for upcoming fee application (.3). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax I.D. No 

Suite lOO J50WestJeffer.;on 
Detroil, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F:313225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492120 

3,318.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profes.iionCll corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0006 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPlAINT 

Shareholder 
Cynthia J. Haffey 0.50 hours at 
Eric Fisher 0.50 hours. at 
Total For Shareholder 1.00 

Associate 
Katie L.Cooperman 1.10 hours at 
Total For Associate 1.10 

.. 
Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: , . 

Tax r.D.No· 

Suite}OO 150 West Jefferson 
Detroil, Michigan 48225 

T:3132257000 F:3132251080 
\VW\v.butzel.~om 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492121 

$390.00 $195.00 
$575.00 $287.50 

$482.50 

$425.00 $467.50 
$467.50 

950.00. 
90.24 

1,040.24 
$1,040.24 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATToRNeYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

AccountNumber: 000141216-0006 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformaiion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 

Date 

01/03/11 

01/03/11 

01/03/11 

RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

Tkpr 

CH 

E.F. 

KlC 

Narrative Description 

Call with Fisher and Cooperman re: service issues 
(0.5). 

Call with Haffey and Cooperman regarding JP 
Morgan service issues. 

Telephone call with Haffey and Fisher re: serving 
defendants- (0.5); correspondence to Haffey re: 
relevant pleadings (OA); correspondence to 
Fisher re: same (0.2). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax ID. No , 

Suite lOG. 150 West JeffetSOll 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzeJ.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492121 

0.50 

0.50 

1.10 

950.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSEl.ORS 

a proie$sronal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenilallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

f!lmekee:er 

Shareholder 
Claudia Rast 15.00 hours at 
Regina M. Alter 0.80 hours at 
Eric Fisher 43.50 hours at 
Robert Sidorsky 13.30 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 10.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 82.80 

Associate 
Jennifer ADukarski 1.50 hours at 
Laura E. Tedesco 6.40 hours at 
Donald Orlandoni 0.90 hours at 
David J. DeVine 1.70 hours at 
Mario Caceres-Boneau 60.60 hours at 
Katie L. Cooperman 143.90 hours at 
Total For Associate 215.00 

Paralegal 
Stephanie A. Shattuck 7.80 hours at 
Total For Paralegal 7.80 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Caprio 1.40 hours at 
Total For Paralegal II 1.40 

Tax:LD_No-~ 

Suite 100 lSOWestJefkrson 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T: 3B 225 7000 F:313 22S 7080 
www.hntzel.eom 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Tota~ 

$400.00 $6,000.00 
$440.00 $352.00 
$575.00 $25,012.50 
$625.00 $8,312.50 
$750.00 $7.650.00 

$47.327.00 

$225.00 $337.50 
. $235.00 $1.504.00 

$275.00 $247.50 
$300.00 $510.00 
$335.00 $20.301.00 
$425.00 $61.157.50 

$84.057.50 

$180.00 $1 A04.00 
$1 A04.00 

$270.00 $378.00 
$378.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELOR.S 

13 professionol corpoTOtjcB 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
NOVA SCOTIA COMPANY 

TaxI.D.No 

Suite 100 lS6 West Jefferson 
Detroit,. Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:31322570&0 
www~butletcom 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 



BUTZE.L LONG TaxI.D.No: 
ATTORNEYS AND COUN.SELORS 

Suite 100 150 Wcstlefferson 
a professional corporation Detroit, Michlgan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313225 7080 
. www.butzeLtom 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF February 9, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8492122 .'" 
Account Number: 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
. Date Tkpr Narrative DeSCription Hours 

01/03/11 KLC Draft document requests to trustee. 0.90 

01/04/11 BNS Analyze K. Cooperman e-mall regarding 0.30 
agreement as failing executory contract test. 

01/04/11 KLC Correspondence to Rsher and Seidel re: 0040 
executory nature of agreements concerning 
Nova Scotia objection. 

01/05/11 E.F. Review (0.5) and revise (004) document requests 0.90 
to Trustee. 

01/05/11 KLC Continue to draft document requests to the 2.20 
Nova Scotia Rnance Trustee. 

01/06/11 E.F. Review (0.3) and revise (0.2) document requests 0.90 
to Noteholders; meet with Cooperman 
regarding same (A). 

01/06/11 BNS Telephone conference with B~ Zirinsky (GT) 0.50 
regarding status of claims objections (.3); 
analyze impact of proposed asbestos stipulation 
on NS claims (.2). 

01/06/ll KLC Revise document requests to Nova Scotia 8.70 
Rnance trustee (504); revise document requests 
to Noteholders (2.8); office conference with 
Fisher re: same (004); correspondence from Seidel 
re: Greenberg message (OJ). 

01/07/11 E.F. Revise trustee (0.6) and noteholder discovery 2.90 
requests (0.6); meet with Cooperman 
conceming discovery (1.7). 

01/07/11 BNS Further analysis of K. Cooperman e-mail 0.30 



BUTZELLONG 
ATTORNEYS AND cOUNSELORS 

a professlonol corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiollnformotion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA fiNANCE COMPANY 

T8X1.D. No' 

Suite IO{} lSG West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michlgan 4822.6 

T:3l32251000 F:31322570S0. 
www.butzel.~om 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

regarding executory contracts. 

01/07/11 CR Prepdre sa mple ESI Discovery Protocol (.3); 2.30 
confer with Jennifer Durkarski re: same (.1); 
review materials re ESI discovery protocols from 
Durkarski (1.9). 

01/07/11 KLC Draft interrogatories to Noteholders (3.1); draft 6.20 
interrogatories to Nova Scotia Finance trustee 
[1.3); discuss discovery with Fisher (1.7); 
correspondence to Seidel re: same (0.1). 

01/07/11 JAD Research eDiscovery rules for SDNY (004); confer 0.80 
with Rast re: discovery protocol (.l); summarize 
recent updates in SDNY eDiscovery 
jurisprudence (0.3). 

01/09/11 E.F. Review (004) and revise (0.3) interrogatories. 0.70 

01/09/11 CR Review (0.3) and revise draft document request 0.90 
(0.6) re: discovery language. 

01/09/11 KLC Correspondence to Rast re: E-discovery materials 1.50 
(0.1); review same materials re: discovery 
conceming Nova Scotia objection (0.8); . 
correspondence with Fisher re: comments to 
interrogatories (0.1); revise interrogatories re: 
same (OA); correspondence to Seidel re: same 
(0.1 ). 

01/10/11 E.F. Meet with Rast and Cooperman regarding e- lAO 
discovery issues (.6); review revised 
interrogatories (0.2) and document requests (.3); 
review motion to allow claims for voting purposes 
(.3). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS ANa. COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

Date 

01/10/11 

01/10111 

01/10/11 

01/11/11 

01/11/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Review draft interrogatories (0.3) and document 
requests (l.ll . 

CR Meet with Fisher and Cooperman re: production 
of ESI (.6); revise document requests regarding 
ESI.(1.9). 

KLC Office conference with Rast and Fisher re: 
document requests (0.6); correspondence to 
Rast re: same (0.3J; revise same document 

• requests [1.3); correspondence with Fisher and 
Seidel re: 3018 motions (0.2); review responses to 
same motions re: Smurfit (1.1); correspondence 
with Fisher and Seidel re: same [0.2). 

E.F. Teleconference with Macksoud (KlNF) regarding 
3018 motion (.2); review document requests and 
interrogatories served by NS bondholders (.8); e-
mails with Shattuck regarding e-discovery issues 
(.2); e-mail to Seidel regarding retention of 
Canadian counsel [.1); meet with Cooperman to 
prepare for Rule 26f conference and discuss 
discovery strategy (1.5). 

BNS Review noteholder motion for temporary 
allowance of claims (.4); office conference with 
Cooperman re: revisions to document requests 
and interrogatories [.7). 

Tax I.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.bntzeLcom 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Hours 

1.40 

2.50 

3.70 

2.80 

1.10 

01/11/11 . CR Telephone conference with Cooperman re 0.20 
revised document requests; correspondence 

01/11/11 

with Cooperman re:same. 

KlC Correspondence with Rast re: discovery revisions 
(0.1); telephone call with Rast re: same [0.1); 

3.50 

, 



BUTZE L LONG Tax I.D. No:· 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite toO 150 West Jefferson 
a proff;lssionaJ corporation Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 3I3 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF February 9,2011 :. 

GENERAL MOTORS CORPORAnON 
Invoice No. 8492122 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
[Privileged and Confldentiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 
revise same discovery requests [0.2); 
correspondence to Noteholders and Trustee re: 
same (O.I); correspondence from.. Noteholders 
re: discovery (O.I); review same discovery lOA); 
office conference with Seidel re: same (0.7); 
office conference with Fisher re: preparation for 
26F conference and strategy [1.5); 
correspondence from Fisher re: 3018 motion 
(0.1); correspondence from Fisher and Shattuck 
re: scheduling {0.2]. 

01/11 /11 SAS Teleconference with D. Bach (Xact Data 0040 
Discovery) relative to standard metadata (0.3); 
correspondence with K. Cooperman, C. Rast, 
and E. Fisher re same (O.l). 

01/12/11 E.F. Review potential ESI protocols for meet-and- 0.50 
confer about discovery. 

01/12/11 E.F. Confer with Cooperman, Shattuck and Rast 2.60 
regarding e-discovery strategy issues (1.5); 
confer with Cooperman concerning discovery 
issues (.7); review ESI protocols for Rule 26 
conference (A). 

01/12/11 CR Review (004) and revise RFP to send to vendors to 2.70 
process ESI (.5); call with Eric Fisher, Kalie 
Cooperman and Stephanie Shattuck to discuss 
strategy for Rule 26(f) meet and confer (1.5); 
review metadata materials re: same [.3). 

01/12/11 KlC Draft agenda re: discovery meeting (304); review 8.30 
correspondence from Shattuck re: electronic 
discovery (l.2); review federal rules re; discovery 



BUTZEL LONG 
AT •. ORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profe~~jonal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMIlTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
{Privileged and Confidentiallnformallon} 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr Narrative Description 
(0.8); telephone call with Shattuck and Rast re: 
electronic discovery (1.5); conference with Fisher 
re: discovery issues (0.7); correspondence to Akin 
and Greenberg confirming meeting (O.l); 
correspondence to Shattuck and Rast re: 
discovery vendor conflict check (0.3); meeting 
with Boneau re: joint defense (0.2); 
correspondence to Boneau re: same (0.1). 

Tax ID. No 

Suite 100 150 Westlefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butul.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

01/12/11 MCB Meeting with K. Cooperman to discuss research 0.80 
re: joint defense (.2); review e-mails re same (.2); 
research on Westlaw re joint defense agreement 
(.4J. 

01/12/11 SAS Prepare preliminary documents for attorney 2.00 
review for e-discovery conference cal! (.5); 
teleconference with E. Fisher, Katie Cooperman, 
and C. Rast re:e-discovery strategy issues (1,.5). 

01/13/11 E.F. Review agenda for discovery meeting with 0040 
Greenberg and Akin (.2); e-mails with 
Cooperman and Seidel regarding same (.2). 

01/13/11 E:F. Revise agenda for discovery meeting (.3); confer 3.10 
with Cooperman regarding same (.3); meet with 
Cooperman and Seidel to prepare for discovery 
meeting (.8); call with Cooperman and 
Macksoud (KLNF) regarding status of NS 
objection [.5); confer with Cooperman' 
regarding strategy for responding to 3018 
motions (A); analyze discovery requests to 
prepare objections to same {.9J. 

01 /13/11 BNS Conference with K. Cooperman and E. Fisher 0.80 



BUTZE.L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

CJ professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxI.D.No: 

Suite 100 1.50 West Jefi'e[Son 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

regarding preparation for meeting with Nova 
Scotia lawyers on discovery. 

01/13/11 KLC Telephone call with L. Macksould (KLNF) and 8040 
Fisher re: discovery from Noteholders (.5); office 
conference with Fisher and Seidel re: discovery 
meeting preparation (0.8); revise agenda lOA); 
discuss same with Rsher [0.3}; review litigation 

. hold letterre: ESI protocol (0.9); correspondence 
with Fisher re: same (0.1); draft litigation hold 
letter (2.8); confer with Fisher re: response to 3018 
motions (004); correspondence to Akin and 
Greenberg re: agenda (0.2); correspondence 
with Macksoud re: committee list (0.1); review 
same list (0.3); review cases re: joint defense 
agreement (1.2); meet with Boneau re: same 
(0.:4). 

01/13/11 MCB Review cases re jOint defense agreement (1.4); 5.50 
research re discovery from committee members 
(3.7); meeting with K. Cooperman re joint 
defense research (A). 

01/13/11 . SAS Review case caption information and 0040 
correspondence to vendor re: conflict check re: 
e-discovery processing. 

01/14/11 E.F. Review memorandum regarding litigation hold 4.80 
(.6); meet with Cooperman regarding same [.2); 
meet with Greenberg and Akin to define scope 
of discovery [2.0); follow-up meeting with 
Cooperman to discuss same [A); draft e-mail 
memorandum to Committee [.8); e-mail with 
Rast and Shattuck regarding GMNS e-discovery 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORKEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporotion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Conlidentiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxI-D.NQ 

Suire lOO 150WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 700() F: 313 225 7080 
www.butll!l.com 

February 9, 2011 

. Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

concerns [.3); review Noteholder interrogatories 
and document requests (.5). 

01/14/11 RMA Discuss discovery dispute issues with Cooperman 0.80 
(0.6); correspondence to Cooperman re: same 

, (0.2). 

01/14/11 BNS Conference with K. Cooperman regarding 0.40 
meeting regarding discovery issues (.3); review 
draft e-mail to committee regarding same (.1). 

01/14/11 CR Email from Shattuck re RFP for eDiscovery 1.70 
vendors (.2): complete revisions to RFP (1.3): 
correspondence with Fisher fe: electronic 
discovery (0.2). 

-01/14/11 KLC Prepare for discovery meeting (0.5); attend 8.70 
meeting with Fisher, Greenberg and Akin (2); 
discuss same with Fisher (.4); discuss same with 
Seidel (0.3); revise litigation hold memo (1.8): 
discuss same with Fisher (0.2): draft leIter re: 
discovery requests (1.2); correspondence with FTI 
re: swaps (0.2): correspondence from Rast and 
Shattuck re: discovery vendors (0.3): research re: 
committee member discovery (1.2); discuss 
discovery dispute issues with Alter (0.6). 

01/15/11 E.F. E-mails with Cooperman regarding scope of 0.60 
discovery (.2); review notes from meeting with 
Greenberg and Akin regarding same (.2); e-mails 
with Rast regarding conduct of electronic 
discovery in Nova Scotia case (.2). 

01/15/11 KLC Correspondence with Fisher re: letter concerning 0.50 
document requests: research hedge fund 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

o profe$sional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Conlidentiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxLD.No· 

SuiteH)O J50WestJeffe~on 
Detroi~ Michigan 48226 

T:3132251000 F:31322570&!} 
www.blttzd.com 

February 9. 20 I I 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

inequitable conduct. 

01/17/11 KLC Correspondence with J. Santambrogio (FTI) re: 0.50 
swap analysis; review same analysis. 

01/18/11 E.F. Review document requests [A) and meeting 2.00 
notes to narrow and refine requests [.8); meet 
with Cooperman regarding preparation of letter 
regarding same (.7); e-mail with Macksoud 
(KLNF) regarding discovery issues (.I). 

01/18/11 BNS Telephone conference with S. Karotkin and M. 0.20 
Meises [WGM) regarding response to NS holders' 
3018 motion. 

01/18/11 CR Review response from Precision re RFP (0.7); 1.80 
email to Eric Fisher and Katie Cooperman re 
comments on RFP [.2); revise RFP (0.8) and email 
same to Stephanie Shatluck[O.I). 

01/18/11 KLC Office conference with Fisher re: letler 11.60 
memOrializing discovery requests (0.7); draft 
same letter (5.7); revise same letter (104); analyze 
Smurfit brief re: duplicative claim (I. I ); review 
case re: committee discovery [0.6); review cases 
re: common interest (0.7); review article fe: 
hedge fund inequitable conduct [0.6); office 
conference with Boneau re: privilege research 
assignment (0.5): correspondence with Rast re: 
discovery vendor proposal (0.2); 
correspondence from Shattuckre: same (0.1). 

01/18/11 MCB Meeting with K. Cooperman to discuss privilege 4.90 
research (.5): research same re: committee 
deliberations (3.3): research re committee 



!', 

BUTZE L LONG TaxlD,No' 
ATTORNEYS • '" 0 COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 15!> WestJefferson 
C1 professional -corporation Detroit,. Michigan4S226 

T:313225700n F:3B2251080 
www:botzeLcom 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMittEE OF February 9, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

InvoiceNo.8492122 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours ., 
immunity from civilliabilily (A); review Colliers on 
Bankruptcy re same (.7). 

01/18/11 SAS Revise e-discovery RFP; correspondence to 0.50 
vendors re: same. 

01/19/11 E.F. Meet with Cooperman to review letter narrowing 3.80 
scope of discovery requests (2.8); call with 
Macksoud (KLNF) and Cooperman conceming 
collection of responsive documents iA); meet 
with Boneau and Cooperman conceming work 
product and other privilege issues (.6). 

01/19/11 BNS Conference with K. Cooperman regarding BR 0.90 
3018 motion (.3); conference with K. Cooperman 
regarding discovery issues {.6}. 

01/19/11 KLC Office conference with Boneau and Fisher re: 11.40 
committee privilege research (0.6); review same 
cases (1.4); review Smurfit brief re: duplicative 
claim (0.4); prepare list of topics re: Committee 

. discovery (0.7); office conference with Rsher re: 
discovery letter {2.8}; telephone call with Fisher 
and Macksoud (KLNF) re: discovery from 
Committee (004); revise discovery letter (3.5); 
correspondence with KLNF re: Commillee 
bylaws (0.1); skim same bylaws (0.2); review 
article re: hedge fund conduct lOA); conferwilh 
Seidel re: 3018 motions (0.3) and discovery issues 
(0.6). 

01/19/11 MCB Meeting with K. Cooperman and Fisher to discuss 6.20 
research re work-product doctrine (.6); research 
same in NY Practice (304) and in secondary 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS'ELORS 

a professiona' corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformatlon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 
. RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax I.D. No:· 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffe:rsno 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F: 313 22S 7080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Q9!!:t Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

source re same (2.2). 

01/20/11 RS Office conference with K. Cooperman re: hedge 0.20 
fund conduct. 

01/20/1l E.F. Revise discovery letter to Noteholders p): review 1.60 
memorandum to Committee regarding 3018 
motion [.2); correspondence with Cooperman 
regarding NS discovery issues (.2); confer with 
Seidel re: status of same (0.2). 

01 /20/11 BNS Conference with E. Fisher regarding status of 0.20 
discovery. 

01/20/11 CR Correspondence with Stephanie Shattuck re 0.70 
litigation hold policy (.2); correspondence from 
Miller re same [.2); telephone qmference with 
Millerre same (.3). 

01/20/11 KLC Revise discovery letter (1.4); office conference 6.90 
with Sidorsky re: hedge fund conduct (0.2); 
review Committee bylaws re: confidentiality 
(0.8); review Noteholders 3018 motion (1.2); 
review Trustee's 3018 motion (Ll); draft response 
to same 3018 motions! 1.7); correspondence 
with Fisher re: discovery issues (O.2); review 
companies' act re: same (0.2). 

01/20/ll MCB Continue to research work-product doctrine in 3.60 
secondary sources. 

01/20/11 JAD Drafllitigation hold policy re: Nova Scotia. 0040 

01/21/11 RS Review Committee's amended objection (l.I) 1.70 
and new GM response (0.6). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

C1 proFessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION. 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenllallnformallon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

Date 

01/21/11 

01/,21/11 

01/21/11 

01/21/11 

01/21/11 

01/21 !l1 

01/21/11 

01/22/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

E.F. 

BNS 

CR 

KLC 

MCB 

JAD 

SAS 

RS 

Narrative Description 

Meet with Cooperman and Seidel regarding 
discovery issues [1.1); e-mails with Akin and 
Greenberg regarding same (.2); revise letter to 
Noteholders concerning objections to discovery 
requests (1.6); review research regarding non­
attorney work product (.3). 

Conference with E. Fisher and K. Coopennnan to 
review letter to noteholders regarding discovery 
(1.1); follow-up with K. Coopennnan regarding STN 
stipulation [.3}; e-mail to committee regarding 
position on BR 3018[a)(.3}. 

Revise litigation hold letter (0.2) and email 
Jennifer Dukarski re: same {.1 }; review vendor 
responses to RFPs for eDiscovery [1.3}. 

Office conference with Rsher and Seidel re; 
discovery letter (1.1); revise same letter (4.4); 
correspondence from Akin re: same (OJ); 
correspondence with accounting re: Nova 
Scotia timekeepers [0.2}; review internal litigation 
hold [0.5}; correspondence with Rsher re: same 
(OJ); discuss STN stipulation with Seidel (0.3). 

E-mail to E. Fisher and K. Cooperman re research 
[.2); review cases cited by secondary sources 
(4.9). 

Revise litigation hold policy re: Nova Scotia. 

Analyze vendor RFP in preparation for selection 
of e-discovery vendor. 

Review trustee response to Nova Scolia 

TaxLD.NG; 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroi~ Michigan 48226 

...-:3[32257600 F:3132257080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

3.20 

1.70 

1.60 

6.70 

5.10 

0.30 

1.20 

1.30 



BUTZE.L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporalion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS, COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confldentiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxI.D. No 

. Suite 100 150WcstJeffeJson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 700() F:313 225 7080 
WW1'f' .hutzel.com 

February 9, 20 11 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

objection. 

01/22/11 KLC Revise discovery letter (1.7); correspondence to 1.80 
Fisher re: same (0.1). 

01/23/11 E.F. Review e-mails regarding 3018 motion (.2); e-mail 1.30 
with Cooperman regarding discovery responses 
(.2); review letter to Noteholders (0.6) and Trustee 
regarding objections to discovery responses (.3). 

01/23/11 SAS Analyze e-discovery vendor RFP's in preparation 1.90 
for determination of capabilities for processing e­
discovery. 

01/24/11 E.F. Review memorandum from Shattuck regarding 1.30 
e-discovery issues (.2); meet with Cooperman 
regarding Nova Scotia action items (.9); revise 
discovery letter to Akin and Greenberg [.2). 

01/24/11 KLC Office conference with Fisher re: Nova Scotia 9.80 
action items (0.9); correspondence to Akin and 
Greenberg re: discovery letter (a. 1 ); 
correspondence with Fisher re: Canadian 
counsel (0.1); draft statement responding to 
Bankruptcy Rule 3018(a) motions (2.6); draft 
committee interview questions re: discovery 
[3.1); analyze Smurfit docket re: ULC claim case 
history [2.1 ); analyze Bowater docket re: same 
[1.8); general research re: non-party govemment. 
discovery (0.5); review Shattuck analysis re: 
document database (0.2); correspondence with 
Shattuck and Rast re: same (0.1); 
correspondence re: Morgan Stanley 3018 joinder 
(0.1). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

o pTofessional carporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216-0007 
. (Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICE.S posted through January 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax LD. No' 

Suite Ion lSOWestJeffer.son 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.bllad.wm 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No, 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

01/24/11 MCB Review K. Cooperman's e-mail re subpoena to 6AO 
non-party (.2); begin drafting memo fe work-
product doctrine (3.8); review cases re work-
product doctrine (2A). 

01/24/11 SAS Draft memo re: analysis of e-cliscovery vendor lAO 
RFP's. 

01/25/11 RS Review response of noteholders to Committee's 3.90 
objection (1.5); office conference with K. 
Cooperman regarding equitable subordination 
issues (1.2): conffnued review of response of 
note holders to Committee's objection (1.2). 

01/25/11 CR Draft and send notice to vendors submitting RFPs 0.30 
for ESI work. 

01/25/11 KLC Office conference with Sidorsky re: inequitable 6.30 
conduct (l.5); review Bowater post-trio I letter 
(1.1); correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: 
same (0.2); revise committee interview questions 
(2A); correspondence to Tedesco re: non-party 
govemment discovery (0.2); discusssamewilh 
Tedesco (0.7); discuss same with Boneau (0.2). 

01/25/11 MCB Research work-product protection of non- 8.10 
attorney communicaffons (7.9); call with K. 
Cooperman to discuss serving d non-party 
govemment organization (.2}. 

01/25/ll LT Discussion with Cooperman regarding research 0.90 
assignment on the issuance of a subpoena upon 
o non party governmental agency [0.7); review 
article re: some [0.2). 



BUTZEL LONG TaxI.D.No 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite ~OO 150 West Jefferson 
13 professional corporation Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T:313225700G F:31322S7080 
www.butzel.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF February 9. 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8492122 
~" 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Oate Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

01/26/11 RS Complete analysis of noteholder response to 3.10 
Committee's objection (1.5); research regarding 
equitable subordination issues (1.6). 

01/26/11 E.F. Review 3018 filing (.3); review memorandum to 0.70 
Committee regarding document production (A). 

01/26/11 BNS Review draft response to NS motions for 1.70 
temporary allowance of claims order BR3018{a) 
(.6); follow-up with WG&M regarding same (.2); 
discuss same with K. Cooperman {.9}. 

OJ/2M11 CR Draft and send notice to RFP responders re 0.30 
selection of e-discovery provider (.3). 

01/26/11 KlC Revise response to 3018 motions (5.9); discuss 9.00 
same with Seidel (0.9); correspondence to WGM 
re: same (0.2); telephone call from Karotkin 
(WGM) re: same (0.1); correspondence with 
Fisher and Seidel re: same (0.2); analyze number 
of claims re: 3018 motions (004); correspondence 
to WGM re: same (0.1); office conference with 
Capria re: Nova Scotia litigation status (0.6); 
correspondence with Macksoud {KLNF} re: 
discovery from past members (0.3); 
correspondence with Fisher re: approach to 
same (0.3). 

01/26/11 MCB Continued research re work-product protection 7.90 
of non-Iaywer communications (2.6); e-mail 
correspondence to E. Fisher and K. Cooperman 
re: same (.6); shepardize same cases (1.9); 
continue to draft memorandum re: same (2.8). 



BUTZEL, LONG Taxl.D. No 
ATTORNEYS A " D .couNSELORS 

Suite 100 150 Wcstlefferson 
a professjonal corporation Deiroit,. Michigan 48226 

T, 313 2251000 F, 313 2257080 
www.bulzd.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF February 9, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8492122 ,. 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

01/26/11 LT Research regarding the enforcement of a 0.50 
subpoena for documents from a non party 
governmental agency. 

01/26/11 FJC Office conference with K. Cooperman re issues 0.90 
pertaining to upcoming discovery and status of 
suif {.6J; research re electronic filing of response 
to multiple motions (.3J. 

01/27/11 RS Office conference with E. Fisher and K. 1.00 
Cooperman regarding equitable subordination 
issues. 

01/27/11 . E.F. Review 3018 responsive filing (AJ;e-maiis with 2.10 
Cooperman regarding discovery issues (AJ; 
review correspondence from Chapman {AkinJ. 
regarding discovery disputes {.3J; meet with 
Sidorsky and Cooperman regarding equitable 
subordinaiion {1 J. 

01/27/ll KLC Correspondence from M. Williams [GDC] re: 3018 4.90 
response comments [0.2J; revise 3018 response 
per same comments (1.3); revise same response 
per additional joinders filed (1.3J; 
correspondence with Seidel re: same (0.3J; 
correspondence from M. Meises (WGMJ re: draft 
opposition (0.1 J; discuss same with Meises (0.1 J; 
review same opposition (0.7); draft letter to 
Judge Gerber fe: response (0.2); file response 
(0.3J; correspondence with EPIQ re: service of 
response (0.2J; correspondence with Caprio re: 
filing (0.2J. 

01/27/11 KLC Office conference with Fisher and Sidorsky fe: 1.00 



BUTZE.L LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a ptofessional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

01/27/11 

01/27/11 

01/27/11 

01/28/11 

01/28/11 

01/28/11 

01/28/11 

01/28/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr Narrative Description 
equitable subordinatron. 

KLC Correspondence from Chapman (Akin) re: 
discovery letter (0.1); review same letter (0.5); 
correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(0.1 ). 

MCB Continue to draft memorandum re: work 
product (2.3); review same memorandum (.8). 

LT Research regarding subpoenas to non party 
governmental agencies under the CFR. 

RS Review report of special advisor to Bowater 
Canada. 

E.F. Discuss discovery letter from Akin with 
Cooperman (004) and revise response in 
connection with same (0.7). 

BNS Review WG&M objection to NS BR3018 motion. 

KLC Draft response to Akin letter (2.7); discuss same 
with 'Fisher (OA); office conference with Boneau 
re: non party discovery (O.3); review Bowater 
special report re: ULC claims (1.3). 

MCB Review case re fee committee and work- ' 
product doctrine (.8); finalize memorandum re: 
work product (1); email same to E. Fisher and K. 
Cooperman [.1); meeting with K, Cooperman to 
discuss non-party discovery (A); review article re 
serving federal agency with a subpoena (.3); 
summarize cases re joint defense agreements 
(2.3), 

TrocLD.No· 

Suite 100 150 W~stJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:31322510&O 
www.butul.com 

February 9. 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

0.70 

3.10 

1.70 

1.30 

1.10 

0.30 

4.70 

4.70 

, . 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corp9Tation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

Date 

01/28/11 

01/29/11 

01/30/11 

01/30/ll 

01/30/11 

01/30/11 

01/31/ll 

·01/31/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

FJC 

LT 

E.F. 

KlC 

KLC 

LT 

RS 

E.F. 

Narrative Description 

Prepare image of affidavit of service for 
electronic filing for 3018 response (.1); 
electronically file affidavit of service (.3J; e-mails 
to K. Cooperman re same (.1). 

Research regarding subpoenas to non party 
agency in various circuits (.8); drafting memo re: 
same (1.3J. 

Prepare memorandum to Committee 
concerning discoverability of certain information 
(1.0J; review results of research regarding work 
product issue (.3). 

Correspondence from Finger (GTI re: discovery 
leiter (0.1); review same leiter (0.9J; 
correspondence with Akin and Greenberg re: 
same (O.1J. 

Continue review of unsealed Bowater report re: 
ULCclaims. 

Rnalize memo regarding procedure and options 
to enforce subpoena issued upon· a non party 
governmental agency. 

Review Aurelius v. GM statement of claim. 

Meet with Cooperman regarding discovery 
issues and collection of responsive information 
(lJ; revise letter regarding discovery issues (1.1J; 
analyze reply regarding 3018 mOTIon (.5J; e-mails 
to Seidel and Cooperman regarding same (.1); 
review e-mails to Committee and former 
Committee members regarding collection of 

Tax In. No_: 

SUite 100 150WestJeff'etson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 2251000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butxeteom 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Hours 

0.50 

2.10 

1.30 

1.10 

2.10 

1.20 

0.80 

3.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

C1 professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax I.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West Jcfierson 
Detroit, Michigan 4&226 

T: 313 2251000 F: 313 2251080 
www.butzd.cQm 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492122 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

documents (A); e-mails with Cooperman 
regarding inquiries from Committee members 
concerning discovery (.1); review results of 
research regarding non-attorney work product 
(.3). 

01/31/11 BNS Review NS frustee response to BR3018 motion 0040 
(.3); review K. Cooperman e-mail to Committee 
members re: discovery and committee responses 
( .1). 

01/31/11 DJD Review Pleadings to prepare for conference call 1.70 
with E. Fisher, K. Cooperman, and D. Orlandoni 
regarding case background and forthcoming 
case assignments. 

01/31/11 DVO Review filings in preparation for intemal 0.90 
conference call to discuss discovery/litigation 
strategy. 

01/31/11 KLC Revise document requests to New GM (4.6): 12.40 
office conference with Rsher re: discovery issues 
and data collection (1); revise Committee 
questionnaire (0.6); correspondence to 
Committee re: same (0.2); correspondence to 
former members re: same and liligation holds 
(0.7); correspondehce from former members re: 
same (0.2); draft response letter to Greenberg 
and Akin (4.2); correspondence with Fisher re: 
same (0.2); meeting with Boneau to discuss 
research aSSignments (0.9). 

01/31/11 MCB Review Tedesco memo re serving a subpoena 4.30 
on a non-party government entity (.3); meeting 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS ANo COUNSELORS 

a prOfft55ionai corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 0001 41216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 
. RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr Narrative Description 
with K. Cooperman to discuss new research 
assignments (.9); review cases re: discovery of 
joint defense agreement (3.1). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax:LD. No: 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 ZZS 7000 F; 313225 708G 
www.butzel.eom 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 84nl22 

133,166.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a p.ofessionaf corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0008 
(Privileged and Confidenliallhformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 
RE: DEFENDING FEE APPLICATIONS 

Associate 

Tax tD.No 

Suite lOG 150 West Jefferson 
Detl'Oit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.hutzel.com 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492123 

Total 

Katie l. Cooperman 
Total For Associate 

1.90 hours at $425.00 $807.50 
$807.50 1.90 

Current Fees: 807.50 
Current Disbursements: 1.68 
Total Current Invoice: 809.18 
Total Balance Due: $809.18 



BUTZEL LONG 
ArTORNEYS AND COUNSEL.ORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0008 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformotion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 

Date 

01/03/11 

01/04/11 

RE: DEFENDING FEE APPUCATIONS 

:rkQr N arrafive Description 

KLC Review order re: fees on fees; telephone call 
with C. Andres (GK) re: same. 

KLC Review third interim fee application 
correspondence with fee examiner in 
preparation for cali concerning fees on fees 
(1.2); telephone call with C. Andres (GK) re: 
same (0.2); correspondence with Fisher and 
Seidel re: same (0.2). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax l.D. No 

Suite 100 lSi) West Jeffe~on 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T: 313 225 moo F: 313 225 708() 
www.butzc1.com 

February 9,2011 

Invoice No. 8492123 

0.30 

1.60 

807.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Accou nt Number 000 141216'()0 10 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31,2011 
RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 0.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.20 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 3.00 hours at 
Total For Associate 3.00 

Current Fees: 
Less 50% Fee Adjustment: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

ToxiD_ No ~ 

Suite 100 150 West JeffeISOn 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3I32257000 F:31322S70S0 
www.butzel.tcm 

February 9, 2011 

Invoice No. 8492124 

$750.00 $150.00 
$150.00 

$425.00 $1,275.00 
$1.275.00 

1,425.00 
(712.50) 

48.95 
761.45 

$761.45 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS-EL.ORS. 

a professionoi corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-001 0 

(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through January 31, 2011 

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

01/13/11 KLC Revise December proformas re: monthly fee 
statement. 

01/24/11 KLC Draft December monthly fee statement. 

01/25/11 KLC Revise December monthly fee statement. 

01/26/11 KLC Revise December monthly fee statement .. 

01/27/11 KLC Revise December monthly fee statement; 
correspondence to Seidel re: same. 

01/28/11 BNS Review BL December fee statement. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax ID.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigan4S226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.butzel.com 

February 9,2011 

Invoice N.o. 8492124 

Hours 

0.90 

0.90 

0.40 

0.30 

0.50 

0.20 

1.425.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prOfBti:i;ongl corporotl_on 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-0001 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28. 2011 
RE: GENERAL ADVICE 

[Tlmekee: 
Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.70 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 0.30 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 1.00 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 0.20 hours at 
Total For Associate 0.20 

Current Fees: 
Current bisburSements: 
Tofal Curreht Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

r 

TaxlD.No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jeffemm 
De1roit, Mich;gan 48226 

T,3132257000 F,31322,7080 
www.batzel.mm. 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 84949~8 

Tot:1 . 

$575.00 $402.50 
$750W $225.00 

$627.50 

$425.00 $85.00 
$85.00 

. 
712.50 "" . 0.00 
712.50 

5712.50 

I 
I 

"' I 
I 

I 

i 

\ 



I 

BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prole5s;onal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account·Number: 000141216-0001 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posfed through February 28, 2011 

Date 

02/l1/11 

02/24/11 

02/25/11 

02/25/11 

RE: GENERAL ADVICE 
Tkpr 

BNS 

E.F. 

EF. 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Telephone conference with bondholder 
regarding voting information. 

Review e-mail from Mayer (KlNF) regarding MLC. 

Review correspondence from Mayer (KlNF) 
regarding GUC Trust revisions (.1); review 
documents conceming same (.2); review 
correspondences from Mayer concerning MLC 
tax update /.2). 

Correspondence from Mayer (KlNF) re: GUC trust 
revisiol)s; review same. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxLD. No· 

SuitelOO lSOWestJeffCISOn 
Detroit, Mic;higan 43226 

T,31322S1OO0 F,3132257080 
www.butzei.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494938 

Hours 

·0.30 

0.20 

0.50 

0.20 

712.50 

I 
I . ! 

I 
! 

I 



i 
I· 

I 
BUT Z E L LO N G 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Q professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 00014121 6-0005 
(PrivUeged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 . 
RE: BUrzEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

~mekee~er 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

11>xID.No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jeffemon 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T,31322S7000 F,31322S7080 
www.outzel.com 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 8494939 

6.772.00 
171.30 

6.943.30 
$6,943.30 

r 

I 
I 
I 

I 
r 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional c.orporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confidenliallnforrnafion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28. 2011 

RE: BUIZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 
Date 

02/01 III 

02/02/11 

02/1O/U 

02/11/11 

02/14/11 . 

02/15/11 

02/15/11 

02/15/11 

02/16/U 

02/18/11 

Tkpr 

FJC 

KLC 

FJC 

. FJC 

KLC 

BNS 

KlC 

FJC 

KLC 

FJC 

Narrative Description 

E-mail to accounting with instructions on 
preparation of ASCII files of invoices for Fifth Fee 
Application (.2); research re revisions and 
addifions to timekeepers and matters (.3); review 
previous monthly invoices in preparation for Fifth 
Fee Application (.2). 

Draft fifth interim fee application. 

Begin review (0.8) and revisions (0.8) of ASCII files 
of invoices to be submitted to Bankruptcy Trustee 
in connection with Buizel Long's fifth Fee 

. Application. 

Continue review (0.8) and revision (0.7) of ASCII 
versions of invoices for submission to Bankruptcy 
Trustee in connection with Butzel's Fifth Fee 
Application. 

Draft March 201) budget; correspondence to 
Seidel re: same. 

Review K. Cooperman letter regarding monthly. 
budget. 

Correspondence to Fee Examiner re: March 
budget. 

Update set-up file of timekeepers for submission 
to Bankruptcy Trustee. 

Continue drafting fifth interim fee application. 

Complete revision of ASCII version of invoices in 

TaxlD_No: 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T:31322S 7()OO F: 313 225 7()8D 
www.butze:l.wm 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 8494939 . 

Hours 

0.70 

1.80 

1.60 

1.50 

0.20 

0.10 

0.10 

0.20 

3.30 

1.30 

;. 

i 

I 
I 
I 

I. 



I 
I 

BUTZEL LONG 
I 
I 

Tax1.D. No: I 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS I ~uiIe 100 lSO West Jeff.,.,.,. 

a professional c.orporallon DetroU. Micbi .... 48226 

r 
T.3132251000 F:3132251080 

mvw.bnb:el.eom 

I 
I 

i UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF March 8, 2011 

1 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

i Invoice No. 8494939 
L Account Number 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

RE; BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 
Date nmr· Narrative Description Hours 

preparation for submission of same to 
bankruptcy trustee in connection with Fee 
Appucation (.8); revise timekeeper lisling for 
ASCII "setup" file to be submitted to Bankruptcy 
Trustee for same (:5). 

02/21/11 KLC Revise fifth interim fee application. 1.10 

02/22111 KLC Office conference with Capria re: fifth interim 0.50 
fee application; correspondence with 
accounting re: same; revise fee application. . 

02/22/11 FJC Review chart sent from accounting re copying 0.50 
and printing charges, checking math of same 
(.2); e-mail to K. Cooperman re results (.1); office 
conference with Cooperman re changes to 
ASCII invoice files (2). 

02/23/11 BNS Review memorandum from C. Basler regarding 020 
new procedures for bill submission. 

02123/11 KLC Revise fifth interim fee application; 0.50 
correspondence to Seidel re: same; 
correspondence to Copria re: same. 

02/23/11 FJC Complete editing of ASCII invoice files to be 0.60 
submitted to bankruptcy trustee (2); create text 
version of exh ibit fo Fifth Fee Application I A). 

, 02/24/11 BNS . Review (0.3) and revise 10.3) Bulzel Long 5th fee 0.60 
, 

application. 

02/24/11 KlC Revise fifth interim fee application (1); 1.30 
correspondence with Seidel re: some (0.3). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COuNSELORS 

. . 
u.profsssionCll CQrporatir;ul 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0005 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Date . I!m!: 

02/24/11 F JC 

02/25/11 KLC 

02/25/11 F JC 

Narrative Description 

Begin preparation of ASCII version of Fifth Fee 
.Application for transmission to Bankruptcy 
Trustee. 

Correspondence to notice parties re: fifth fee 
application per app6cable guidelines. 

Transmit revised Timekeeper set-up file to Trustee 
via e-mail per instructio'ns r 1); final preparation 
of ASCII versions of Buizel invoices for submission 
to Trustee (.3); transmit same via e-mail (.1); 
prepare ASCII version of Bulzel Fifth Application 
for Fees and Disbursements (.3); prepare Acrobat 
.pdf] image of same (.3); transmit image and 
ASCII versions of Fee Application to Trustee via e­
ma~ (.1). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Tax I.D. No' 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroi~ Micbigan 48226 

T;3132257000 F;31322S7080. 
www.butzel.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494939 

Hours 

C).50 

0040 

1.20 

6.772.00 



BUTZEL. LONG 
A.TTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporatIon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000 J 4 J 216-0007 

Tax LD. No, 

SuitelOO lSOWestJeff"eISQJl 
Detroit. Michigan 4B226 

1':3132257000 F,3132257000 
www.butzeLeom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

(Privileged and Confideritiallnformation) . 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS" NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Shareholder 
Claudia Rast 1.50 hours at $400.00 $600.00 
Eric Fisher 36.20 hours at $575.00 $20,815.00 
Robert Sidorsky 14.20 hours at $625.00 $8,875.00 
Barry N. Seidel 14.30 hours at $750.00 $10,725.00 
Total For Shareholder 66.20 $41,015.00 

Associate 
Donald Orlan doni 31.70 hours at $275.00 $8,717.50 
David J. DeVine 9.70 hours at $300.00 $2,910.00 
Maria Caceres-Boneau 29.40 hours at $335.00 $9,849.00 . 
Katie L Cooperman 171.60 hours at $425.00 $72.930.00 
Total for Associate 242.40 $94,406.50 

Paralegal II 
. Alexis L Richards 1.70 hours at $165.00 $280.50 

. Total For Paralegal II ];70 $280.50 

Paralegal 
Stephanie A. Shattuck 22.40 hours at .$J80.00 $4,032.00 
Total For Paralegal 22.40. $4,032.00 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Caprio 1.90 hours at $270.00 $513.00 
Total for Paralegal II 1.90 $5J3.00 

I 
·1 , 
I 
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BUTlEL LONG 
A.TTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professiQnal c.orporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF . 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141 21 6-0007 
(Privileged and Confldenfiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

Current Fees: 
Current Disbursements: 

. Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax.LD.No 

Suite 100 1St) WestJeffmon 
DetToit. Michlgan 48226 

T: 313 22S 7000 F: 313 22S 7080 
www.butzeloC(lm 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

140,247.00 
31.167.09 

171AI4.09 
$171.414.09 

.. I 

( 



I 
BUTZEL LONG I 

Taxl.D.No: 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 .1SOWestJeft'erson 
a professional corporation Detroi~ Michigan 48226 

T,313215100I) F,31322S7080 
www.butze1ooQl 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF . March 8. 2011 

i 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION ·1 

I . Invoice No. 8494940 I I Account Number: 000141216-0007 I 

I· (Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

b2/01/11 RS Review Yellowstone decision regarding 2.40 I 
equitable subordination (.6); reviewTOUSA • I 

I decision regarding fraudulent conveyonce issues If 
(l.8). I I 1 

02/01 III .E.F. Meet with Coopermon to review discovery 4.00 I 
disputes (.9); review (~5) and revise letter to ~kin 

, 

and Greenberg rei discovery issues (.7); prepare 
for cal! I!I(ith Committee regarding status of NS 
objection and 3018 motion (A): participate in 
cali with Committee regarding same and 
regarding status of proceedings (A); e-mail 
correspondence with Cooperman regarding 
discovery from former Committee members (.2); 
confer with Cooperman, Orlandoni and DeVine 
regarding background and other issues (.B). 

. , 

02/01/11 BNS Review Goldman Sachs joinder with regard to BR 0.90 
3018 (a) motion [.1}; analyze recent cases 
bearing upon developments with regard to 
fraudulent transfer law (.8), 

02/01/1] BNS Attend committee phone call with E. Fisher and 0.40 
K. Cooperman regarding NS and JPM matters: 

02/01/11 DJD Analyze case materials [.7) and filings re: 4.50 
background (O.B); draft case time line outline to 
be used asreference going forward (.7); 
parlicipafe in conference call with E. Fisher, K. 
Cooperman, and D, Orlan doni regarding case 
background, applicable legal issues, and 
assignments going forward (.B); participate in 

i 

I 



BUTZEL LO·NG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216-0007 . 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Ilm! Narrative Description 

follow-up conference call with D. Ortandoni and 
K. Cooperman regarding same (l.5). 

02/01/11 DVO Reviewed certain case filings (1.1) and memos in 
preparation for strategy conference call with E. 
Fisher. K. Cooperman and D: DeVine (l.I); 
conference call with E. Fisher. K. Cooperman 
and D. DeVine re: case background and 

. assignments (.8); follow-up research concerning 
arguments raised by New GM (.6); continued 
strategy conference call with K. Cooperman 
and D. DeVine (1.5). 

02/01/11 KLC Office conference with Fisher re: discovery 
disputes (.9); revise discovery letter (4.1); prepare 
for committee call re: discoverY update (0.2); 
correspondence from committee members re:. 
discovery (.5); revise tracking chart re: discovery 
respo.nses (0.3); telephone call with Orlandoni, 
DeVine and Fisher re: Nova Scotia bqckground 

. for discovery work (0.8); telephone call with 
Orlan doni and DeVine re: same (1.S): participate 
in Committee call re: discovery and 3018 update 
((0.4); telephone call from former committee 
memberre: discovery (0.4); correspondence 
with Fisher re: same (0.1); correspondence to 
Akin and Greenberg re: discovery lefter (0.1 ) . 

. . 02/01/11 MCB Research re government affidavitto request 
documents (2.4); review L Tedesco memo re: 
same (.2); review sample L 11 (d) affidavits (.3). 

02/01 III F JG. Correspondence with R. Sidorsky re item to be 

TaxlD.No_ 

Suite100 150WcstJeffersoD 
Detroit. Miohigan 48226 

T,3132257000 F,313225708G 
www.bulZtLeom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

5.10 

9.30 

2.90 

0.70 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COIJNSELO·RS 

Q professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 . 
(Privileged and ConlidentiallnformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28,2011 
RE; GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA fiNANCE COMPANY 

Taxl.D~No: 

Suite 100 ISO Wes[Jefferson 
Dc<roit, Mkhigan 48226 

T, 313 22S 7000 F, 313 225 7080 
,yww.butze1.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours 

retrieved from bankruptcy court docket (.2); 
research re same (.4); retrieve image of same 
and forWard hard copy to Sidorsky (.1). 

02/02/11 RS Office conference with K. Cooperman regarding 0.70 
equitable subordination issues. 

02/02/11 EF. Meet with Cooperman regarding conference 0.50 
with Akin and Greenberg conceming discovery 
(.5). 

02/02/11 BNS Telephone conference with S. Karotkin (WGM) 0.50 
regarding BR30 18 !learing on 2/3 .. 

02/02/11 CR Review .emails from Stephanie Shattuck re 0040 
custodians for data collection (.2); office 
conference with Katie Cooperman re: same (.2). 

02/02/11 DVO Review of ULC Trustee's re~ponse to Committee's 1.50 
claims objection [.9); related research and notes 
to file (.6). 

02/02/11 KLCReview pleadings re: 3018 motions and . 5.40 
objections in preparation of hearing (004); 
correspondence with Greenberg and Akin re: 
discovery call (0.1); office conference with Fisher 
re: Greenberg and Akin conference (0.5); 
research obtaining document discovery from 

. Debtor (3.2); telephone call with Retter (KDW) re: 
discovery (0.2); discuss equitable subordination 
with Sidorsky (0.7); discuss discovery custodians 
with Rast (0.2); correspondence with Shattuck re: 
~ame (0.1). . 

, 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS.AND COUNSELO"RS 

a professional corporo1;on 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and ConHdentiallnformqHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

Date 

02/02/11 

02/03/11 

02/03/11 

02/03/11 

02/03/11 

02/03/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

MCB 

RS 

E.F. 

BNS 

·DVO 

KLC 

NarraHve Description 

Correspondence from K. Cooperman re: 
document request to debtor (.2); research cases 
(OA); and secondary sources re same (.7). 

Review memo regarding fraudulent conveyance 
. issues (.5); office conference with M. Boneciu 
regarding fraudulent conveyance research (.3); 
review cases regarding fraudulent conveyance . 
issues. (1.0). 

Revi€)w PI and revise New GM subpoena (A); 
meet and confer with Akin, Greenberg and 
Cooperman regarding revisions to document 
requests (.5); follow-up meeting with Cooperman 
to discuss same (A). 

Review pleadings in preparation for hearing on 
NS holders and NS Trustee BR3018 motions [2.8); 
attend same hearing before BJ Gerber (.5) • 

. Review New GM's response to Committee's 
claims objection (.8): drafted memo to file 
summarizing same [.5); reviewed certain relevant. 
cases re: same (.7). 

Telephone call with K. Martorana (GDC) re: 
discovery (0.2); update tracking chart re: same 
response (0.2); draft litigation hold letter re: non 
pdrties (1.3); revise subpoena schedule re: New 
GM (0.6); correspondence to Fisher re: same 
(0.1); telephone' call with Fisher. Greenberg and 
Akin re: discovery (0.5); revise discovery requests 
to noteholders(2.3); office conference with 

Tax J.D. No 

Suite 100 150 Wesr:Jetfemm 
Detroit, Miohigan 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F: 313 225 7080 
www.bul2el.eom 

March 8, 2011 

invoice No. 8494940 

Hours 

1.30 

1.80 

'2.00 

3.30 

2.00 

6.00 

I r 

I i I ; 
I 

I 
·1 , 

I 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF. 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOO0141216{)()()7 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 20] ] 

Date 

02/05/11 

02/06/11 

02/07/11 

02/07/11 

02/07/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr Narrative Description 

Bulzel data collection (0.1); revise schedule to 
New GM subpoena (004); correspondence with 
Fisherre: same (0.1). 

SAS Correspond with vendor relative intemal data 
acquisition (.2); analyze preliminary list of 
custodians and date information (.5); analyze 
search term list re: document collection (.3). 

E.F. Review {.2)and revise protocol for collection of 
responsive documents (. J); e-mail to Cooperman 
regarding same (.1j; review (.4) and revise 
schedule for New GM subpoena (.3); e-mail to 
Cooperman regarding same {.2J; review (.4) and 
revise document requests to Noteholders (.5); e-
mail to Cooperman regarding same (.2). 

RS Research regarding equitable subordination 
issues (I) and review of Enron decision (0.9). 

E.F. Meet with Cooperman regarding discovery 
requests and legal research regarding discovery 
'from Debtors (A); e-mails with Cooperman 
regarding document collection for Committee's 
production (.2); review'e-mails regarding 
Committee member's production of documents 
(.2): revise document requests,to GMNS~ trustee 
(1.0); review Bowaler report regarding ULCs [.4). 

KLC Correspondence from Fisher re: comments to 
amended requ~sts [0.1); revise amended 
document requests fo Nofeholders re: same 
(0.6); office conference with Fisher re: discovery 

Tax I.D.No 

Suite lOO ISO WestJeJferson 
Ddmit. Micbigan48226 

T:3132257000 F:31322S7080 
www.butzel..cam 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

1.00 

2040 

1.90 

2.20 

5.00 

I, 
I 

I 
I 
I' 

I 
I 
I 

I 

I 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a prokuional c.orporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION· 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and ConfideilHallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date IkQr Narrative Description 
and debtor research (A); meet with Boneau re: . 
.New GM subpoena (.2); draft amended . 
document requests to Trustee (2.8); 
correspo·ndence from counsel to PBGC re: 
discovery (0.2); update tracking chart re: 
discovery responses 10.2); correspondence from 
Fisher re: intemal data collection·{O.l); 
cor:respondence with Shattuck re: same (0.2); 
correspondence with counsel to UAW re: 
discovery (0.2). 

02/07/11. MCB Draft cover lefter to subpoena (.2); revise cover 

02/07/11 

02/08/11 

02/08/11 

02/08/11 

letter per k. Cooperman comments (.1); meeting 
with K. Cooperman to. discuss subpoena (.2); 
search for contested matter subpoena (.2); draft 
subpoena (.3). 

SAS Prepare search criteria list per attorney request 
for vendor search tool in preparation for 
upcoming Relativity review; exchange e­
correspondence re same. 

RS Research regarding fraudulent conveyance 
issues. 

E.F. Call with Committee members and Cooperman 
regarding collection of responsive documents 
(A); e-mails with Cooperman regarding 
discovery issues (A). 

CR ·Review email from Katie Cooperman re ESI and 
litigation hold (.1); participate in call to discuss 
next steps for internal collection of ESI c:nd from 

TaxLD.No 

Suite 100 150WestJelfersoD 
De!roi4 Michig;m 48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F,313 22S708~ 
www.butze1.l:Gm 

March.8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

1.00 

0.50 

0.30 

. 0.80 

0.80 

I 
I 
I 
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HUTZEL LONG 
AT TOR N E Y SAN D CO U N"S E LOR S 

a proFessional corporalion 

Tax I.D. No 

Suite 100 150 West JeifersoD 
Il$o;"Michlgan 48226 

T:3132257OOD F:3J322S70S0 
www..batzeJ.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF . March 8,2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141 216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformallon) . 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

02/08/11 

02/08/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr Narrative Description 

Committee members (.5); review email. 
exchanges re: same (.2). 

KlC . Draft responses to noteholders' interrogatories 
and document requests (1.4); revise amended 
document requests to noteholders (0.2); revise 
same to Nova Scotia trustee (0.2); 
correspondence to Akin and Greenberg re: 
same (0.1); telephone call with Shattuck re: 
discovery (004); correspondence with Fisher re: 
same (A); correspondence with Shattuck re: . 
same (0.2); telephone call with Macksould (KlNF) 

.. re: same (0.3); telephone call with Fisher and 
UCC members re: data collection (004); 
correspondence to Macksoud re: discovery 
parameters [0.3); correspondence with Meises 
(WGM) re: 3018 order (0.1); review same order 
(0.2); correspondence with former committee 
members re: discovery responses (0.6); 
correspondence with UAW re: discovery call 
(0.1); revise internal discovery parameter list (1.1). 

SAS Teleconference with K. Cooperman relative to 
internal document collection and production 
(A); e--correspondence with vendor (.3) and 
technical support re same (.3); teleconference 
with J. Wyatt and vendor relative to internal 
document collection and Relativity review set up 
(1.6); draft task list for internal team for upcoming 
document collection (.S); prepare user names 
and e-mail addresses for vendor for relativity 
credentials and access for Bufzel review team 

Invoice No. 8494940 

6.10 

4.00 



I 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNE,,(S A.ND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION· 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Conlldenliallnforrnafion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted throiJgh February 28. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

·TaxlD.No 

Suite 100 150 West ldCCISOIl 
Ddroi~ MichigIm 48226 . 

T,3132251000 F,3132251080 
www.butzel.com 

March 8. 201 1 

Invoice No. 8494940 

DafeTkpr Narrative Description Hours 

{.5}; prepare e-mail for team outlining Relativity 
access and technical support contact for set up 
of same {A}. 

02/09/1 1 RS Office conference with K. Cooperman and M. 0.50 
Boneau regarding ·discovery issues . 

. . 02/09/11 E.F. Call with FTI and Cooperman regarding 2.00 
. document production (.5); call with UAW and 
Cooperman regarding document collection {.5}; 
meeting with Cooperman n"garding discovery 
interviews with Committee members (.3); discuss 
same with Cooperman (.2) revise New GM 
subpoena {.3}; e-mail Akin and Greenberg 
regarding responses and objecTIon.s 1.2). 

02/09111 CR Review and respond to email from Don Miller re 0.20 
Litigation Hold. 

02/09/11 DJD Analyze Bowater special report {l.2}. complaint . 2.70 
. filed by noteholders commencing Nova ScoTIa 
proceeding (.5), and response to same (1). 

02/09/11' KLC Telephone call with Rsher and UAW counsel re: . 1 D. JO 
discovery requests (O.S); meeting with Rsher re: 
member discovery interviews (.3); discuss same 
with Rsher (0.2); review work- product memo 
. from Boneau (0.4); revise New GM subPoena 
(0.2) and schedule to same (0.4); telephone call 
with FTI and Rsher re: discovery {0.5}; 
correspondence to FTI re: same (D.5); meeting 
with Sidorsky and Boneau re: discovery (0.5); 
discovery call with former member lOA); update 

I 

t 
I 
I , 

! 

I 
I 

I 
I 

. t 





BUTZELLONG 
A T TOR N E Y SAN D C 0 U N S E LOR s· 

a profeujonaf c::orporgtion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(PrMleged arid Confidential Information) 

. PROFesSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

TaxLD.No 

Suite.lOO ISO WestJcffctson 
Dettoit. Michignn 48226 

T, 313 22S 7000 F: 313 22S 708D 
.www.hutzel.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

Tkpr Narrative Descrlptlon Hours 

discovery requests (5.3); telephone call with 
counsel to USW re: discovery follow up lOA); 
telephone call with K. Martorana (GDG) re: some 
(0.3); revise discovery response tracking chart re: 
same (004); telephone call with DENSO re: 
responsive discovery (004); correspondence with 
DENSO re: same (0.2); correspondence from 
Meises (WGM) re: revised 3018 order (0.1); review 
same order (0.2); correspondence with L. 

. Macksoud (KLNF) re: discovery objections and 
responses {0.2}; research verification requirement 
re: interrogatories (0.5); correspondence with 
Fisher re: same (0.1); correspondence with L. 
MaCksoud re: discovery production (0. J). 

02/10/11 MCB Review preservation notice (.2); review cases re 2.80 
fraudulent transfer (2.6). 

02/l0/11 SAS Analyze Kramer' Levin list for document collection 0.50 
(.3); correspond with K. Cooperman and 
coordinate vendor call re same (.2). 

02/11/11 RS Office conference with M. Boneau regarding 0.30 
fraudulent conveyance research. 

02/l J /1 J E.F. Review (.7) and revise. (.8) Commitfee objections 1.50 
and responses. 

02/11/11 BNS Telephone conference with D. Golden and P. OA'(} 
. Dublin (Akin) regarding possible resolution of 

trustee plan objection (.3); follow-up e-mail (.1). 

02/11/11 . CR' Review Stephanie Shattuck's status memo re . C).10 
data load (.1). 

I 

I 

'1 

I 
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BUTZ E L LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUN$ELO.RS 

Q profellional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATfON 

Account NumberOO0141 21 6-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

Date 

02/11/11 

D2/ll/11 

02/11/11 

. D2f]l /11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY. 
Tkpr 

DVO 

KLC 

MCB 

SAS 

Narrative Description 

Review Cooperman memo of relevant legal 
issues. 

Call with Shattuck re: discovery collection (0.2); 
revise discovery responses and objections (1.1); 
draft verification re: same (0.6); correspondence 
to Committee re: same (0.1 J; correspondence to 
former members re: same (Q.1); telephone calls 
to Caplin and Drysdale re: discovery requests 
{D.2l; revise member response tracking chart re: 
same (0.2); revise discovery parameter list (0.2): 
correspondence with Shattuck re: same (0.1); 
correspondence with L. Macksoud (KLNF) re: 
same (O.2); correspondence with FTI re: same 
(0.1); correspondence from IUE re: response 
revisions (D.l); revise responses and objections re: 
same comments (D.l); revise Canadian counsel 
retention application (1.8); revise same 
declaration (l). 

Review noteholders response to committee 
claims objection (3.1); meeting with R. Sidorsky to 
discuss research re reasonably equivalent value 
(.3); review cases to further equitable 
subordination argument (1.4). 

Teleconference with vendor relative to 
documents collection (.5); teleconference with 
K. Cooperman re same 1.2); prepare follow up e­
mail outlining bqth calls for team members (.2); 
draft coding instruction/protocol for upcoming 
Relativity review (.8). 

TaxLD.No 

Suite 100 150 West Jefferson. 
neoo;~ MicIrigan "226 

T,3132257000 F:31322S"7080 
mvw.butzeLcom 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

Hours 

0.80 

6.30 

4.80 

1.70 



BUT Zl L LONG Tax ID. No 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 ISO West letren;on 
a profss.5ionoJ corporat(on Detroi~ Michigan 48226 

T;3132257000 F;lI3225701W 
www.hutzer.eom 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMllTEE OF March 8, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

i Invoice No. 8494940 , 
Account Number 000141216-0007 I (Privileged and ConfidenJiallnformation) 

; PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description Hours ·1 

02/13/11 KLC Correspondence with Rsher re: discovery call 0.50 
with FTl;review Noteholders objecfion to Plan. 

02/13/11 MCB Research re reasonably equivalent vaiue. 3.10 

02/14/11 . BNS Conference with K. Cooperman regarding FTI 0040 
and KLNF document production. 

02/14/11 DVO Review e-mail correspondence coordinating 0.30 
upcoming document review. 

02/14/11". KlC Telephone call with KLNF and Xad re: discovery 7.10 
(0.8); telephone call with Caplin and Drysdale 

I (counsel to former member) re: discovery 
responses (0.5); telephone call with S. O'Neal I (Cleary) ~e: same (0.3); telephone call from ! 

. Retter (Kelley Drye) re: same (0.2); conference 
with Seidel re: FYI and KLNF document 
production (04); revise response tracking charhe: 
KDW update (O.?); correspondence with Gibson 
Dunn re: revisions to discovery responses (O.1); 
revise same responses to document requests 
(1.5); revise Canadian counsel retention 
application per Boneau revisions (J.8};meeting 
with Boneau re: same (0.2); telephone call with 
FYI re: discovery (0.3); correspondence with 
Babette (UAW counsel) re: responses to 
discovery (0.1); correspondence with Rsher and 
Seidel re: same [0.2). 

02/14/11 MCB Revise application for retention of Canadian 4.30. 
counsel to conform to certification and R. 
Sidorsky comments (A); revise dec/aration re: 

I 
! 
I 
I 
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BUTZE L LONG TaxLD.No 
ATTORNeyS AND COUNSEloa'S 

Strite 100 lSO west Jefl'e.r$()D 
a prOi6S$ional corporation D<troi~ Michigan 4822. 

T:313225 7000 F,3132257118() 
wmv.butzel.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF March 8, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

" 
Invoice No. 8494940 

Account Number 000 141216-0007 
(Privileged and Conlldenfiallnformatlon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 
same (.7); draft order re: same (A); draft notice 
of application for retention (A); meeting with K. 
Cooperman to discuss same (.2); review case 
law re reasonably equivalent value (2.2). 

02/15/l1 RS Review district court decision in TOUSA regarding 1.80 
fraudulent conveyance issues. 

02/15/11 E.F. Review e-mails regarding "document production '0.50 
issues. 

I 
02/15i11 BNS Review hews articies regarding NS objections to O~90 

I plan (.2); review Committee response regarding 
discovery requests (.7). 

I , 

I 
02/15/11 KLC Correspondence with Sidorsky re: retention (0.2); 6.70 I 

correspondence to Seidel re: responses and ! 
; [ , . objections to Noteholders' discovery requests 

(0.2); revise same objections (1.1); review DENSO 
correspondence re: discovery 1.0.9); telephone 
call with Shattuck and Xac! re: discovery (104); 
call with Shaftuck re: review. tagging. layout and 
protocol (0.5); correspondence with Xac! re: 
datcibase layout (0.3); telephone call with 
Macksoud (KLNFJ re: Trustee objection to plan 
(0.3); correspondence to Rsher and Seidel re: 
same (0.2); correspondence with S. O'Neal 
(Cleary) re: discovery (0.3); correspondence to 
Brosnick re: same (0.1); correspondence with 
Ceccotti (UAW) re: same (0.1); review 
documents re: Butzel production (1.1). 

02/15/1 J SAS Teleconference with K .. Cooperman and Xac! 2.40 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profe$sional corporatIon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMIITEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
i(Privileged and Confidenfiallnforrnation) 
I' PROFESSIONAL SERVICES· posted through February 28. 2011 
! . RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

01/16/11 

02/16/11 

Tkpr Narrative Description 
data Discovery re Relativity database layout 
details in preparation for upcoming review (1.4); 
teleconference with K. Cooperman re Relativity 
review. tagging. structural changes. and 
information for review protocol (.5); prepare e­
mail to coordinate team training' in relativity (.3); . 
correspondence to vendor re same (.2). 

RS Complete review ofTOUSA decision. 

BNS Conference with K. Cooperman regarding UCC 
response to interrogatories and document 
request [.6); telephone conference with T. Mayer 
(KlNF) regarding strategy regarding NS trustee 
plan objection (,2); analyze altemative litigation 
strategies (.6J. 

TaW. No 

Suite JOt) ISOWestJeffen;OD 
Detroit. Michigan 48226 

T:.31322S7000 F:'31322S7080 
wmy.bJrtzel.rom 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

1.70 

1.40 

02/16/11 DYO Review correspondence conceming document 0.50 
review database in preparation for upcoming 
document review. 

02/16/11 KLC Analyze Butzel document production . 9.80 
parameters to ensure reliability (6.2); telephone 
calls with Shattuck re: database set-up and 
structure (0.5); office conference with Seidel re: 
responses to NHS interrogatories and document 
requests (0.6); internal correspondence with . 
team re: scheduling (0.3); correspondence with 
Xact re: sorting of information (1.3); finalize 
objections to Noteholders' discovery requests 
[0.6); correspondence to Akin and'Greenberg 
re: same (0.1); correspondence from Finger 
(Greenberg) re: Noteholders objections (0.1); 

i 
I 

I , 
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BUT Z ELLa N G 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSILoas 

. Q profe-s$;oaal c.orporatlon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMIITEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date TIm!: Narralive Description 

correspondence from Chapman (AkinJ re: 
trustee's objections (0.1). 

02/16/11 MCB Review emails re document review (.2); review 
materials fe Relativity platform {.3}. 

02/16/11 SAS Teleconference with K. Cooperman re Relativity 
database set up and structural changes of same 
(.5); teleconference with Xact Data Discovery re 
same (1); Prepare review protocol for upcoming 
review in preparation for production (1.5); 
coordinate with vendor and technical support 

. for team Relativity credentials (.3); coordinate 
with vendor for review team training of Relativity 
database (.3). 

02/17/11 BNS Review NS holders responses to discovery (.8); 
review NS holders' plan objection (.7). 

TaxLD_No. 

Suite 100' ISO West Jefferson 
Dettoi~ Michfg;m. 48226 

T,31322S7000 F,3132251080 
www.bu1zeLcom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

0.50 

3.60 

1.50 

02/17/11 DYO. Preparation for training with document review 2.30 
sOffware vendor (.2); participation in same [.5); 
review discovery protocols for upcoming review 

. and production (1.6). 

02/17/11 KLC Review Butzel document proCludon for 14.30 
responsiveness and privilege {ll}; conference 
with Capria re: same (2); prepare (.6) and 
participate in 1.5) Relativity training re; Nova 
Scotia plotform; internal correspondence re: 
same (O.4J; discuss same with Shattock (O.l); 
follow up call with Xact re: training [0.4); . 
correspondence to Shattuck re: case. 
information for protocol {l.5J. 

l 



.. 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-OOO7 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28. 2011 

~ 

02117/11 

02/17/11 

02/17/ll 

02/17/11 

02/18/11 

02/l8/11 

02118/ll 

02/18/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Ik2!: 
MCB 

FJC 

SAS. 

RS 

EF. 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Prepare for (.6) and participate in (.51 Document 
. review training; reviewe-mails re document 
review (.2); review Relativity software for 
document review (.1 ). 

Prepare for (.6) and participate in (.51 Relativity 
Oatabase Training in preparation for reviewing 
documents. 

Te!ephone conferences v'lith K. Cooperman fa 
document produclion and privilege issues .. 

Prepare for (.6) and participate in (.5) vendor's 
Relativity /raining; teleconference with K. 
Cooperman re same (.I). 

Office conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
discovery issues 1.2); review revised retention 
application for Canadian counsel 1.3). 

Meet with Cooperman regarding procedures for 
document production (.5); review e-mails 
regarding privilege issues (A); review objection 
to confirmation filed by GMNS trustee (.8). 

Conference with K. Cooperman regarding· 
document production issues (A); review 
discovery and review produclion protocol 1.6); 
review Inteva documents 1.2); consider D. 
Gropper proposallA). 

KLC Office conference with Rsher re: document 
production strategy 10.5); conferwith Sidorsky re: 
same 1.2); review Butzei document production 

TaxI.D.No . . 

Suite 100 lSOWcstJcffersoD 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T:3132257000 F: 313225 7080 
www.blll:zel.c:om 

March 8. 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

Hours 

lAO 

1.10 

" .,,, 
V.4V 

1.20 

0.50 

]]0 

1.60 

14.50 

I 
I 

I 
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BUTZEL LONG Tax LD. No. 
ATTORNEYS ANt> COUNSELORS 

Suite 100 150 WestJeffemm 
a professional e.~l'poratlon Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T"J32257000 F"J32251080 
www.butzetcom 

. UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMIlTEE OF March 8, 2011 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8494940 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28,2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Date Tkpr Narrative DeScription Hours 

for responsiveness arid privilege (10.7); 
correspondence with Xad re: search criteria· 
(1.1); telephone call with DENSO re: production 
[0.2); discuss same with Xact (0.2); 
correspondence with Macksoud (KLNF) re 
document review procedures (0.3); draft same i 

procedures (0.9); confer with Seidel re: i 
document production issues (004); I I correspondence with Seidel re: .same (0.2). I , ! I. 

02/18/11 MCB Review e-mail re document review (.2); respond 0040 i 
to e-mail redocument review (.1); review e-mail I 

re retention of Canadian counsel (.1). I 
02/19/11 KLC Review Butzel document production for 11.10 I responsiveness and privilege (6.S); 

correspondence with Xad re: searching same 
(0.8); draft document review protocol re: initial 
document production (3.8). 

02/20/11 KLC Review Butzel document production for 9.80 
responsiveness and privilege [4.8); revise 
document review protocol re: initial document 
production (4.1); correspondence with Fisher re: 
privilege (0.4); correspondence to 'team (Caprio, 
Fisher, Shattuck, Boneau, Orlandoni and 
Richards) re: Monday meeting discussion 
materials (0.5) . 

02/21111 RS .Review GUC Trust Agreement (.6); e-mails to E. 1.50 
Fisherregdrding GUC Trust Agreement (.2); 
drafting and revision of issue coding list for 

. document review Pl. 



; 

i 
I 
I BUTZEL LONG 

ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(PrivUeged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES post!,!d through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tkpr Narrative Description 
. . 

02/21/11 E.F. Call with Cooperman and others regarding 
document production protocol (.6); review 
objection and responses of trustee and 
noteholder's (.5); review GUC trust 
correspondence (.1); meet with Cooperman 
regarding review of production set (A); meet 
with Cooperman regarding open discovery 
issues to address with noteholders' counsel (.5). 

02/21/11 DVO Review various materials sent.by K. Cooperman 
ahead of scheduled conference call to discuss 
do~ument review strategy (.9); participate in 
such conference call (.6); ensuing document 
review (.5); continue review of cqse research 
memos in preparation of document review (1.1). 

02/21/11' KLC Review privileged intemal documents to 
designate for team review (1.9); review 
noteholders responses and objections to 
discovery requests (OA); review GMNSF trustee 
responses and objections re: same {O.?}; review 
discovery protocol in preparation for team call 
(0.6); lead internal team call (with Fisher, 
Richards, Shattuck, Boneau. Orlandoni and 

. Capria) (0.6); correspondence with Fisher and 
. Sidorsky re: GUC trust (0.3); correspondence with 

Xact re: database searches (004); 
correspondence to team re: tagging (0.2); 
discuss permission restrictions with Xact (0.3); 
correspondence with T. Rothman (DENSO) re: 
data collection (0.2); meet with Fisher re; open 
issues to discuss with GTI Akin (.5); meet with 

Tax lD. No; 

Suite 100 ISO WcstJeft'erson 
Detroit, Midligan 48226 

T: 3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzel.tom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

Hours 

2.10 . 

3.10 

1.0.20 

/ 

I 

I 
I 

I 
! 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND CO.uNSELOR.S 

. a prolassional corporatIon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Ngrrative Description 

Fisher re: production set (A); revjew documents 
to be produced (3.6). 

02/21/11 MCB Review document review protocol (AJ; call with 
document review team to discuss review 
protocol (.6). 

02/21/11 A.-R Team conference cali to discuss protocol for 
document review in preparation for producing. 

02/21/11 F JC ,Prepare for {.1 J and ottend conference call \vith 
case team re: upcoming document reviews [.6J .. 

TaxLD.NQ 

Suite 100 ISO WestJeffemon 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, 313 22S 7000 p, 313 22S 7080 
www.butze:(.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

1.00 

0.60 

n7t'1 v.,v 

02/21/11 SAS Analyze updated review protocol in preparation 1.30 
for upcoming review and production (.71; 
teleconference with review team and K •. 
Cooperman to review protocol dnd prepare for 
Relativity review of FTI and Kramer Levin 
documents (.6). 

02/22/11 E.F. Review ietter in support of confirmation (.6) and 3.20 
e-mail with Cooperman regarding same (.1); 
meet with Cooperman regarding document 
production (.8J and call with Shattuck and 
Cooperman regarding same (.3); review e-mails 
regarding document review issues (.3J; review 
responses and objections [.6) and prepare notes 
to raise discovery disputes (.S). 

02/22/11 BNS Review draft of Committee statement regarding 0.40 
plan confirmation . 

. .. . ():2/27/11 DVO Continue review of relevant facts andI€lgal l.80 
issues in preparation to conduct discovery. 



BUTZEL LONG 
'A T TOR N E Y $ AND C 0 U N 5 E l. 0 R S 

a professional eorpprat;on 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidentiallnformafion) . 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

Date 

02/22/11 

02/22/11 

02/23/11 

02/23/11 

.RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr 

KLC 

Narralive Descripfion 

Telephone call with Shattuck re: discovery 
matters (004); telephone call with Macksould 
. (KLNF) re: document review (0.2); 
correspondence with Macksoud re: statement 
supporting plan (0.1); review same statement . 
(004); correspondence from Macksoud re: 
Debtors' response to plan objections (0.1 ); review 

. same response (O.B); office conference with 
Fisher re: discovery specifications (0.8); discuss 
same with Fisher and Shattuck (0.3); .discuss same 
with Xact (0.3); correspondence from Sidorsky re: 
issues list for document review (0.1); review same 
list (1.3); correspondence with Zarowny (DENSO) 
re: privilege (0.1) ; revise document tags re: same 
(0.7); review documents (3). 

SAS Teleconference with K. Cooperman relative to 
upcoming Butzel produCtion (A); teleconference 
with K. Coopermari and E. Fisher relative to 
upcoming producfion and processing and 
review of FTI documents for production (.3);. 
teleconference with N. Reizen of Xact relative to 
same (.9). 

RS Office conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
document coding issues. 

J:.F. . Meet with Cooperman regarding document 
. production set (0.5); meet with Cooperman and 

Seidel re: same (.3); review Lehman Rule 6O(b) 
decision (.5); review correspondence from 

. Cooperman concerning same [2); review 

Tax 1.D.No: 

Suite 100 ISO West Jeffetoon 
Detroit, Michigan4&226 

T, 313 225 7000 F: 313 22S 7080 
www.butzeLcom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

8.60 

1.60 

0.30 

2.60 

I 
I 
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BUT ZE L· LONG 
ATTOR,NIiYS AND COUNSE1.0RS 

a professional corporation 

. UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMllTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOool41216-0007 
(PrivIleged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

Date 

02/23111 

02/23/11 

02/23111 

02/23/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Tkpr Narrcitive Description 

responses and objections (.2) and prepare notes 
to raise discovery disputes (A); review statement 
in support (.3); call with Mayer (KLNF) regarding 
GM Nova Scotia settlement offer (.3). 

BNS Review debtor memorandum of law in support . 
of confirmation regarding Nova Scotia 
objection . 

. BNS Conference with E. Fisher and K. Cooperman 
regarding document production (.3); telephone 
conference with T. Mayer {KLNFJ regarding 
Appaloosa proposal (.1 J . 

DVO Review document review protocol in 
preparation for document review (I. I ); call with 
K. Cooperman regarding same (.9J. 

KLC Review production set delivered by vendor (2.3); 
office conference re: same with Fisher (0.5); 
confer with Fisher and Seidel re:same (.3); 
correspondence· with Xacf re:.binders (004); 
discuss discovery issues list with Sidorsky (0.5); 
review Lehman decision re: 60(b) (2.2); 
correspondence to· Asher and Seidel re: same 
(0.3); telephone call with Orlandoni re: hot and 
privileged documents (0.9); office conference 
with Sidorsky re: document coding (.3); draft . 

. email re: outstanding items to Noteholders (0.6); 
correspondence with FYI re: data collection (0.1 J; 
prepare list of relevant events re: time frame 
(0.9). 

TaxLD.No' 

Suite: 100 150 West JeffeJson 
Detroit. MiclJigon 48226 

1":3132257000 F:3132257080 
www.butzel.com 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 6494940 

Hours 

0.30 

0040· 

2.00 

9.30 . 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORs 

Q pl'oie$slonal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMllTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confldentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted fhrough February 28, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Tax I.D. No: 

. Suite 100 150 WestJeft'erson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T,3132257000 F, 313225 708() 
www.butzeL«Im 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 . 

Date Tkpr· Narrative DescIiptlon Hours 

with Cooperman regarding same (.9); 
teleconference concerning new layout for 
receiving documents regarding discovery (O.~); 
review correspondence from Akin regarding 
draft of proposed protective order (.1) and 
review same (.2). . 

02/25/11 BNS Review confirmation order (.6) and Nova Scotia 120 
supplemental objection in connection with plan 
objections and preservation of avoidance clai!."ns 
(.6). 

02/25/11 DJD Conference with K. Cooperman regarding 0.40 
document review project and necessary tasks to 
undertake in preparation for same (.2); 
participate in conference call with K .. 
Cooperman, D. Orlandoni, F. Caprio, and M. 
Boneau regarding document review project and 
related strategy issues (.2). 

02/25/11 PVO Continue review of hot documents in 5.60 

02/25/11 

connection with document production (4.6); 
reviewed relevant portions of committee's 
amended objection (A) and adversaries' . 
responses (A); team conference call to discuss 
document review issues (.2). 

KLC Team call re: new layout for receiving 
documents re: discovery (02); discuss protocol 
with Devine (0.2): discuss production with Fisher 
(0.9); correspondence with Xact re: same (0.2); . 
·revise summary of new layout-tag useforreview· 
team (0.6). 

2.10 

I I 

.' 

i 
I 
! 



BUTZE L LONG T .. ID.No 
ATTORNiYS A"N D COUNSELORS 

. Suite 100 150 West Jefferson 
Q professional corporarlolt Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F, 313 22S 7080 
WWW.bHtzei.coIJI 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF March 8, 201.1 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8494940 
Account Number 000141216{)()()7 I 

I 
(Privileged and ConfidenHallnformaHon) I PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Date !!mJ: Ngrrgtive Description Hours 

02/25/11 MCB Call with team to discuss review of documents. 0.20 

02/25/11 FJC Preparation for conference call re document 0.30 
review (.1); .attend conference call re document 

I 
review (.2). 

·02/27/1l E.F. . Review documents for production (1.1); e-mails 1.30 
with Cross and Finger (Akin and GT) regarding I , 

I I protective order (.2). 

·n?I?A/ll E.F. Review proposed protective order (.5); e-mcils 1 '2" 
.... ~I-..... ,.' • , ...... v·· 

I i. with Finger and Cross (Akin and GT) regarding 
productions (.2); e-mails with Xact regarding FTI . I ., 
production (.3); e-mails with Scott Dav.idson (KS) I ; 

! regarding New GM production and subpoena I : 

response (.3). i 
I 

02/28/11 DJD Analyze document review protocol circulated 2.10 1 

by K. Cooperman (.6), +ogetherwith team e-
mails regarding fagging strategies to determine 
proper document tagging approach (1.6); begin 
review of documents (.9t. 

02/28/11 DVO Conferences with document review software 3.30 
vendor regarding software capabilities and 
limitations (.9); review of certain Butzellong and 
FTI documents (24). 

02/28/11 . MCB Email correspondence regarding review of 1.00 
documents and Relativity (.3); review documents 
(.7). 

02/28/11 SAS Prepare document production sPt3Cifications for 2.50 ., 
Xact relative to Butzel documents in preparation· 

, 
I 

I 



BUTZE L LONG 
.ATTORNEYS AND ~OUNSELORS 

a profe;ssionaf.corporalion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and ConlidenHal InformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 201 t 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Thpr NarraHve Description 
for upcoming production to opposing counsel 

. (.8); telephone conference with D. Bach re same. 
and FTI document review (.4); correspond with 
vendor and team members relative to FTI review 
and set up of review batches (.5); analyze 
vendor work order for accuracy of project (.3); 
coordinate delivery cif production disk (.3); 
correspond with technical support to set up of 
Relativity credentials for review (.2). 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxLD.No 

Suite JOO ISO WestJeff'erson 
. Detroit,Micbigan48226 

To31322S7000 F:3132251OSO 
wmv.1nrtzeLoom 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494940 

140,247.00 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS&'LORS 

a profeS$icnal corpolVUcm 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141 216"(){)]o' . 
. (Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28, 2011 
RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

mmekee;er 

Current Fees: 
Less 50% Fee Adiustment: 
Current Disbursements: 
Total Current Invoice: 
Total Balance Due: 

Tax tD.No 

SuiteIOO ISOWestJelferson· 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 3132257000 F: 313 22S 1080 
www.blltZel.com 

March 8, 201 1 

Invoice No. 8494941 

Tot;TI 

3,295.50 
(1,647.751 

0.00 
1,647.75 

$1.647.75 
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BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-001 0 

(Privileged and COl1lidentiallnformafion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through February 28. 2011 

~ 

02/07/11 

02/10/11 

02/14/11 

CJ2ii5iii 

/ 

02/16111 

02/17/11 

02/18/11 

02/24/11 

02/25/ll 

RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

I!m!: 
KLC 

KLC 

KLC 

FjC 

FJC 

FJC 

FJC 

BNS 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Revise January proformas (2.5); correspondence 
to Rast re: time entry 10.1); correspondence to 
Shattuck re: same 10.1); correspondence to . 
Dukarsld re: same (0.1). 

Revise January invoices. 

Draft JanuarY monthly fee statement. 

Begin review of monthly statement to be 
submitted. 

Continue review of monthly fee statement. 

. Continue checking figures on monthly fee 
statement. 

Complete checking of figures on Monthly Fee 
Statement 1.2); e-mail to K. Cooperman re results 
1.1) . 

Review monthly fee statement. 

Revise January monthly statement; 
correspondence from MLC re: March and April 
protocol. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxID.ND' 

Suite 100 ISO West JeffeJson 
Detroi~ Michig;m48226 

T,3J322S7000 F,3)322S7080 
lYWW.blltzel.ct!m 

March 8, 2011 

Invoice No. 8494941 

Hours 

2.80 

0.50 

1.30 

·0040 

2.10 

1.10 

0.30 

0.10 

0.50 . 

3,295.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSEL.ORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GJ;;NERAl MOTORS CORPORATION 

AccounfNlimber 000141216-0005 . 
(Privileged and ConfidentiallnfonnaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 

Tax. lD. No: 

Suite 100 ISO West jefferson 
n..ro;; Michigan 48226 

T; 3)32257000 )l; 313 2257080 
'M¥W.bu~m 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497250 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPUCATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

.1 TImekeeper Ii 

Shareholder 
Barry N. Seidel 0.10 hours at $750.00 . $75.00 
Total For Shareholder 0.10 $75.00 

Associate 
Katie L Cooperman 0.60 . hours.at $425.00 $255.00 
TotaLFor Associate . 0.60 $255.00 

CUrfl'ii1fFees': ; .. 330;00 
CUrf~nttiis~uJ:Sements: 243.31 
Total Currerit Invoice: 573.31 
Total Balarrce Due: $573.31 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

(l professloltal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0005 

(Privileged and Confldentlallnformatlcm) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 

Date 

03/08/11 

·03/14/11 

03/14/11 

RE: BUTZEL LONG FEE APPLICATIONS AND MONTHLY BUDGETS 

Tkpr 

KLC 

BNS 

KLC 

Narrative Description 

Correspondence from Wu (WGMJ re: Fifth Interim 
Fee Applications; review same protocol. , 

Review draft of e-mail to C. Basler regarding 
budget. 

Correspondence with Seidel re: MlC estimate; . 
correspondence to C. Basler (AlixJ re: same; draft 
April 2011 budget; correspondence with Seide! 
re: same; correspondence to C. Andres {GKJ re: 

. same. 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES 

\ TulD.No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Dotroft. Miohi"", 4&226 

T: 313 225 7000 F:3132257Ol!O 
www.butui'<:oDl 

April 7,2011 

Invoice No. 8497250 

Hours 

0.10 

0.10 

0.50 

330.00 

I 
r 
I 

I 
I 



BUTZEl LONG 
A.T TOR N E Y SAN 0 CO·U N S E L 0 It S 

0' prD~~ioRal corporatIon 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

. Account Number 000141216-0006 ,. 
(Privileged and ConlldentiallnformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 
RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT 

'nmekeeper 

Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 0.60 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 0.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.80 

Associate 
Kalie LCooperman 0.60 hours at 
Tota! For Associate ) 0.60 

TaxLD.No 

Suite 100 ISO WcstJoffi=n 
Ddroi!, MiclUgm48226 

To 313 22S 7000 Po 313 22S 7080 
www.hutzeLcom 

. April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497251 

Tot:; 

$575.00 $345.00 
$750.00 $150.00 

$495.00 

$425.00 $255.00 
$255.00 

I . , 
. ! 

I 
I 

l-

f 



· 

BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR:NEYS AND COUNSELOR.S 

" prol9ss;onal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number. 000141216-0006 

(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 

"Date 

03/23/11 

03/23/11 

03/29/11 

RE: JP MORGAN AVOIDANCE COMPLAINT' 
Tkpr 

E.F •. 

KLC 

BNS 

Narrative Description 

Meet with Coope~an regarding issue of 
ownership ofTerm Loan liiigation proceeds (.3); 
call with Macksoud (KlNF) regarding same (.3). 

Office conference with Rsher re: term loan 
proceeds (.3); call with Macksoud (KLNF) re: 
same (.3). 

Review WF&G article regarding Roswell decision. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

TaxI.D.No: 

Suite 100 lSOWestJefl'eI'SOII. 
DoIroil, M;.hlgan 4S226 

1'<313 225101)0 F: 313 2251080 
www.butze:l.com 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497251 

Hours " 

0.60 

0.60 " 

0.20 

750.00 

'··1 
I 
! 



BUTZE L LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS . ) 

a professional cofporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenfiallnformafion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through Marc:h 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

~mekeeper 
Shareholder 
Eric Fisher 24.00 hours at 
Robert Sidorsky 1.80 hours at 
Barry N. Seidel 8.80 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 34.60 

Associate 
1"\"I"'1. .... "1.....t r\rI ........ ,-.It"\t"\i 
J.oI''-'II''" .. _ '-'11 .... 11 I"" ....... II 27490 hours at 
David J. DeVine :?4.90 hours at 
Maria Caceres-Boneau 31.40 hours at 
Kane L. Cooperman· 109.80 . hours at 
Total For Associate 194.00 

Paralegal 
Stephanie A. Shattuck 9.40 hours at 
Total For Paralegal 9.40 

Paralegal II 
Frederick Caprio 1.60 hours at 
Total For Paralegal II 1.60 

TaxlD.No 

Suite 100 150 WestJefferson 
Detroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313 22S 7000 F: 313225 7080 
www.bu.tzel.~om 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice.No.8497252 

$575.00 $13,800.00 
$625.00 $1.125.00 
$750.00 $6.600.00 

$21.525.00 

<t?7<; nn $7,672.50 "t"-4 _ .......... 

$300.00 $7,470.00 
$335.00 $10.519.00 
$425.00 $46.665.00 

$72.326.50 

$180.00 $1.692.00 
$1,692.00 

$270.00 $432.00 
$432.00 

0 



'HUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELOR.S 

a profsss/onal corpotalion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMlllEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 . 
(PrivIleged and Confidential Information) 

.PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted throl.l9h March 31, 2011 

Tax.J.D.No. 

Suite 100 lSOWe:stJeff'crson 
Detroit, Mlcbig;m 43226 . 

T: 3132257000 F:313 2257080 
www.butzel.eom 

April 7, 20] 1 

Invoice. No. 8497252 

.! 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

o professIonal corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMIlTEE OF 
. GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date 'IkI2!: Narrative Description 

03/01/11 E.F. Calls with Dumas regarding document 
production to Noteholders and Trustee (.3); e­
mails with Orlandoni and Caplia regarding FTI 
documents {.2}; e-mail with Davidson (KS) 
regarding N~w GM subpoena [.1); review draft 
protective order (A). 

03/01/11 DVO Coordination with review team regarding FTI 
Documents f.6}; ravievv' of portion of FTI 
documents (5.9) . 

03/01/11 SAS . Coordinate with third party counsel relative to 
. production specification requirements in 

preparation for upcoming production {.20}; 
teleconference with P. Dumas relative to 
production documents to opposing counsel 
(AD); correspond with team and vendor relative 
to production format and production 
documents on Relaiivity (.50). 

03/02/11 E.F. E-mail to GT and Akin regarding revisions to 
Protective Order (.3); review plan amendments 
proposed by GMNSF noteholders (A); call with 
Macksoud (KlNF) regarding same (.2); call with 
Seidel regarding same. 

03/02/11 BNS Review proposed revisions to GUC Trust (.3) and 
Plan regarding Nova Scotia note holders claims 
·(04), draft e-mail to Karotkin (WGM) regarding 
proposed plan c:hanges (.5); discuss with L 
Macksoud {KLNFI (.2). 

Tax ID. No 

s,,;re 100 150 West_ 
DeQoit, Miohigan48226 

T, 313 225 7000 F, 313 225 7080 . 
www.bBtzeLeom 

April.7,2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

Hours 

1.00 

6.50 

1.10 

1.10 

lAO 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOIlNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a profsuionai.corpocotion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidenllallnformation) 

PROFESsioNA~ SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Ikm Narrative Description 

03/02/11 DJD Analyze FTI documents to identify responsive 
non-privileged documents. 

03/02/11 DVO Further review of HI documents in advance of 
production to Noteholders. 

03/02/11 KLC Review correspondence from Rsher re: 
protective order comments; correspondence 
with Seidel re: confirmation order revisions; . 
review same revisions. 

03/02111 SAS Analyze Concordance production load file to 
determine proper fields for production (.90J; 
correspond with team members re same (.20); 
Create case file with all disks, notes, protocols 

. and pleadings to same !.30J. 

03/03/11 E.F. Review Confidential Order !.3J; e-mails with . 
Orlandoni-and DeVine regarding document 
review !.3); review GMNSF trustee objection to 
plan (A); meet with Seidel regarding same (.3). 

03/03/11 BNS Attend confirmation hearing (5.7J; meet with 
Fisherre: same (.3J. 

03/03/11 DJD Continue analysis of FTI documents to identify 
documents to be produced. 

. 03/03/11 DVO Further review of FTI documents in advance of 
production to Noteholders.· 

03/03/11 MCB Review emails re: document review (0.2) .. 

03/04/1 J H. Outline response to Noteholders and Trustee 
regarding discovery objections .. 

TaxID.No" 

Suite lOt) 150 West Iefferson 
Detroit, Miohigau 48226 

T: 31322S 7000 F:31322S7080 
www.butzel.com 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

Hours 

2.60 

3.60 

O.SO 

lAO 

1.30 

6.00 

0.60 

2.20 

0.20 

0.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
AT TOR. N I! Y 5 A N"O C 0 U N 5 E LOR S 

a pt'ofs$!/onal corporation 

UNSECUREDCREOITORS COMMIlTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000) 41216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Jke!: Narrative Description 

03/04/11 OVO Continued review of FTI documents ahead of 
production to Noteholders. 

. 03/07/11 E.F. Meet with Cooperman regarding status of 
document review (.91; review letter to 
Noteholders alld Trusfeeregarding 
interrogatories Co2l; e-mail to Cooperman 
regarding same (.11; review portions of 
confirmation decision addressing GMNSF Trustee 
.... r.. ........... 1 ........................ 1...1 ...... _' ..... 1.-..; ...... ,... ... : .............. "" ___ 1.- .... I n' 
...... IUI I"IVIOIIVI\".i'fi;;;I.;) VJJJ'V"'-JIVII~ JV IJIUII loLJ . 

03/0711 I KlC . Telephone call with Owl. Creek re: Nova Scolia 
objection (0.2); review bowater pleadings re 

. same (0.3); office conference with Fisher re: 
discovery strategy and document productions 
(0.9); draft letter re: verification requirement (0.9); 
revise same per commehts from Fisher (0.2); 
review confirmation decision (1.4); 
correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(0.2); revise document requests to Debtors (1.8); 
review Noteholders responses and objections 
(0.6J; review same from GMNSF trustee (0.6); 
internal correspondence re: team meeting to 
discuss discovery (0.3). 

03/08111 RS Office conference with K. Cooperman regarding 
standing issues. 

03/08/11· E.F .. Review document requests to Old GM (.5) and 
meet with Cooperman regarding same (.31; 
review revisions to protective order (.3); review 
plan provisions (A) and e-mails with Cooperman 

, . 

TaxLD.No 

s.m.100 150W ... Jeff ..... 
. Detroit, Michl .... 48226 

T,31l2257000 11,313225'/080 
www.butul.com 

April 7,.2011 

.Invoice No. 8497252 

. Hours 

2.20 

I AD 

, 

7.40 

0.30 

1.70 



. \. 

HUTZEL LONG 
A:rTORNEYS AND COUN5ELORS 

·a proies$ional c:orpOrar;Qn 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 . 
(PrivDeged and Confidentiallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through !\tarch 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

. Date I!ser Narrgtive Description 

regarding same (2). 

TaxLD.No 

SwtelOO lSOWestJeffeaon 
DetnBt. M;.mgan 48225 

T: 313 22571100 P: 3132257080 
www.bulzel.com 

April 7, 2011 

. Invoice No. 8497252 

03/08/11 DJD Analyze materials received from M. Boneau in 0.80 
connection with subpoena to be issued to 
Department ofTreasury (A) and verify 
applicable regulations governing same (A). 

03/08/11 . DVO Participate in conference call with K . 
. Cooperman, D. Devine and M. Boneau to 
coordinate ongoing document review and 
produciion. 

0.30 . 

03/08/11 KLC Review documents produced by FIl (0.9); 11.20 
telephone call with Macksoud (KlNFJ re: Plan 
issues re: Nova Scotia claims (0.3); 
correspondence re: same with Seidel (OA); 
internal document review status call with 
Boneau, Orlandoni and Devine (0.3); research re: 
plan revisions to preserve standing (3.4); review 
Plan re:·same (0.9); review Disclosure Statement 
re: same (1.7); telephone call with Karotkin 
(WGMj re: same (0.2); correspondence with 
Karotkin re: same (0.2); correspondence with 
Macksoud re: same (0011; meet with Fisher re: 
requests to Debtors (0.3); revise STN standing 
stipulation (2.1); office conference with Sidorsky 
re: same (.3); correspondence with J. 
Santambrogio (FTI) re: discovery (0.1). 

03/08/1 I MCB Call with review team (.3); review research re . 0.80 
document requests (.4); send research to D. 
Devine and K. Cooperman (.1). 

r 



BUTZEL LONG Tax LD. No 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proiesswnal corporation 
Suite 100 ISO W"'JefI'emm 

Detroj~ MichlgaJl48226 
T: 313 22S 7000 F: 313 2251080 

WWl,..blltul.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April? 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

{Privileged and ConfidenHallnformaHon} 
. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

Ogte 

03/09/11 

03/09/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Thm: Narrative Description 

E.F. 

BNS 

Draft letter to Chapman and Finger regarding 
discovery responses. 

Review proposed additional plan language 
regarding standing for equitable subordination 
complaint (.3); and recommend revisions to 
amended language (.2). 

Hours 

0.90 

0.50 

03/09/11 KLC Telephone call with Macksoud (KLNFJ re: 1.70 
standing and Plan language (0.6); 
correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: same 
(O.2); correspondence with M. Meises (WGM) re: 
same (0.1); correspondence to Fisher and Seidel 
re: STN stipulation rationale (0.3); telephone call 
with Shattuck re: discovery issues list (0.3); discuss 
same with Vendor (0.2). 

03/09/11 SAS Teleconference with K. Cooperman regarding 0.30 
Relativity formatting (.30). 

03/10/11 E.F. Meet with Cooperman regarding status of 0.50 
document production. 

03/10/1 I KLC· Correspondence with DENSO re: document 5.20 
, production (0.2); discuss same with Vendor 

(Xact) (0.3); review same production (1.1); meet 
with Fisher re: same (.5); review FTI document 
production (204); correspondence with Shattuck 
re: same (0.2); discuss same. with Shattuck (004); 
correspondence to team re: Kramer documents 
for review (O.2). 

03/10/11 MCB Review emails re: document review. 0.20 

I' t 

I 



BUTZEL LONG . TmtLD.No: 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 
Suite 100 ISO WestJoffaroa 

DeUoit. Michigan48226 
T,31322S7000 F,31322S7080 

www.hutzel.eom 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April 7,2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
. Account Number 000141216-0007 

(PrMleged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
!!mr Narrgtive Description , 

03/1 0/11 SAS Teleconference with Xact regarding Relativity 
. database and standard set up (.BO); 
teleconference with K. Cooperman regarding 
Relalivity and team update (.40);' analyze emails 
re same (.20). 

l:Im!!l 
1.40 . 

03/11/11 . E.F. Draft memorandum to O'Donnell, Anger, Cross 2.30 
and others regarding open discovery issues and 
document discovery disputes (1.3); e-mails with 
t:r""~"",, .. ....................... rr..i ..................................... I ~,~ ..... ___ :1 ~ • .r~1.o.. 
I Ii I~>;;;il '-VI I","vll 1II1~ ,JIUJ I Iv '~V'J I 11;:::;-1 1 Iyll VVIII J 

Cooperman regarding FTI document production 
(0.2); review e-mails regarding open discovery 
issues (0.3); 9nd protective order (0.2). 

03/11/11 BNS Review exchange of e-mails regarding discovery 0.50 
issues between E. Asher and K. Anger. 

03/11/11 KLC Review documents to be produced re: FTI (0.3); 3.40 
telephone call with Shattuck and Vendor re: 
same (1.3); correspondence from Hoffman (Alix) 
re: production authorization (O.1J; 
correspondence with Vendor re: Akin document 
upload (O.4J; correspondence with Fisher re: 
same (0.2); review Kramer documents re: 
privilege (0.6); review correspondence re: open 
discovery issues (0.3); review correspondence re: 
protective order (0.2). . 

03/11/11 SAS Weekly team call with K. Cooperman, D. Bach. 1.30 
and N. Reizen re status of productions and 
upcoming productions (1.3) . 

. 03113/11 DVO~oordinate in connection with document 0.20 

I 

\ 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.N.EYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional eo.rpoC'atIon 

"UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMmEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 0001 41216-0007 
(Privileged and Confidential Information) 

" PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date Tkpr Narrative Description 

production. 

03/13/11 KLC Correspondence from Chapman (Akin) re: 
discovery issues; draft cover letter to Old GM re: 
document requests. 

03/l4/11 E.F. E-mails with Cooperman regarding discovery 
requests to debtors (.2) and review of same (.5); 
meet with Cooperman regarding status of 
document production (.6). 

03/14/11 DJD Analyze materials received re: subpoena to 
Department of Treasury requesting documents 
(.3); review e-mails regarding Kramer Levin 
review of documents and privilege issues 1.1). 

03/14/11 DVO Further review in connection with document 
production. 

Q3/14/11 KlC Office conference with Fisher re: motion to 
compel discovery (0.7); revise cover letter to Old 
GM (0.8); correspondence to WGM re: 
document requests to Old GM (0.1); internal 
correspondence with review team re: Kramer 
documents to produce (0.3); correspondence 
with Shattuck re: second production (O.2); meet 
with Fisher re: same (.6); research motion to 
compel discovery in SDNY (1.3); begin drafting 
letter to BJ Gerber re: discovery dispute (1.2). 

03/14/11 MCB Correspondence with K. Cooperman re: review 
of Kramer documents (.10); correspondence 
with D. Devine re: review of Kramer documents 
1.20);"review emails re: review of Kramer· 

TaxLD.No· 

Suite 100 ISO West J_ 
!leIroi'. Michigon4&226 

T, 313 225 7000 Ii, 313 22S 7080 
www.bubeJ.com 

April 7.2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

l:!.m!.!1 

0.50 

1.30 

0.40 

0.50 

5.10 

2.00 

I 
I 
I 
I , 

. i 
I 
I 
I 
! 

i 

! 
1 



BUTZEL LONG 
"ATTORNEiYS AND COUNSELORS 

a pro(Buional corporotion 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(PriVIleged and Confidentlallnformaflon) 

. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

. Date I.!92!: Narrative Description 

documents (.30); prepare for review of Kramer. 
documents (.20); review Kramer documents 
(1.20). 

TaxlD.No· 

Suite 100 150 West Jeff=on 
DeIroit, MWhigau 48226 

T: 313 22S 7000 P: 313225 7080 
W'WW.butzel.com 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

03115/11 DJD Analyze Kramer LeVin documents for privilege 1.50 
issues (.7); analyze transcript of hearing on 
extension of claim deadline (.8). 

03/15/11 DVO Continued document review in support of 
production [2.4); conference call :-Mth K. 
Cooperman regarding research requirement 
(.1 J. 

2.50 

03/15/11 KLC· Review documents produced by Kramerre; 8.90 
confidentiality (4.7); discuss same with Macksoud 
(KLNF) (0.3); correspondence with Macksoud re; 
same (0.2); correspondence with Orlandoni; 
Devine and Boneau re: same (0.2); revise 
committee member discovery tracking chart 
(0.4); correspondence to .Lis (Inteva) re: same 
(0.1); correspondence to and from UAW re: 
same (0.2]; correspondence to O'Neal (Cleary) 
re: same (0.1); correspondence to Caplin and 
prysdale re: same (0.1); telephone call with 

. Orlandoni re: 2019 research {D. 1 ); . 
correspondence re: same with Fisher [0.3); 
meeting with Boneau re: review of GMNSF 
Trustee documents (0.5); correspondence with 
Chapman (Akin) re: same (0.1); revise discovery 
requests to Old GM (1.1); revise same cover 
letter [0.5) . 

. 03/15/11 MCB Review batch of Kramer documents (0.20); 0.70 

I 
I 
I 



BUllE L LONG 
TaxlD.N~· 

ATTORNEYS AND CQ·UNSELORS 

Suite 100 150 W6StJeffCfSOD 
a professional corporotion DeIro;r, Miohigan 48226 

T: 313 22S 7000 1'0313 22S 7080 
www.batzel.com 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF April 7, 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 000141216-0007 . 

(PrMleged and Confidentiallnformaiion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Pate Tkpr NarraHve Description Hours 

meeting with K. Cooperman re: review of Akin 
documents (0.50). 

03115111 SAS Coordinate processing of specifications 0.80· 
regarding the Akin documents in Relativity [.60); 
teleconference with D. Bach re same (20). 

03/16/11 . E.F. E-mail with Davidson (KS) regarding document 0.20 
production from New GM. 

03/17/11 E.F. Review documents to be produced from Denso , 0.60 
and Kl documents [.3); and meet with 
Cooperman regarding same [.3). 

03/17/11 DJD Research regarding subpoenas to Canadian 0.90 
government. 

03/17/11 KlC Correspondence with Xact re: upcoming 4.20 
document production [0.7); review same 
production [1.9); telephone call with Macksoud 
[KlNF) re: same (004); discuss same with Fisher " : 

(0.3); review revised plan re: Nova Scotia claims 
[0.7); correspondence to Fisher and Seidel re: 

. same (0.2). 

03/17111 MCB Review Akin documents. 0.30 

03/18111 E.F. Review e-mails regarding protective order (0.3); 0.50 
e-mail with Cooperman regarding training call 
and redactions [0.2). 

.03/18/11 DJD Review sample affidavit regarding subpoena to 0.70 
Treasury requesting documents. 

03/J8/11 KlC Review correspondence re: protective order 2.50 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTOR.NEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professIonal corporatlon. 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
G.ENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number000141216-0007 
(Pdvileged and Confidenliallnformafion) 

PROfESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 
. RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINA!,]CE COMPANY 

.. I!Y!!: Narrative Description 
(0.2); correspondence with Macksoud (KlNF) re: 
upcoming document production (0.3); 
correspondence with Xact re: same (0.3); discuss 
same withXact (0.2); weekly call with. Shattuck 
and Xact re: discovery tools relevant to Nova 
Scotia (0.5); correspondence Vliith Orlandoni, 
Fisher and Boneau fe: training call (0.2); 
correspondence with same re: redactions (0.2); 
correspondence with Shattuck re: production 
instructions (0.3); correspondence with Xact re: 
same' (004). 

TaxLD. No' 

Suite 100 150 West Jeffezson 
DcIroit, Michigan 48226 

T: 313225 7(}OO F:31322S1080 
www.hutzeltom 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

03/18/11 MCB Respond to K. Cooperman's inquiry re: review of . 0.20 
Kramer documents (0.10); review emails re: 
document review meeting on Monday (0.10). 

03/18/11 SAS. Weekly teleconference with K. Cooperman. N. 1.20 
Reizen, and D. Bach relative to documents 
review and set up in Relativity and upcoming . 
productions (.50); prepare vendor processing 
specifications relative to the third production of 
documents (Denso) (.70). 

03/20/1 I KLC Continue drafting letter to BJ Gerber requesting 6.10 
pre-motion conference re: motion to compel 
documents from Noteholders and GMNSF 
Trustee (5.9); correspondence with Akin fe: 
protective order (0.2). 

03/20/11 MCB Continue review of Akin documents. 0.80 

·03/21/1) E.F. E-mails with Finger regarding discovery meeting 0.70 
(.2J; review GMNS Trustee objections (.2); meet 

I 

! 
I 



BUTZEL LONG Tax LD.No' 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNS£LO.RS 

a pro/fissional corporation 
Suite 100 ISO West Jc:fi'emon 

Detroit, Michigan 48226 
T,3132257000 F:31322S7080 

www.but2:el.c:om 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITIEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 00014] 216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Date IIm!: Narrgtlve Description Hours 

with Cooperman regarding tetter to Judge 
gerber (.3). 

03/21/11 DJD Participate in training call with Xact discovery 4.70 
selVices (.5); review research materials provided 
by M. Boneau in connection with subpoena to 
be sent to Department of Treasury (1) and 
perform supplemental research of CFR and 
applicable. procedural rules regarding same 

. (1.0); update draft of subpoena (AJand 
accompanying affidavit to be sent to K. 
Cooperman based on findings (1.8). 

03/21/11 DYO Telephonic training with document review 3.50 
software vendor (.5); legal research of certain 
discovery issues re: 2019 statement (3). 

03/21/11 KLC Draft (2.7) and revise (5.8) discovery dispute 11.10 
letter to BJ Gerber; internal training call with 
Xact, Boneau. Orlandoni and Devine (0.5); office 
conference with Fisher re: letter to BJ Gerber 
(0.3); correspondence from Devine re: discovery 
from Treasury (0.6); review GMNSF trustee 
discovery disputes 10.7); correspondence with 
Fisher re: same (0.2). 

03/21/1 I MCB Conference call with review team and Relativity 6.40 
(0.50); emails re: review of documents produced 
by the GM· Nova Scotia Trustees (O.l 0); emails re: 
subpoena to US Treasury (0.20); review of 
documents produced by the GM Nova Scotia 
Trustee (5.6). 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a proFess/onai cG'Poration 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number 000141216-0007 
(PrivDeged and Confidentiallnformafion) 

PROFESSIONAL.SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

Dale 

03/22/11 

03/22/11 

03122111 

03122111 

03123/11 

03/23/11 

03/23/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
TIm! Ngrratlve Descriplion 

DJD Prepare for (.3) and participate in conference 
with K. Cooperman (.3) regarding venue issues 
for subpoena to be issued to Department of 
Treasury. 

DVO Researched discovery issue with respect to 
Bankruptcy Rule 2019. 

KLC . Review affidavit for subpoena to Treasury (0.6); 
discuss same with Devine (0.3); discuss Akin 
production issues with Boneau (004). 

MCB Review em ails from K. Cooperman re: subpoena 
(0.20); respond to emans.from K. Cooperman re: 
same (0.10); review email from D. DeVine re: 
same (020); send memore: subpoenaing the US 
Treasury to D. DeVine (0.10); review documents 
produced by the NS Trustee (5.0). 

E.F. Revise letter to Judge Gerber regarding 
discovery issues (1.8); confer with Cooperman 
regarding same (.8). 

DVO Further legal research of Bankruptcy Rule 2019 
diSCOVery issues. 

KLC Review (2.1) and analyze (0.9) Harbert decision 
. in Calpine re: ULC oppression claims; office 

conference with Fisher re: letter concerning 
discovery disputes (0.8); revise subpoena to 
Treasury (0.6); telephone call to Macksoud 
(KLNF) re: Nova Scotia discovery (0.3); review 
Bowater brief re: section 502 10.7); draft revised 

TaxlD.No· 

SuitelOO lSOW ... _ 
Detroit, Michlgan 48226 

T, 313 2257000 F,313 2257080 
www.butze).eom 

AprH 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

0.90 

1.30 

5.60 

2.60 

3.30 

8.20 





BUTZEL LONG TaxLD. No , 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporatIon 
Suite 100 150 West Jeffi:Ison 

Dcttoit.MicIDgan 48226 
T: 313 22S 7000 1': 313 22S 7080 

www.butzel.COQl 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidenliallnformation) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31, 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
. ~ . I!mr ·Narratlve Description 

.. oppression claim. 

03/25/11 DJD . Revise affidavit of K. Cooperman to be included 1.70 

03/25/11 

03/26111 

with subpoena to Treasury re: CFR 1.11 (.7); 
perform supplemental research regarding 
process required to issue subpoena to Canadian 
government (1.0). 

KLC Correspond with Devine re: Treasury affidavit . 
(0.5); review sources cited by Devine re: same 
ii .8); revise ajjjdavit (O~8j. 

E.F. Revise letter to Judge Gerber regarding 
discovery disputes. 

2.90 

0.90 

03/27/11 E.F. Revise letter to Judge Gerber concerning pre- 2.10 
mOTIon conference on discovery issues with 
Noteholders and Trustee. 

03/27/11 KLC Correspondence with Fisher re: discovery letter; 0.50 
review and revise same letter. 

·03/27/11. MCB Review documents produced by the GM Nova. 2.30 
ScoTIa Trustee. 

03/28/11 E:F.Revise leffer to Judge Gerber (.5), and meet with 1.20 
Cooperman regarding same (.3); e-mails with 
Finger and Chapman (GT and Akin) regarding 
status of various discovery issues (A). 

03/28/11 BNS Review draft letter to BJ Gerber regarding 0040 
discovery dispute and suggest revisions. 

03/28/11 DJD Revise subpoena to be issued to Department of 3.20 
Treasury (A); perform supplemental research on 

I 
I 
I 

I , 

I. 



BUTZEL LONG Toxl.D.No: 
ATTORNEY'S AND COUNSELORS 

SWtclOO ISQWestJdfeGoo 
(J professIoltal corpofOtlofl Dc!roit, Micblgon 48226 

To 313 225 7000 F: 313 2257080 
www.butzeLc:om 

UNSECURED CREDITORS.COMMITIEE OF April 7. 2011 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Invoice No. 8497252 

I . Account Number 000141216-0007 
(Privileged and Confldenfiai InformaHon) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES' posted through March 31. 2011 
RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

Date I!m!: Narrative DeSCription Hours 
; 

,: 
f 

permissibility and method of serving subpoena 
on Canadian government (204); Revise affidavit 
of K. Cooperman in support of subpoena (A). 

03/28/11 KLC Office conference with Fisher re: discovery letter 7040 
(0.3); revise pre-motion discovery letter to Court 
IS.O); correspondence with Fisher and Seidel re: 
same (0.2); telephone call with Retter IKDW) re: 
same 10.2); correspondence to Committee re: 
same 10.11: corresoondence with r:"nri .... r",' . ,- -- --,- -----~.--- .. -- .. --.-"- -_ . 

. same (0.1); review correspondence from Devine 
re: Treasury affidavit (004); revise same affidavit 
1l.1). 

03/28/11 . MCB Review NS Trustee .documents. 1.70 

03/28/11 FJC Correspondence with K. Cooperman re dte- 1.10 
checking project 1.1); cite-check draft letter brief 
1.8); office conference with Cooperman re 
dtations (.1). 

03/29/11 E.F. Revise letter to Judge Gerber (A); meet with ).70 
Cooperman regarding same (.3); call with 
Cooperman, Akin and GT regarding discovery 
issues (A); meet with Cooperman regarding 
same (.3); finalize protective .order (.2) and e-
mails regarding same (.1). 

03/29/11 DJD Revise form of subpoena to send to U.s. Dep't of 3.90 i: , 
Treasury (.8); perform research.regarding proper 
court to issue subpoena re: APA (l.6); perform 

I research regarding proper method of serving 
subpoena on federal government under Federal , 

I 
I 

l 
I 



BUTZEL LONG TaxlD.No 
ATTOR'NEYS ANO COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 
Suite 100 lSOWest.1effeloon 

Detroit, Michigan 48226 
T: 3132257000. F: 313225 7080 

www.buueLc:om 

UNSECURED CREDITORS·COMMITTEE·OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April 7, 2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 000 141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidentiallnformafion) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 
Date Tkpr Narrative DeSCription Hours 

rules (1.5). 

03/29/11 KlC Rnalize discovery letter lOA}; correspondence 4040 
with Caprio re: same filing {0.2}; correspondence 
with Garabato {EPIQ} re: serving same (0.2); 
prepare for call with Akin and Greenberg re: 
discovery issues (0.5); participate with Rsher in 
same call {OA}; meet with Rsher re: same (.3); 
revise affidavit fe: Treasury (2.1); discuss same 

. with Devine (0.3) . 

. 03/29/11MCB Assist with work related to subpoenaing the US 0.30 
Treasury (DAD); review letter fo Judge Gerber re: 
discovery disputes {O.30}. 

03/29/11 F JC Prepare image of letter to Judge Gerber for 0.20 . 
electronic filing (.I); electronically file leIter {.1}. 

03/29111 SAS Correspondence wifh K. Cooperman relative fo 0.70 
opposing counsel production documents and . 
issues with load file (.30); Teleconference with D. 
Bach of Xact re: same {.30}; prepare 
correspondence to team re: same {.20}. 

03/30/11 E.F.Review e-mails with Cooperman regarding status 0.20 
of production to Trustee. 

03/30/11 DJD Perform follow-up research to regarding proper 1.80 
methods of service of process for subpoena (.8), 
and draft memorandum summarizing findings to 
K. Cooperman (1.0). 

03/30/11 DVO Review emaHs re: document production. 0.10 

03/30/11 KLC Correspondence with Devine re: Treasury 3.30 



HUTZEL LONG Tax1.D.No 
ATTORI'IEYS AND COUNSELORS: 

Suite 100 lSOWestJefferson 
a profeS5;onal corporarion . Dottoit, Michig .. 48226 

T: 313 225 7000 F, 313 225 7080 
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UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

April 7.2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 
Account Number 000141216-0007 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES poSted through March 31, 2011 

03/30/11 

03/30/11 

RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

I.!m!: Narrative Description 

. affidavit and subpoena (0.3); review results of 
Devine research re: service requirements (l.7l; 
perform research re: jurisdiction (1 .3l. 

F JC Prepare image of Affidavit of Service of reply 
papers for electronic filing (.2l; electronically file 
same (.1). . 

SAS Teleconference with Tabby of Akin firm relative 
to load file issues and correction of same (040); 
feleconfeience Vvith D .. Bach ie same {.20j. 

0.30 

0.60 

03/31/11 . E.F. Call with Finger regarding discovery dispute (.3); 0.60 
meet with Cooperman regarding same (.3l. 

03/31111 . KLC Revise subpoena to Treasury (1.3); revise Fisher 7.20 
affidavit re: same (304); draft cover letters to 
appropriate offICials re: same (1.1); office 
conference with Fisher re: discovery (O.3J; call 
with Fisher and Finger (GTl re: same (0.3); 
correspondence with Shattuck re: production 
files (0.1); correspondence with Cross (Akin) re: 
same (0.1); correspondence with Xact re: 
replacement file from Akin (0.3); 
correspondence from Chapman (AkinJ re: 
discovery dispute (0.1); review same letter (0.2J. 

03/31/11 MCB Correspondence with K. Cooperman to discuss 0.20 
review of documents (0.20). 

03/31/11 SAS Prepare processing specification for vendor 0.60 
relative to Greenberg production and addition 
to Relativity database for attorney analysis (.40); 
correspond with D. Bach re same (.20). 



BUT Z E L LON G 
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• UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
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Account Number 000 141216-0007 
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RE: GENERAL MOTORS NOVA SCOTIA FINANCE COMPANY 

.. PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

Taxl.D.No 

Suite JOO ISO west left'erson 
Ildroit, Micbi8l'" 48226 

T.313225700D F.31322S7080. 
wwwJnltzei.eom 

April 7,2011 

Invoice No. 8497252 

95,975.50 



BUTlE L LONG 
ATTORNE-r:S AND COUNSELORS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account NumberOOO141216-QOlO 
(Privileged and Confidenliallnformalion) 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES pOsted through March 31. 2011 
RE: MONTHLY FEE STATEMENTS 

'~mekee~er 
Shareholder . 
Barry N. Seidel 0.20 hours at 
Total For Shareholder 0.20 

. Associate 
Katie L. Cooperman 5.30 hours at 
Total For Associate 5.30 

raxID.No 

Suite 100 ISO West Jefferson 
Detroit, Michigon48226 

~3132257000 F,31322570&O 
www.butzel.oom 

Apn17,2011 

Invoice No. 8497253 

Tot!! 

$750.00 $150.00 
$150.00 

$425.00 $2,252.50 
$2,252.50 

I 
.1 



BUTZEL LONG 
ATTORNEYS AND COUNSELOkS 

a professional corporation 

UNSECURED CREDITORS COMMITTEE OF 
GENERAL MOTORS CORPORATION 

Account Number: 000141216-0010 

(Privileged and Confidential Information) 
PROFESSIONAL SERVICES posted through March 31. 2011 

Date 

03/04/11 

03/08/11 

03/09/11 

n"l/lnJ'll 
VVI IVI I I 

03/11/11 

-03/11/11 

03/16/11 

RE: MONTHLY fEE STATEMENTS 
Tkpr 

KLC 

KLC 

KLC 

-VIr-

"'"'-
BNS 

KLC 

KlC 

NglTgtlve Description 

Revise February proformas. 

Correspondence with accounting re: invoice 
revisions for monthly statement due to expedited 
schedule. 

Further revisions to February invoices re: monthly 
fee statement. 

DiOft Febiuary' rnonthiy iee statement 

Review monthly statement for February 2011-

Revise February monthly statement. 

Correspondence with Seidel re: Xad invoice; 
correspondence with C. Basler !AlixJ re: same; 
correspondence with accounfing re: same. 

PROFESSIONAL SERVICES 

... : .. --~- .. ~.: .. - .... , ..... 

TaxLD.No 

Suite tOO tSOWcstl_ 
Detroi4MtciUgan 48226 

T: 3t3 225 7000 F: 313225 7080 
www.bIltzef.UlID. 

April 7. 2011 

Invoice No. 8497253 

H2Y!l 
2.50 

0.20 

0.40 

LiD 

0.20 

0.80 

0.30 

2,402.50 




