IN THE UNITED STATESBANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK
______________ - - ——- - e X

Inre . Chapter 11

MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, €t al., :  CaseNo. 09-50026
f/k/a Genera Motors Corp., et al. :
Jointly Administered

Debtors.
Objection Deadline: December 30,
2010, by 4:00 p.m. ET
.............. - - ——— - ----- X Hearing Date: December 15, 2010

AMENDED FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION OF
PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERSLLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS
SPECIAL ACCOUNTANTSAND TAX ADVISORSTO THE DEBTORSAND
DEBTORSIN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM
JUNE 1, 2009 THROUGH JULY 9, 2009

Name of Applicant: PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP (“PwC")

Authorized to provide professional Debtors and debtors-in-possession

servicesto:

Date of Retention: Order retaining PwC nunc pro tunc to June
1, 2009 entered on May 18, 2010

Period for which compensation and June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009 (the

reimbursement are sought: "Fee Period")

Amount of Compensation sought as $1,511,839.20 (80% of

actual, reasonable, and necessary: $1,889,799.00)

Amount of Expense Reimbursement sought

as actual, reasonable, and necessary: $187,269.80

Thisisa(n): _X_ monthly X interim X fina application.

No time was expended for fee application preparation.

! PwC submits thisfinal fee application as an amendment to the final fee application filed on November 15, 2010 [Docket No.
7779]. We hereby request additional feesin the amount of $112,073.10 in relation to the Sales and use Bankruptcy Matters
project.



SUMMARY BY PROJECT

Special Accounting Services

Special Projects- Plan B

TSA

GMNA Technica Accounting

Employee Benefits Technical Accounting

Technical Accounting

Sales and use Bankruptcy Matters
Subtotal - Special Accounting Services

Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations
Bankruptcy Billing and Obligations
Subtotal - Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations

Total Hours and Compensation

SUMMARY OF EXPENDITURES

Hours

3,358.20
1,069.50
669.60
1,322.40
411.10
301.60
7,132.40

11.10
11.10

7,143.50

Total
Compensation

$844,280.60
$296,621.70
$160,413.10
$350,876.20
$121,094.30
$112,073.10
$1,885,359.00

$4,440.00
$4,440.00

$1,889,799.00

PwC professionals incurred the following expenditures during this Compensation Period.

Transaction Type
Airfare
Lodging
Meals
Mileage Allowance
Parking
Public/ground transportation
Rental Car
Subtotal -

Total Expenditures

Expenditures
$66,558.90
$77,512.18
$18,786.73

$2,486.00
$2,557.00
$16,518.49
$2,850.50
$187,269.80

$187,269.80



IN THE UNITED STATESBANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

Inre . Chapter 11

MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, et al., :  Case No. 09-50026
f/k/a Genera Motors Corp., et al. :
Jointly Administered
Debtors.
Objection Deadline: December 6,
2010, by 4:00 p.m. ET
.............. - - ——— - ----- X Hearing Date: TBD

AMENDED FIRST AND FINAL APPLICATION OF
PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERSLLP FOR ALLOWANCE OF COMPENSATION
FOR SERVICES RENDERED AND FOR REIMBURSEMENT OF EXPENSES AS
SPECIAL ACCOUNTANTSAND TAX ADVISORSTO THE DEBTORSAND
DEBTORSIN POSSESSION FOR THE PERIOD FROM
JUNE 1, 2009 THROUGH JULY 9, 2009

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP (“PwC”), Specia Accountants and Tax Advisors for the
above-captioned debtors and debtors in possession (collectively, the "Debtors"), submits this
amended first and final fee application (the " Application")* for the period from June 1, 2009
through July 9, 2009 seeking (i) compensation in the amount of $1,889,799.00 for the reasonable
and necessary accounting and tax advisory services PwC rendered to the Debtors during the fee
period; and (ii) reimbursement for the actual and necessary expense PwC incurred during the fee
period in the amount of $187,269.80. In support of this Application, PwC respectfully states as
follows:

1. On August 7, 2009, this Court entered the Interim Compensation Order. Pursuant

! The Debtors submit this Application pursuant to sections 330 and 331 of title 11 of the United States Code (the "Bankruptcy Code"), Rule 2016
of the Federal Rules of Bankruptcy Procedure (the "Bankruptcy Rules"), the Order Authorizing the Employment and Retention of
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP as Special Accountants and Tax Advisors for the Debtors and Debtors in Possession Nunc Pro Tunc to the Petition
Date, dated May 18, 2010 [Docket N0.6324] (the "Retention Order"), and the Local Bankruptcy Rules of Bankruptcy Practice and Procedure for
the Southern District of New York (the "Local Rules").



to the procedures set forth in the Interim Compensation Order, professionals may request
monthly compensation and reimbursement, and the Notice Parties (as defined in the Interim
Compensation Order) may object to such requests. If an objection to a professiona’s request is
not filed and served by the Objection Deadline, the Professional shall file a certificate of no
objection with the Court, after which the Debtors shall be authorized to pay each Professional the
Actual Interim Payment equal to the lesser of (i) 80% of the fees and 100% of the expenses

requested in the Monthly Fee Application (the “Maximum Monthly Payment™) or (ii) 80% of the

fees and 100% of the expenses not subject to an objection.

2. PwC isfiling the attached fee statement (the “ Statement”) for compensation for
professional services rendered and reimbursement of disbursements made in these cases during
the Fee Period. The Statement contains detailed time logs describing the actual and necessary
services provided by PwC for the hourly services during the Fee Period, as well as other detailed
information required to be included in fee applications. The Statement is comprised of severa
exhibits which are attached hereto as:

- Exhibit A, provides a summary of the hours and compensation by project;

- Exhibit B, provides the name and position of each professional, cumulative hours
worked, billing rates for the hourly compensation, and the corresponding
compensation requested;

- Exhibit C, provides the daily activity descriptions for the hourly compensation,
including the activity description, time and billing rates associated with each activity;

- Exhibit D, provides the expenditures incurred by type; and
- Exhibit E, provides the details of the expenditures incurred by date.

REASONABLE AND NECESSARY SERVICES RENDERED BY PWC DURING THE FEE PERIOD

3. Thisisthe amended first and final application for interim compensation that PwC
has filed with the Court in these chapter 11 cases. The following itemization breaks down the
services rendered by PwC by the service categories indicated:
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Total
Hours Compensation

Special Accounting Services

Specia Projects- Plan B 3,358.20 $844,280.60
TSA 1,069.50 $296,621.70
GMNA Technical Accounting 669.60 $160,413.10
Employee Benefits Technical Accounting 1,322.40 $350,876.20
Technical Accounting 411.10 $121,094.30
Sales and use Bankruptcy Matters 301.60 $112,073.10
Subtotal - Special Accounting Services 7,132.40  $1,885,359.00
Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations
Bankruptcy Billing and Obligations 11.10 $4,440.00
Subtotal - Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations 11.10 $4,440.00
Total Hoursand Compensation 7,143.50 $1,889,799.00
A. SERVICES RENDERED - HOURLY FEES
4. Overall, PwC provided accounting assi stance and additional resourcesto GM for

certain technical accounting, SEC reporting, evaluated the expected effects of applying fresh
start accounting, and other project management activities during bankruptcy. The substantial
portion of the engagement required working with and providing additional resourcesto the
Corporate Controller's staff as they managed the bankruptcy accounting requirements as well as

changes to contracts during the bankruptcy period prior to the 363 Sale.

5. Special Projects - Plan B - (3,358.20 hours, $844,280.60 fees) - Provided

additional resourcesto assist GM's Corporate and GMNA Technical Accounting and SEC
Reporting staffs with the surge of activity and issues associated with the bankruptcy filing and
related transactions; and assisted Russ Bratley and Keith Causey with issues related to separating
the companies in the Section 363 sale and consulting and other advisory assistance around
bankruptcy management and strategy. Thisincluded: reading the asset purchase agreement,

identification of bankruptcy accounting issues, assistance with the old GM carve out plan,



identifying intercompany account balances and the intercompany issues related to the separation
upon the GM carve-out, assistance in validating information provided in the filing of First Day
Motions, considering potential accounting implications for alternative emergence strategies,
identification of internal control changes necessary for appropriately accounting for bankruptcy
and subsequent emergence, identification of disclosure examples from other companies filings
and providing disclosure recommendations for certain public filings during thistime period. The
scope of this project also included assisting the Controller's staff resolve the identification of, and
accounting for, leases that were modified or canceled during the bankruptcy period and other
accounting implications for those | eases.

6. TSA - (1,069.50 hours, $296,621.70 fees) - Provided assistance in reviewing the
Transaction Service Agreement (TSA) agreements between GM and MLC, GM and Saab, GM
and Hummer, including, but not limited to, providing assistance to the Controller's staff in
eval uating the accounting implications related to these agreements, verifying that required
internal processes are in place to execute those agreements, and other items. The TSA's
contained general/high-level language regarding the services to be provided, many of the
conditions were difficult to interpret, and assistance was provided the Controller's staff to help
eval uate the agreement and to determine the details necessary to implement the TSA effectively.

7. GMNA Technical Accounting - (669.60 hours, $160,413.10 fees) - Provided

accounting assistance to Kelly Francis and her staff particularly related to accounting advisory
support for New Co/Old Co dedler issues. This assistance included accounting considerations
for dealer terminations and modifications to dealer agreements, assistance in the identification of,
and evaluating the accounting for, modifications to GMAC relationship and GM's investment in

GMAC, GM's purchase of the portion of CAMI that it did not already own, including valuation



services, and accounting considerations for the Brazilian CAP plan arrangement. We also
debriefed Kelly Francis and her staff on status of the Special Projects -Plan B activities, and held
discussions regarding asset impairment considerations.

8. Employee Benefits technical Accounting - (1,322.40 hours, $350,876.20 fees) -

Provided accounting advisory support and transaction assistance to Vince Greene and his staff.
This included accounting advisory support related to the implication of, and accounting for,
renegotiations of three union contracts as a result of the bankruptcy, including changes to the
UAW/VEBA settlement agreement, and the accounting for the new securities to be issued to the
VEBA, disclosure recommendations and process considerations to comply with new Pension
disclosures pursuant to FAS 132R-1, provide assistance in realigning employee benefits
accounting project management in response to control deficiencies identified during SOX 404
testing, prepare communications for various internal GM meetings to communicate the effects of
plan terminations and plan re-measurements, and debrief Vince Greene and his team on
outcomes of the status of Special Projects - Plan B activities.

9. Technical Accounting - (411.10 hours, $121,094.30 fees) - Provided ongoing

accounting advisory support for bankruptcy related questions to support Nick Cyprus's direct
reports, particularly Brian Leiter (Corporate Accounting) and Jim Jordan (SEC Reporting). This
included providing accounting advisory support for complex contracts entered or modified
during the bankruptcy period and assistance with disclosure considerations for these contracts
including advice for accounting for the Delphi arrangements, potential Hummer sale, potential
deconsolidation of Adam Opel, Brazilian VAT Tax accounting, asset impairment considerations,
no action letter assistance with the SEC, providing updates to Brian Leiter and discussion Special

Projects-Plan B accounting considerations with him, and revenue recognition for roadside



assistance.

10.  Sdesand use Bankruptcy Matters - (301.60 hours, $112,073.10) - Provided
additional resourcesto assist GM's Corporate Tax Staff with the surge of activity and issues
associated with the bankruptcy filing and related transactions; and assisted Fred Diiorio and
George Schneider with issues related to separating the companies in the Section 363 sale and
consulting and other assi stance around transaction management and strategy. Thisincluded:
documentation of the separation relative to transactional tax exemptions, registration issues,
identification of bankruptcy sales and use tax issues, identifying other issues related to
bankruptcy and company separation.

11. Bankruptcy Billing and Obligations - (11.10 hours, $4,440.00 fees) - PwC

bankruptcy retention and billing professionals provided consultations to the GM team regarding
preparation of and completing time trackers, travel guidance, and general court billing
reguirements.

12. PwC charged and now requests those fees that are reasonable and customary in
this marketplace for similar chapter 11 cases. The compensation structure (e.g. fixed-fee and
hourly rates) and the summaries provided represent customary fees and rates that are routinely
billed to PwC’s many clients. Based on the compensation structure and the services performed
by each individua during the Fee Period, the total reasonable vaue of such services rendered
during the Fee Period is $1,889,799.00. PwC accounting, tax and other advisory professionals
expended atotal of 7,143.50 hours working on these chapter 11 cases during the Fee Period.
PwC's blended hourly rate for the services provided during the Fee Period is $264.56. In
accordance with the factors enumerated in section 330 of the Bankruptcy Code, the amount of

fees requested is fair and reasonable given: (a) the complexity of these chapter 11 cases; (b) the



time expended; (c) the nature and extent of the services rendered; (d) the value of such services,
and (e) the costs of comparable services other than in a case under the Bankruptcy Code.

13.  Inaddition, the Statement: (@) identifies the individuals who rendered servicesin
each subject matter (as defined below); (b) describes each activity or service that each individual
performed; and (c) states the number of hours (in half-hour increments, as approved in the
Retention Order) spent by each individua providing the hourly services.

14.  Tothebest of PwC's knowledge, this Application complies with sections 330 and
331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy Rules, the U.S. Trustee Guidelines, Local Rule

2016-2 and the Interim Compensation Order.

REASONABLE AND NECESSARY EXPENDITURES INCURRED BY PwC DURING THE FEE PERIOD

15.  PwC professionalsincurred the following expenses by project:

Transaction Type Expenditures
Airfare $66,558.90
Lodging $77,512.18
Meals $18,786.73
Mileage Allowance $2,486.00
Parking $2,557.00
Public/ground transportation $16,518.49
Rental Car $2,850.50
Subtotal $187,269.80
Total Expenditures $187,269.80

RELIEF REQUESTED RETENTION AND CONTINUING DISINTERESTEDNESS OF PWC

16.  The Retention Order authorized the Debtors to retain PwC as its Special
Accountants and Tax Advisors effective as of the Petition Date in connection with these chapter
11 cases and all related matters. The Debtors are authorized to compensate PwC in accordance
with the procedures set forth in sections 330 and 331 of the Bankruptcy Code, the Bankruptcy
Rules, the Loca Rules, the guidelines established by the U.S. Trustee (the "U.S. Trustee
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Guidelines") and such other procedures as may be fixed by order of the Court.

17.  Except as otherwise disclosed in the Declaration of Douglas Tanner in Support
of the application of Motors Liquidation Company for entry of order pursuant to 11 U.SC. 8§
327(a) and Fed. R. Bankr. P. 2014 authorizing the retention and employment of
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP as Special Accountants and Tax Advisors Nunc Pro Tunc to the
Petition Date (the "Declaration™) filed on May 18, 2009 [Docket No. 5788], to the best of PwC's
knowledge, PwC does not hold or represent any interest adverse to the Debtors or their estates
and isadisinterested person as defined in section 101(14) of the Bankruptcy Code.

18.  PwC may have represented, may currently represent or in the future may
represent partiesin interest in connection with matters unrelated to the Debtors in these chapter
11 cases. PwC disclosed its connections to partiesin interest that it has been able to ascertain
using its reasonable efforts in the Declaration. |f PwC becomes aware of material new
information related to these chapter 11 cases, PwC will file a supplemental declaration with the
Court.

19. During the Fee Period, PwC performed the services for which it is seeking
compensation on behalf of or for the Debtors and their estates and not on behalf of any
committee, creditor or other person.

20.  Except asprovided herein or in the application to retain PwC, PwC has received
no payment and no promises for payment from any source for services rendered or to be
rendered in any capacity whatsoever in connection with these chapter 11 cases.

21.  Pursuant to Bankruptcy Rule 201(b), PwC has not shared , nor has P2C agreed to
share (a) any compensation it received or may received with another person other than with the

partners, counsel and associates of PwC or (b) any compensation another person or party
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received or may receive.

WHEREFORE, PwC respectfully requests that the Court approves the interim allowance
to be made to PwC for the Interim Period in the sum of $1,889,799.00, as compensation for
necessary professional services rendered, and the sum of $187,269.80, for reimbursement of
actual necessary costs and expenses, for a total of $2,077,068.80; that the Debtors be authorized
and directed to pay to PwC the outstanding amount of such sums; and for such other and further
relief as may be just and proper.

WHEREFORE, PwC respectfully requests final approxlzal and payment of (a)
Compensation for professional services rendered as tax advisor for the Debtors in the sum of
$1,889,799.00 incurred during the Final Period, (b) reimbursement of actual and necessary
expenses incurred in the amount of $187,269.80 during the Final Period; and (c) such other and
further relief as this Court may deem just and proper,

WHEREFORE, PwC requests that is be allowed reimbursement for its fees and expenses
incurred during the Fee Period and that such fees and expenses be paid as administrative
expenses of the Debtors' estates.

Dated: December 10, 2010 PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS LLP

-

Dougras Tanner, Partner
PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS LLP
1900 St. Antoine Street

Detroit, MI 48226

Telephone: (646) 471-7282

Facsimile: (813) 329-4060

Special Accountants and Tax Advisors for the
Debtors and Debtors in Possession
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IN THE UNITED STATES BANKRUPTCY COURT
FOR THE SOUTHERN DISTRICT OF NEW YORK

................................ X
Inre Chapter 11
MOTORS LIQUIDATION COMPANY, et al., Case No. 09-50026
f/k/a General Motors Corp., et al. '
Debtors. : Jointly Administered
............. — X

VERIFICATION OF DOUGLAS TANNER
Douglas Tanner, hereby respectfully certifies and verifies as follows:

1. T am a Partner in the applicant firm, PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP.

2. I have personally supervised many of the accounting and tax advisory services
rendered by PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP, as Special Accountants and Tax Advisors to the
Debtors and am familiar with all other work performed on behalf of the Partners and
professionals in the firm.

3. The facts set forth in the foregoing Application are true and correct to the best of
my knowledge, information and belief.

PRICEWATERHOUSECOOPERS LLP

e

DOU@LAS TANNER




Schedule of Exhibits

SERVICES RENDERED

- Exhibit A, provides a summary of the hours and compensation by project;

SERVICES RENDERED - HOURLY FEES

- Exhibit B, provides the name and position of each hourly professional, cumulative
hours worked, hourly billing rates for the compensation, and the corresponding fees
requested;

- Exhibit C, provides the daily activity descriptions for the hourly compensation,
including the activity description, time and billing rates associated with each activity.

EXPENSES

- Exhibit D, provides the expenditures incurred by transaction type; and

- Exhibit E, provides the details of the expenditures incurred by date, includes the
vendor and description.



Motors Liquidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit A
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors

Summary of Hours and Compensation by Project

For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Hours Compensation

Special Accounting Services

Special Projects- Plan B 3,358.20 $844,280.60

TSA 1,069.50 $296,621.70

GMNA Technical Accounting 669.60 $160,413.10

Employee Benefits Technical Accounting 1,322.40 $350,876.20

Technical Accounting 411.10 $121,094.30

Sales and use Bankruptcy Matters 301.60 $112,073.10
Subtotal - Special Accounting Services 7,132.40 $1,885,359.00
Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations

Bankruptcy Billing and Obligations 11.10 $4,440.00
Subtotal - Bankruptcy Requirements and Obligations 11.10 $4,440.00
Total Hours and Compensation 7,143.50 $1,889,799.00

Page 1 of 1

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liquidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit B
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Summary of Hours and Compensation by Professionals - Hourly Professional Services
For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Professional Position Rate Hours  Compensation
Douglas G Tanner Partner (US Technical) $610 46.60 $28,426.00
Brian D Decker Partner $500 55.00 $27,500.00
Faustino Montero Partner $500 1.20 $600.00
Gregory A Nowak Partner $572 2.00 $1,144.00
John M. Pope Partner $500 11.30 $5,650.00
Nicole J Pinder Partner $500 6.50 $3,250.00
Paul M Balas Partner $500 2.00 $1,000.00
Philip D Treccagnoli Partner $325 8.00 $2,600.00
Ralph S Cornell Partner $572 27.70 $15,844.40
Robert C Whitley Partner $500 290.30 $145,150.00
Robert L Bishop Partner $500 71.70 $35,850.00
Theresa M Gee Partner $500 33.00 $16,500.00
J. Timothy Winks Senior Managing Director $480 0.40 $192.00
James B Levinson Senior Managing Director $480 0.50 $240.00
Robert J Fields Senior Managing Director $480 6.70 $3,216.00
Aileen Daversa Director $300 1.00 $300.00
Anastasia S Brown Director $300 13.40 $4,020.00
Bernard Ottenlips Director $456 1.00 $456.00
Catherine R Marron Director $300 56.60 $16,980.00
Christopher Yarris Director $300 237.70 $71,310.00
Denis Roy Director $300 2.50 $750.00
Glen E Goldbach Director $300 23.20 $6,960.00
Gregory E Gursky Director $456 42.70 $19,471.20
Gregory Nicholson Director $300 71.30 $21,390.00
James J Rice Director $300 231.00 $69,300.00
Jared T Curless Director $456 2.00 $912.00
Jeffrey M Mandler Director $300 241.30 $72,390.00
John Benedetti Director $300 177.10 $53,130.00
Makoto Takahashi Director $456 1.00 $456.00

Page 1 0f 4

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liquidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit B
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Summary of Hours and Compensation by Professionals - Hourly Professional Services
For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Professional Position Rate Hours  Compensation
Paul Loubser Director $300 73.70 $22,110.00
Philip Koos Director $216 45.00 $9,720.00
Ravindra Ramachandran Director $456 0.50 $228.00
Reagan B Strey Director $300 21.10 $6,330.00
Rebecca Mihalko Director $300 164.60 $49,380.00
Robert W Khnittle 11 Director $300 110.00 $33,000.00
Shannon Kent Chambless Director $300 68.50 $20,550.00
Stephen B Danton Director $456 53.60 $24,441.60
Charles Finn Director (US Technical) $400 31.60 $12,640.00
Julianna Kathryn Sheeran Director (US Technical) $400 148.90 $59,560.00
Rachel A Ferguson Director (US Technical) $400 10.80 $4,320.00
Jason L Crouch Senior Manager $300 125.00 $37,500.00
Mark A Samuelson Senior Manager $300 119.30 $35,790.00
Scott J Schueller Senior Manager $300 33.80 $10,140.00
Andrea Clark Smith Manager (Bankruptcy) $400 11.10 $4,440.00
Adriana Yepes Manager $250 152.60 $38,150.00
Amy M Sutter Manager $180 212.30 $38,214.00
Bradley Scott Little Manager $250 99.80 $24,950.00
Brett T Valentine Manager $250 146.10 $36,525.00
Bryan M Bloom Manager $250 36.40 $9,100.00
Christopher Dimuzio Manager $250 117.40 $29,350.00
Christopher Rush Manager $180 94.90 $17,082.00
Dwight Blackman Manager $250 196.40 $49,100.00
Jacob Stephen Brown Manager $250 137.50 $34,375.00
Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager $250 118.60 $29,650.00
Julie L Bogas Manager $250 2.20 $550.00
Kyra Grenier Manager $250 2.60 $650.00
Michael J Knowles Manager $250 205.80 $51,450.00
Nicole Thiel Manager $404 50.20 $20,280.80

Page 2 of 4

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liquidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit B
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Summary of Hours and Compensation by Professionals - Hourly Professional Services
For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Professional Position Rate Hours  Compensation
Randal D Turner Manager $250 123.20 $30,800.00
Rebecca R Taylor Manager $250 90.90 $22,725.00
Robert Demeter Manager $250 117.90 $29,475.00
Ryan J Sockalosky Manager $250 32.80 $8,200.00
Sarah E Massimino Manager $404 10.90 $4,403.60
Simon C Barlow Manager $250 36.10 $9,025.00
Simon Johannes Brameier Manager $250 16.00 $4,000.00
Steven J Koritzinsky Manager $404 0.50 $202.00
Aaron Kevin Cowan Senior Associate $207 172.40 $35,686.80
Aditya Jain Senior Associate $207 274.50 $56,821.50
Andy Russell White Senior Associate $207 161.00 $33,327.00
Brian C Kocinski Senior Associate $207 181.40 $37,549.80
Charu Handa Senior Associate $160 95.00 $15,200.00
Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate $207 169.90 $35,169.30
John Joseph Walker Senior Associate $130 96.40 $12,532.00
Kyle Anderson Senior Associate $271 4.00 $1,084.00
Lindsay N Jenkins Senior Associate $271 20.60 $5,582.60
Mark Stachnik Senior Associate $207 145.80 $30,180.60
Mary Katherine Presberg Senior Associate $207 205.20 $42,476.40
Michelle R Fera Senior Associate $207 6.00 $1,242.00
Rulfo Fernando Hernandez ~ Senior Associate $207 59.50 $12,316.50
Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate $207 184.10 $38,108.70
Waltreese Carroll Senior Associate $271 20.90 $5,663.90
Ali Kadhim Al-Khafaji Associate $175 9.00 $1,575.00
Angela J McLeod Associate $133 139.60 $18,566.80
April M Dickey Associate $133 82.80 $11,012.40
Arta lvezaj Associate $80 7.30 $584.00
Ashley L Martin Associate $175 9.30 $1,627.50
Brian T Chrzanowski Associate $175 8.90 $1,557.50

Page 3 of 4

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liquidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit B
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Summary of Hours and Compensation by Professionals - Hourly Professional Services
For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Professional Position Rate Hours  Compensation
Christopher J Allen Associate $133 88.00 $11,704.00
Christopher J Vega Associate $80 26.60 $2,128.00
Danya B. Conner Associate $80 8.00 $640.00
Joe Jennings Associate $133 150.20 $19,976.60
Kristin Szkrybalo Associate $100 111.10 $11,110.00
Marco P Noetzli Associate $133 0.50 $66.50
Michael A Ratliff Associate $175 6.90 $1,207.50
Rebecca L Knight Associate $175 2.00 $350.00
Ugne Zeng Associate $175 3.30 $577.50
Cheryl L Balconi Administrative $80 1.00 $80.00
Keisha L Price Administrative $80 8.00 $640.00
Madhura V Wallace Administrative $60 1.00 $60.00

Total Hours and Compensation

7,143.50  $1,889,799.00

Page 4 of 4

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liguidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit C
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors

Details of Hours and Compensation by Project and Date - Hourly Professional Services

For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total
Date Name Position Description Rate Hours Compensation
Special Accounting Services
Special Projects- Plan B
6/1/2009 Christopher J Allen Associate 0709H0001: Liquidation basis of accounting research and $133.00 4.00 $532.00

deck preparation ARM 5590.13, EITF 88-25, SOP 93-3
interpretation Research.

6/1/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0002: Liquidation basis of accounting research and $133.00 4.00 $532.00
deck preparation ARM 5590.13, EITF 88-25, SOP 93-3
interpretation Research.

6/1/2009 Michelle R Fera Senior Associate 0709H0003: Liquidation basis of accounting research and $207.00 3.00 $621.00
deck preparation ARM 5590.13, EITF 88-25, SOP 93-3
interpretation Research.

6/1/2009 Michelle R Fera Senior Associate 0709H0004: Liquidation basis of accounting research and $207.00 3.00 $621.00
deck preparation ARM 5590.13, EITF 88-25, SOP 93-3
interpretation Research.

6/1/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0005: Work on SEC requirements steps for APA. $300.00 5.50 $1,650.00

6/1/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0006: Meeting with Van Beek, Knittle, Adi Jain to $300.00 2.00 $600.00
discuss APA in the context of carve out requirements.

6/1/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0007: Work with VanBeek on carve out $300.00 2.00 $600.00
requirements presentation.

6/1/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0008: Prepare for and discussed carve-out requests $300.00 1.50 $450.00
based on APA (yarris, jain, benedetti, van beek, schueller,
knittle).

6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0009: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 4.00 $1,200.00

6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0010: Nonworking Travel Time Chicago/Detroit $300.00 2.00 $600.00
(50% of time, no work performed).

6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0011: Preparation for Causey meeting - $500.00 1.00 $500.00

Intercompany Issues.
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6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0012: Meet with Keith Causey to discuss $500.00 0.80 $400.00
Intercompany Accounting Issues created by APA.

6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0013: Update Plan B status report and review fixed $300.00 3.50 $1,050.00
asset workplan.

6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0014: Meet with Brian Leiter to set goals for D&T $500.00 0.30 $150.00
accounting issue discussion.

6/1/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0015: Updated summary from call with Cody $250.00 0.10 $25.00
Smith for comments received from C. Whitley.

6/1/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0016: Review GM project Information. $250.00 3.00 $750.00

6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0017: Resource planning and administrative $300.00 0.80 $240.00
activities - planned staff to be used, issued instructions,
called related staff.

6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0018: Meet with CJ Finn to review OldCo carve- $500.00 0.50 $250.00
out accounting requirements related to SEC reporting
iSsues.

6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0019: Reviewed GM Bankruptcy presentations and $250.00 2.30 $575.00
workplans for Plan B.

6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0020: Develop GM org chart and corresponding $207.00 0.90 $186.30
workstream relationship diagram for C. Yarris.

6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0021: Evaluate accounting arguments for Fresh $500.00 2.50 $1,250.00
Start accounting vs. Financial Accounting Standard 141 in
connection with 363 sale.

6/1/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0022: Prepare presentation in preparation for $207.00 2.80 $579.60
meeting with Deloitte. Presentation covered the APA and
other accounting issues.

6/1/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0023: Review the TSA approach and timing and $500.00 3.00 $1,500.00

coordiante assignments.
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6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0024: Prepared status report for partners. $300.00 2.30 $690.00
6/1/2009 Julie L Bogas Manager 0709H0025: Held meeting on government compliance $250.00 0.90 $225.00
workstream status reporting and workplans with S. Brown
(PwC), S. Herbst (GM), M. Walker (GM), and C.
Yankley (Ernst & Young).
6/1/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0026: Discuss/review presentation to be used at $250.00 1.00 $250.00
meeting with external auditors (S. Schueller (part), CJ
Finn, T. Van Beek).
6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0027: Administrative - filed for access badge and $250.00 0.60 $150.00
internet access.
6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0028: Working session to discuss Plan B status $300.00 0.50 $150.00
updates.
6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0029: Review APA for contracts workstream $207.00 0.70 $144.90
impacts.
6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle I Director 0709H0030: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 1.10 $330.00
6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0031: Review APA & Seller Disclosure Statements.  $500.00 3.50 $1,750.00
6/1/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0032: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 1.70 $351.90
determine the accounting for the Preferred Stock and
Warrants.
6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0033: Prepared slide outlining intercompany $300.00 1.50 $450.00
account treatment under the APA.
6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0034: Met with Simon B. and Adriana Y. to $250.00 0.40 $100.00
discuss Plan B project.
6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0035: Review APA for contracts workstream $207.00 2.30 $476.10
impacts.
6/1/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0036: Printing of Reference Materials, 10-K, Q1 $300.00 1.00 $300.00

Chambless

10-Q.
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6/1/2009 Julie L Bogas Manager 0709H0037: Updated government compliance $250.00 1.30 $325.00
workstream status reporting and workplans based on
11:00am meeting.
6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0038: Met with S. Schueller to discuss SoP 90-7. $250.00 0.60 $150.00
6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0039: Reviewed technical guidance around $250.00 1.40 $350.00
bankruptcy accounting.
6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0040: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 1.00 $300.00
6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0041: Read Asset Purchase Agreement (APA) and $300.00 3.00 $900.00
schedules and prepared summary slides for Tuesday
(Bratley) meeting.
6/1/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0042: Prepare presentation in preparation for $207.00 3.40 $703.80
meeting with Deloitte. Presentation covered the APA and
other accounting issues.
6/1/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0043: Reviewed technical guidance related to $250.00 2.70 $675.00
liabilities subject to compromise.
6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0044: Review notes from National for Contracts $207.00 1.00 $207.00
workstream impacts/considerations.
6/1/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0045: Travel Time during normal business hours. $300.00 0.50 $150.00
Chambless Total nonworking travel time 1 hour.
6/1/2009 Brian C Kocinski Senior Associate 0709H0046: Work with Detroit Repro department to have $207.00 1.80 $372.60
Purchase Agreement documents produced.
6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0047: Review discussion points for D&T meeting. $500.00 0.40 $200.00
6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0048: Meet with D&T to discuss accounting issues $500.00 2.50 $1,250.00
associated with Plan B - Schueller, Tanner, Finn.
6/1/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0049: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 0.90 $270.00
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6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0050: Met with Ernst & Young to discuss carve- $300.00 1.00 $300.00
out requirements (Yarris, Knittle from PwC and parker
from Ernst & Young).
6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0051: Merge JB SEC requirements steps with CJ $207.00 2.20 $455.40
SEC requirements steps for J. Benedetti.
6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0052: Discussed carve-out requests based on APA $300.00 1.00 $300.00
(yarris, jain, benedetti, van beek, schueller, knittle).
6/1/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0053: Meeting with Benedetti, Knittle, Adi Jain to $207.00 2.00 $414.00
discuss APA in the context of carve out requirements.
6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0054: Prepare Bratley Assistant Controller Deck $500.00 1.80 $900.00
Slides.
6/1/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0055: Update the issue tracker database for issues $250.00 0.30 $75.00
identified during call with Cody Smith related to
bankruptcy.
6/1/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0056: Finalized slides for Tuesday (Bratley) $300.00 0.90 $270.00
meeting.
6/1/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0057: Research 10kwizard for 10-Ks filing under $207.00 1.50 $310.50
liquidation basis of accounting for J. Benedetti.
6/1/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0058: Work with Benedetti on carve out $207.00 2.10 $434.70
requirements presentation.
6/1/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0059: Prepare update to carve-out deck workplan $500.00 1.30 $650.00
requirements.
6/1/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0060: Meeting with Benedetti, Knittle, Adi Jain to $207.00 2.00 $414.00
discuss APA in the context of carve out requirements.
6/1/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0061: Prepare for and discussed carve-out requests $207.00 1.50 $310.50

based on APA (yarris, jain, benedetti, van beek, schueller,
knittle).
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6/1/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0062: Review GM project Information. $207.00 5.00 $1,035.00
6/1/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0063: Met with Simon B. and Jeff W.. to discuss $207.00 0.40 $82.80
Plan B project.
6/1/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0064: Reviewed technical guidance around $207.00 3.10 $641.70
bankruptcy accounting.
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0065: Working session to discuss updates to carv- $300.00 1.80 $540.00
out deck, deliverables, status of work plans, TSA and
other matters (yarris, knittle, whitley).
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0066: Daily update meeting with Ernst & Young $300.00 1.00 $300.00
LLP regarding carve-out work plans.
6/2/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0067: Meeting regarding liabilities subject to $250.00 0.40 $100.00
compromise with R. Taylor and S. Schueller (PwC).
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0068: Daily planning update meeting attendees $300.00 1.20 $360.00
include J. Rice and J. Handler (PwC).
6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0069: Meeting with S. Schueller (PwC) to discuss $207.00 0.50 $103.50
SOP 90-7 and Financial Accounting Standard 141R
accounting issue.
6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0070: Meeting with S. Schueller (PwC) to discuss $207.00 0.50 $103.50
SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting Standard 141R
whitepaper.
6/2/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0071: TSA planning meeting attended by J. Rice $500.00 0.50 $250.00
(PwC).
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0072: Met with K. Causey (GM) to discuss carve- $300.00 2.00 $600.00
out requirements slide deck.
6/2/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0073: TSA staffing discussion with A. Block (GM).  $500.00 1.20 $600.00
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6/2/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0074: Preparation of binders for the client on the $133.00 8.00 $1,064.00
liquidation basis of accounting in addition to printing
documentation and presentations for the morning and
afternoon meetings.
6/2/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0075: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 0.80 $240.00
6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0076: Preparation for R. Bratley (GM) Assistant $500.00 0.50 $250.00
Controller Meeting.
6/2/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0077: Participation in meeting with R. Bratley $500.00 1.00 $500.00
(GM).
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0078: Attend weekly Controller's conference call $300.00 1.00 $300.00
hosted by R. Bratley (GM).
6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0079: Meeting with R. Bratley (GM) Assistant $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Controllers.
6/2/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0080: Attend weekly R.Bratley (GM) Accounting $300.00 1.20 $360.00
Plan B PMO conference call.
6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0081: Draft emails related to 10-Ks received & $207.00 0.40 $82.80
completed print request.
6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0082: Meeting with K. Causey (GM) to review Old $500.00 2.00 $1,000.00
Co. carve-out plans and requirements draft.
6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0083: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 0.50 $103.50
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.
6/2/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0084: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 2.80 $840.00
6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0085: Review slides on liquidation basis of $207.00 0.20 $41.40
accounting.
6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0086: Review update on APA accounting issues. $207.00 0.20 $41.40
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6/2/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0087: GM onboarding requirements and project $207.00 1.50 $310.50
planning.

6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0088: Updated accounting model deliverable. $250.00 0.40 $100.00

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0089: Assist with finding first day motions and $207.00 0.40 $82.80
bankruptcy information for T. Van Beek (PwC).

6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0090: Drafted format for accounting model write- $250.00 1.40 $350.00
up.

6/2/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0091: Research 90-7 and ARM section 5590, and $300.00 2.50 $750.00

Chambless Bankruptcy Consulting Insights.

6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0092: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 0.50 $103.50
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0093: Develop flowchart for Contracts $207.00 2.50 $517.50
Workstream.

6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0094: Met with accounting policies team to discuss $300.00 0.50 $150.00
work stream status, resources and impacts on Old GM and
NewGM.

6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0095: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 2.20 $455.40
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0096: Review APA and seller disclosure $500.00 1.80 $900.00
statements.

6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0097: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise $250.00 1.90 $475.00
debt.

6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0098: Review APA and seller disclosure $300.00 1.50 $450.00
statements.
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6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0099: Review TSA and approach to TSA $500.00 1.50 $750.00
workstream.

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0100: Meeting to discuss Contracts Workstream $207.00 0.60 $124.20
(R. Turner and J. Crouch).

6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0101: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.50 $724.50
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0102: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise $250.00 3.00 $750.00
executory contracts.

6/2/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0103: Research 90-7 and ARM section 5590, and $300.00 0.50 $150.00

Chambless Bankruptcy Consulting Insights.

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0104: Update to Contracts workstream slides post $207.00 0.40 $82.80
meeting.

6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0105: Update the carve-out deck. $500.00 2.00 $1,000.00

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0106: Develop samples for Contracts workstream $207.00 0.80 $165.60
slides based on discussion.

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0107: Summarize additional 10-Ks on liquidation $207.00 0.20 $41.40
basis.

6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0108: Review GM contracts policy. $207.00 1.20 $248.40

6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0109: Revised carve-out requirements slide deck. $300.00 1.50 $450.00

6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0110: Formulate carve-out approach to fixed assets $500.00 1.90 $950.00

and Financial Accounting Standard 144 requirements
around asset groupings.

6/2/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0111: Update Plan B status and coordinate staff $300.00 3.00 $900.00
assignments.
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6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0112: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise $250.00 0.60 $150.00
debt.
6/2/2009 Brian C Kocinski Senior Associate 0709H0113: Review the Purrchase Agreements $207.00 2.10 $434.70
documents and deliver all documents to work stream leads.
6/2/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0114: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise $250.00 0.80 $200.00
executory contracts.
6/2/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0115: Review regarding the timing of when $250.00 0.10 $25.00
liabilities subject-to-compromise should be booked by the
client.
6/2/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0116: Research Financial Accounting Standard 13 $300.00 2.00 $600.00
Chambless and consulting insights associated with bankruptcy.
6/2/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0117: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 1.30 $269.10
determine the accounting for the Preferred Stock and
Warrants.
6/2/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0118: Update Contract slides from edits per team $207.00 0.90 $186.30
reviews.
6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0119: TSA workstream update and review. $500.00 0.50 $250.00
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0120: Review contracts and leasing requirements $300.00 2.10 $630.00
strategy.
6/2/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0121: Preparation for trial balance carve-out $500.00 0.80 $400.00
meeting with GM personnel.
6/2/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0122: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 1.20 $360.00
6/2/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0123: Reply to e-mails and update progress notes. $300.00 0.40 $120.00
6/2/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0124: Review contracts and leasing requirements $207.00 5.30 $1,097.10

strategy.
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6/2/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0125: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 6.20 $1,283.40

determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/2/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0126: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 1.50 $310.50
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/3/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0127: Lease Workstream Meeting with D. Snyder, $250.00 1.00 $250.00
D. Dotter (GM) and J. Benedetti (PwC).

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0128: Meeting with J. Crouch (PwC) to discuss $500.00 0.80 $400.00
Contract Flowchart process.

6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0129: Meeting with Whitley to discuss OldGM $300.00 0.30 $90.00
separation strategy.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0130: Meeting with Yarris to discuss Old GM $500.00 0.30 $150.00
separation strategy.

6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0131: Meeting with J. Benedetti (PwC) to discuss $300.00 1.00 $300.00
carve-out requirements slide deck.

6/3/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0132: Internal meeting with J. Benedetti(PwC) to $250.00 1.00 $250.00
discuss Lease workstream plans.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0133: Discuss project plan and issues for Danielle $500.00 0.80 $400.00
Synder for Leasing COE with Benedetti.

6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0134: Meeting with C. Finn, S. Schueller and S. $250.00 0.40 $100.00

Barlow (PwC) to discuss coordination between the
workstreams for bankruptcy work.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0135: Client Meeting with R. Wenderski (GM). $250.00 0.80 $200.00
6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0136: Client Meeting R. Wunderski and J. Davis $250.00 1.00 $250.00
(GM).
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6/3/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0137: Preparation of spreadsheet for B. Valentine $133.00 5.80 $771.40
Printing documents/presentation copies for Jason L
Crouch Filling out PwC GM contract spreadsheet for
various issues (327 issues, resolutions, types of service,
etc). Research on Monthly O operating R
6/3/2009 Aileen Daversa Director 0709H0138: Researching SEC filings of companies in $300.00 1.00 $300.00
bankruptcy.
6/3/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0139: Review Lease Workstream. $250.00 1.00 $250.00
6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0140: Review material for GM meeting with K. $500.00 1.30 $650.00
Francis (GM) regarding contracts.
6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0141: Update carve-out requirements slide deck. $300.00 1.50 $450.00
6/3/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0142: Prepare Old GM Carve-out presentation. $300.00 4.00 $1,200.00
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0143: Update S-1 detailed workplan for J. $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Benedetti (GM).
6/3/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0144: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 1.00 $207.00
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.
6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0145: Review intercompany accounting and $300.00 0.20 $60.00
preparing additional guidance.
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0146: Update Contracts slides and email to J. $207.00 0.30 $62.10
Crouch (PwC).
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0147: Draft email for S-1 workplan. $207.00 0.10 $20.70
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0148: Assist in finding no-action letters for T. Van $207.00 0.70 $144.90
Beek.
6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0149: Updated carve-out requirements slide deck. $300.00 2.00 $600.00
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6/3/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0150: Searching for and reviewing similar 363 $207.00 3.50 $724.50
Transactions in public filings.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0151: Reviewed 12/31/08 Liabilities Analysis. $250.00 1.60 $400.00

6/3/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0152: GM onboarding requirements and project $207.00 1.50 $310.50
planning.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0153: Preparation for carve-out for manufacturing $500.00 0.50 $250.00
facilities.

6/3/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0154: Review of current staff secondee $500.00 1.00 $500.00
assignments.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0155: Accounting Research and SoP 90-7 Analysis.  $250.00 1.20 $300.00

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0156: Review of aircraft motion and consideration $500.00 2.00 $1,000.00
of potential accounting implications.

6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0157: Develop IC diagram for New GM and Old $207.00 2.60 $538.20
GM.

6/3/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0158: Review draft Payroll Plan B workplan. $300.00 1.00 $300.00

6/3/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0159: Review Plan B Government Compliance $300.00 0.50 $150.00
draft weekly status update.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0160: Preparation for Carve-out for manufacturing $500.00 0.50 $250.00
facilities.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0161: Trial balance carve out for manufacturing $500.00 1.00 $500.00
facilities.

6/3/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0162: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.00 $621.00
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0163: Respond to emails regarding Contracts $207.00 0.10 $20.70

flowchart.
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6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0164: Update 1C example diagram. $207.00 1.50 $310.50

6/3/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0165: Meeting with D. Snyder (GM), E. Vogel, K. $250.00 1.00 $250.00
Steckel (KPMG) and J. Benedetti (PwC) to discuss
KPMG valuation work.

6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0166: Updated carve-out requirements slide deck $300.00 2.00 $600.00
with intercompany guidance.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0167: Engagement On Boarding. $250.00 1.00 $250.00

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0168: Review of Delphi accounting memorandums $500.00 0.50 $250.00
and historical transactions.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0169: Coordination on review of APA. $500.00 0.50 $250.00

6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0170: Create issue log and tracking schedule $250.00 0.40 $100.00
mechanism for bankruptcy related accounting issues.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0171: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise, $250.00 0.30 $75.00
specifically discounted liabilities.

6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0172: Preparation for meeting with R. Bratley $500.00 3.00 $1,500.00
(GM) on TSA.

6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0173: Review and update plan to assist IS&S with $250.00 0.80 $200.00
bankruptcy reporting/accounting needs.

6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0174: Analysis of liabilities subject to compromise, $250.00 1.10 $275.00
specifically reorganization items and classification.

6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0175: Research to determine definition and $250.00 0.30 $75.00
application of reorganization item.

6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0176: Prepare questions for legal counsel regarding ~ $300.00 0.50 $150.00
intercompany transaction.

6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0177: Update 1C example diagram. $207.00 0.60 $124.20

Page 14 of 421

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liguidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG)
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Details of Hours and Compensation by Project and Date - Hourly Professional Services

For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Exhibit C

Total
Date Name Position Description Rate Hours Compensation
6/3/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0178: Researching SEC filings of companies in $300.00 2.00 $600.00
Chambless bankruptcy.
6/3/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0179: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.50 $724.50
determine the accounting for the Preferred Stock and
Warrants.
6/3/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0180: Technical Accounting Research ARM 5590. $250.00 1.00 $250.00
6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0181: Resource planning and administrative $300.00 1.00 $300.00
activities to be used on various work streams for
execution.
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0182: Review Leasing detailed workplan to $207.00 0.70 $144.90
prepare for involvement in that workstream.
6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0183: Development of Plan B workplan. $250.00 1.00 $250.00
6/3/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0184: Update IC diagram and email to appropriate $207.00 1.20 $248.40
personnel.
6/3/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0185: Discussion of TSA approach and timing. $500.00 1.70 $850.00
6/3/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0186: Reviewed corporate center accounting and $300.00 2.00 $600.00
IS&S work plans.
6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0187: Meeting with R. Bratley (GM) to discuss $500.00 0.50 $250.00
approach to TSA.
6/3/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0188: Intercompany receivable analysis and $500.00 0.80 $400.00
memorandum sent to R. Bratley (GM).
6/3/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0189: Review IS&S Plan B workplan and make $250.00 0.80 $200.00
adjustments to customize workplan to M. Snyder's (GM)
needs.
6/3/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0190: Assist in preparing TSA deck. $207.00 3.70 $765.90
6/3/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0191: Update 1C example diagram. $207.00 1.50 $310.50
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6/3/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0192: Assist with the edits to the TSA deck for R. $207.00 2.50 $517.50
Bratley (GM).

6/3/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0193: Assist with updating carve-out requirements $207.00 2.30 $476.10
slide deck.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0194: Discuss project plan and issues for Danielle $300.00 0.80 $240.00
Synder for Leasing COE with Whitley.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0195: Internal meeting with A. Yepes (PwC) to $300.00 1.00 $300.00
discuss Lease workstream plans.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0196: Meeting with D. Snyder (GM), E. Vogel, K. $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Steckel (KPMG) and A. Yepes (PwC) to discuss KPMG
valuation work.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0197: Meeting with C. Yarris (PwC) to discuss $300.00 1.00 $300.00
carve-out requirements slide deck.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0198: Lease Workstream Meeting with D. Snyder, $300.00 1.00 $300.00
D. Dotter (GM) and A. Yepes(PwC).

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0199: Review S-1 workplan. $300.00 2.20 $660.00

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0200: Continued reviewing S-1 workplan. $300.00 2.00 $600.00

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0201: Continued reviewing and editing S-1 $300.00 2.00 $600.00
workplan.

6/3/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0202: Continued reviewing and editing S-1 $300.00 1.00 $300.00
workplan.

6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0203: Daily status meeting regarding bankruptcy $300.00 0.50 $150.00
work. Yarris, Whitley, Mandler, Rice, Knittle.

6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0204: Client Meeting - R. Wenderski. $250.00 0.40 $100.00

6/4/2009 Douglas G Tanner Partner (US 0709H0205: Meeting with C. Whitley (PwC) to discuss $610.00 1.00 $610.00

Technical) Plan B Bankruptcy.
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6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0206: Discussion with Leiter on accounting for $500.00 0.50 $250.00
rejected contracts.
6/4/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0207: Review of IS&S workplan for Plan B work $250.00 0.30 $75.00
with R. Knittle and J. Benedetti (R. Taylor only present
for part of meeting).
6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0208: Carve-out work stream meeting with Causey. $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Yarris, Whitley.
6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0209: Daily meeting with Keith Causey - Carve-out ~ $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Workstream.
6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0210: Discussion with Leiter on accounting for pre-  $500.00 1.50 $750.00
petition liabilities under SOP 90-7.
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0211: Client Meeting - R. Wenderski. $250.00 0.30 $75.00
6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0212: Daily update meeting with Ernst & Young $300.00 1.00 $300.00
LLP regarding carve-out work plans (yarris, knittle, Ernst
& Young).
6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0213: Review of accounting for initial lease $500.00 2.10 $1,050.00
exhibits from initial filing with John Benedetti.
6/4/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0214: Meeting with M. Walker (GM) on $300.00 1.50 $450.00
Government Compliance work stream requirements.
6/4/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0215: Meeting with M. Walker (GM) on $300.00 0.70 $210.00
Government Compliance work stream requirements.
6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0216: Nonworking Travel Time Chicago/Detroit $300.00 2.00 $600.00
(50% of time, no work performed).
6/4/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0217: Review of GMNA Fresh Start Accounting $250.00 4.00 $1,000.00
Proposal.
6/4/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0218: Research of consolidation switching to $133.00 4.00 $532.00

equity basis of accounting for GM's OPEL deal.
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6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0219: Prepare initial thoughts and strategy for $300.00 1.50 $450.00
treasury and contracts work stream and issue instructions
to team members.

6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0220: Review TSA status deck. $500.00 0.50 $250.00

6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0221: Review of historical memos and accounting $500.00 1.30 $650.00
for Delphi Transaction.

6/4/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0222: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 4.00 $828.00
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.

6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0223: Accounting research concerning balance $250.00 1.30 $325.00
sheet valuation.

6/4/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0224: Schedule 1S&S meeting to discuss Plan B $250.00 0.00 $0.00
workplan.

6/4/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0225: Working session to discuss Plan B status $300.00 0.50 $150.00
updates.

6/4/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0226: Development of detailed task plan for Plan B $250.00 1.70 $425.00
related accounting issues.

6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0227: Planning and coordination of Financial $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Accounting Standard 144 asset grouping issue.

6/4/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0228: Researching SEC filings of companies in $300.00 1.80 $540.00

Chambless bankruptcy.

6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0229: Review of liquidation basis accounting $500.00 2.80 $1,400.00
matters and adoption after Old GM split.

6/4/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0230: Update 1S&S workstream document based $207.00 0.70 $144.90
on emails.

6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0231: Accounting research concerning balance $250.00 0.90 $225.00

sheet classification.

Page 18 of 421
Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liguidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit C
PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors
Details of Hours and Compensation by Project and Date - Hourly Professional Services
For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009
Total
Date Name Position Description Rate  Hours Compensation
6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0232: Resource planning activities for leasing COE $300.00 0.50 $150.00
team.
6/4/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0233: Email update on contracts workstream to $207.00 0.10 $20.70
applicable personnel.
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0234: Update of draft accounting model. $250.00 1.20 $300.00
6/4/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0235: Researching SEC filings of companies in $300.00 0.50 $150.00
Chambless bankruptcy.
6/4/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0236: Search for 10k filing related to 363 $207.00 0.90 $186.30
transactions.
6/4/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0237: Continue researching and drafting $207.00 2.50 $517.50
whitepaper to determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial
Accounting Standard 141R would apply to the 363
Transaction.
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0238: Update of draft accounting model. $250.00 1.80 $450.00
6/4/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0239: TSA discussion - status update and $500.00 0.50 $250.00
workstream planning - Bishop, Rice, Mandler.
6/4/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0240: Draft the 1S&S Plan B workplan. $300.00 4.00 $1,200.00
6/4/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0241: Update 1S&S workstream document based $207.00 2.10 $434.70
on emails.
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0242: Reviewed contracts workstream. $250.00 0.60 $150.00
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0243: Reviewed complex contract CCL. $250.00 0.70 $175.00
6/4/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0244: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.50 $724.50
determine the accounting for the Preferred Stock and
Warrants.
6/4/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0245: Update of carve-out requirements document. $300.00 1.50 $450.00
6/4/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0246: Reviewed ARO CCL. $250.00 0.80 $200.00
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6/4/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0247: Researching SEC filings of companies in $300.00 0.70 $210.00
Chambless bankruptcy.
6/4/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0248: Update 1S&S workstream document based $207.00 0.50 $103.50
on emails.
6/4/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0249: Review of personnel needs for Plan B $250.00 0.40 $100.00
accounting and reporting workplan.
6/4/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0250: Draft Government contract compliance $300.00 1.30 $390.00
weekly work stream update.
6/4/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0251: Draft the IS&S Plan B workplan. $300.00 4.00 $1,200.00
6/4/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0252: Draft the IS&S Plan B workplan. $300.00 1.00 $300.00
6/4/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0253: Review of accounting for initial lease $300.00 2.20 $660.00
exhibits from initial filing with John Benedetti.
6/4/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0254: Draft the IS&S Plan B workplan. $300.00 3.30 $990.00
6/4/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0255: Read GM lease agreement documents. $300.00 3.50 $1,050.00
6/4/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0256: Continue researching and drafting $207.00 2.50 $517.50
whitepaper to determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial
Accounting Standard 141R would apply to the 363
Transaction.
6/4/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0257: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.40 $703.80
determine whether SOP 90-7 or Financial Accounting
Standard 141R would apply to the 363 Transaction.
6/4/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0258: Reviewed and updated Issues Log and Status $207.00 4.10 $848.70
Meeting updates.
6/5/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0259: Meet with M. Snyder & J Benedetti to $300.00 1.20 $360.00

discuss 1S&S workplans.
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6/5/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0260: Meeting with R. Knittle and M. Snyder $250.00 1.20 $300.00
(GM) to discussion Plan B workplan.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0261: Discussion with Herbst on real estate carve- $500.00 0.30 $150.00
out and potential journal entries.

6/5/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0262: Plan B team status update meeting. C. $300.00 0.80 $240.00
Whitley, B. Bishop, J. Benedetti, A. Jain, K. Chambless.

6/5/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0263: Team status update meeting - Bishop, $300.00 0.80 $240.00
Knittle, Jain, Chambless, Yarris, Benedetti.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0264: Team Status Update Meeting - Bishop, $500.00 0.80 $400.00
Knittle, Jain, Chabless, Yarris, Benedetti.

6/5/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0265: Debrief with CJ Finn regarding Plan B $250.00 0.30 $75.00
meeting with M. Snyder.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0266: Review OldCo separation requirements with $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Benedetti.

6/5/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0267: Meeting with S. Schueller and B. Leiter $250.00 1.10 $275.00
(GM) to discuss current status of issues and present the
Plan B workplan for accounting and reporting issues.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0268: Discussion with Dave Schmit regarding $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Hummer sale.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0269: Discussion with Leiter - APM and policy $500.00 0.70 $350.00
changes.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0270: Discussion with Benedetti - Update and $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Planning for IS&S workstream.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0271: TSA Meeting - Bratley, Keifer, Decker, $500.00 1.50 $750.00
Bishop.

6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0272: Meet with M. Snyder & R Knittle to discuss $300.00 1.20 $360.00
IS&S workplans.
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6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0273: Plan B team status update meeting. C. $300.00 0.80 $240.00
Whitley, B. Bishop, J. Benedetti, A. Jain, K. Chambless.
6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0274: Review OldCo separation requirements with $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Whitley.
6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0275: Discussion with Whitley - Update and $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Planning for 1S&S workstream.
6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0276: Reviewing GM Lease agreements. $300.00 3.50 $1,050.00
6/5/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0277: Plan B team status update meeting. C. $207.00 0.80 $165.60
Whitley, B. Bishop, J. Benedetti, A. Jain, K. Chambless.
6/5/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0278: Discussion with R. Bratley (GM) regarding $500.00 2.40 $1,200.00
TSAs.
6/5/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0279: Meeting with CJ and Rajeev (KPMG). $250.00 0.60 $150.00
6/5/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0280: Organizing binders and archiving of GM $133.00 5.20 $691.60
documents.
6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0281: Preparation for Carve-out Meeting - Real $500.00 0.50 $250.00
Estate & Contracts Non-Executory - Causey.
6/5/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0282: Review of stock warrant agreements. $207.00 2.00 $414.00
6/5/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0283: Technical Accounting Research ARM 5590. $250.00 1.00 $250.00
6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0284: Trial Balance Carveout - Real Estate & $500.00 0.80 $400.00
Contracts Non-Executory - Causey.
6/5/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0285: Prepare for Plan B meeting with M. Snyder. $250.00 0.20 $50.00
6/5/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0286: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 3.00 $621.00
determine the accounting for preferred stock and warrants.
6/5/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0287: Accounting Research for balance sheet $250.00 0.50 $125.00

valuation.
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6/5/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0288: Finalize Government contract compliance $300.00 0.70 $210.00
weekly work stream update.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0289: Discussion with Finn - SEC predecessor $500.00 0.50 $250.00
presentation and update on discussion with SEC regarding
OldCo filing requirements.

6/5/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0290: Update of IS&S Plan B work plan. $300.00 2.00 $600.00

6/5/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0291: Update accounting model. $250.00 1.90 $475.00

6/5/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0292: Review and document Inventory policy and $250.00 5.00 $1,250.00
Fresh start Issue.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0293: Trail Balance Carve-out Meeting - Contracts $500.00 1.00 $500.00
and TSA - Causey.

6/5/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0294: Addressing comments on SOP 90-7 vs $207.00 2.20 $455.40
Financial Accounting Standard 141R whitepaper.

6/5/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0295: Finalize leasing staffing requests and issue $300.00 1.20 $360.00
logistics instructions with Jain.

6/5/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0296: Review SEC Deck for filing requirements. $500.00 0.60 $300.00

6/5/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0297: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 0.80 $165.60
determine the accounting for preferred stock and warrants.

6/5/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0298: Reviewing GM Lease agreements. $300.00 1.00 $300.00

6/5/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0299: Technical Accounting Research ARM 5590. $207.00 1.00 $207.00

6/5/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0300: Update accounting model. $207.00 1.90 $393.30

6/5/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0301: Finalize leasing staffing requests and issue $207.00 1.20 $248.40
logistics instructions with Yarris.

6/5/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0302: Work on APM with regards to the policy $207.00 3.10 $641.70

changes.
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6/6/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0303: Reviewing leasing staffing reporting. $300.00 1.50 $450.00
6/6/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0304: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 2.00 $414.00
determine the accounting for the preferred stock and
warrants.
6/7/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0305: Separate and analyze workstream approval $300.00 1.80 $540.00
forms.
6/7/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0306: Researching and drafting whitepaper to $207.00 4.00 $828.00
determine the accounting for the preferred stock and
warrants.
6/7/2009 Robert W Knittle I Director 0709H0307: Create financial forecast. $300.00 0.80 $240.00
6/7/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0308: Update financial forecast. $300.00 3.10 $930.00
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0309: Review of background GM schedules $207.00 0.60 $124.20
provided by Chris Yarris.
6/8/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0310: Meeting to discuss Lease Financial $250.00 1.00 $250.00
Accounting Standard 146 Calc.
6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0311: Review logistics with R Knittle (PwC). $207.00 0.50 $103.50
6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0312: Meeting on staff alignment AA &COE $300.00 0.50 $150.00
project kick-off (whitley, yarris, benedetti).
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0313: Meeting on staff alignment for accounting $500.00 0.50 $250.00
advisory work and lease COE workstreams - Benedetti
and Yarris.
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0314: Plan B Status meeting and discussion of next $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Presberg steps with C Whitley, A Kittle, A Jain and C Yarris (PwC).
6/8/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0315: Meeting with John Benedetti (PwC) to $180.00 1.50 $270.00
discuss IS&S lease accounting workstream, which is part
of Plan B.
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6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0316: Discuss Delphi objectives and project status $207.00 0.80 $165.60
with C Whitley, J Pope, S Schueller, and C Yarris, all of
PwC.
6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0317: Plan B Update Meeting - CW, RK, MP, AJ, $207.00 0.50 $103.50
CY.
6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0318: Team status update meeting - Whitley, $300.00 0.50 $150.00
Knittle, Jain, Pressberg, Yarris.
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0319: Team Status Update Meeting - Knittle, $500.00 0.50 $250.00
Pressburg, Jain, Yarris.
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0320: Orientation meeting with J. Benedetti and A. $207.00 1.50 $310.50
Sutter (PwC).
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0321: Meet with various members of PWC Team $300.00 0.80 $240.00
(C Yarris, C Whitley, J Benedetti, A Cowan, M Stachnik)
(PwC) for general introductions.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0322: Meet with C Yarris (PwC) to outline my role $300.00 0.80 $240.00
on engagement (i.e. focus on Fresh-Start Accounting).
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0323: Coordination with Benedetti on 1S&S $500.00 1.70 $850.00
workstream and project plan issues.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0324: Meet with C Yarris and S Schueller (PwC) $300.00 0.20 $60.00
to outline my role on project (Fresh-Start Accounting) and
next steps.
6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0325: Plan B Forecast Meeting - RK, BD, AJ, MP. $207.00 0.50 $103.50
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0326: Plan B Current and Future Run Rate Meeting $207.00 0.50 $103.50

Presberg

to discuss the Plan B forecast for the rest of the year, with
B Decker, A Jain, R Knittle (PwC).
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6/8/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0327: Plan B Current and Future Run $300.00 0.50 $150.00
Rate Purpose: To discuss the Plan B forecast for the rest
of the year Attendees: Brian Decker, Aditya Jain, Mary
Presberg, Robert Knittle.
6/8/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0328: Review of current project status and budget $500.00 0.50 $250.00
with Rob Khnittle.
6/8/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0329: Meeting with John Pope regarding Plan B $500.00 0.70 $350.00
developments.
6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0330: Discussion around 90-7 contract accounting $300.00 2.00 $600.00
model with Whitley, Wilhelm, Crouch, Stachnik, Loubser.
6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0331: Discuss contracts model with C. Whitley, C. $207.00 2.00 $414.00
Yarris, J. Crouch, J. Wilhelm, P. Loubser.
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0332: Meeting with GM and D&T to SOP 90-7 $500.00 2.00 $1,000.00
accounting model - Keifer, Synder, Francis, Leiter.
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0333: Discussion around SoP 90-7 accounting $250.00 2.00 $500.00
model - C. Whitley, J. Crouch, P. Loubser, M. Stachnik.
6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0334: Updated Mary Presberg on PMO $207.00 4.00 $828.00
Responsibilities.
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0335:; Met with A Jain (PwC) to discuss Plan B $207.00 0.40 $82.80
Presberg updates and bankruptcy workstream next steps.
6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0336: Intercompany elimination model based upon $300.00 0.60 $180.00
UST responses - discussed with Whitley.
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0337: Working session to update Intercompany $500.00 0.60 $300.00
elimination model based upon responses from US
Treasury Department with Yarris.
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0338: Updated Accounting Model based on $250.00 2.70 $675.00

meeting with C. Whitley et al.
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6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0339: Discuss Delphi overview with B Leiter $207.00 0.50 $103.50
(GM) and S Schueller (PwC).

6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0340: Discuss carve-out deck - accounting $300.00 1.10 $330.00
requirements modifications with Whitley.

6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0341: Modification to carve-out requirements deck $500.00 1.10 $550.00
with Chris Yarris.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0342: Debrief with J Jennings on Delphi overview $207.00 0.20 $41.40
with B Leiter.

6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0343: Review of Contract Liability Model for GM $300.00 1.40 $420.00
and DT with Whitley, Wilhelm, Crouch, Stachnik.

6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0344: Review of contract liability model for GM $500.00 1.40 $700.00
and D&T - Crouch, Yarris, Stachnik, Willhelm.

6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0345: Review of Contract Liability Model for GM $250.00 1.40 $350.00
and DT - C. Whitley, J. Crouch, P. Loubser, M. Stachnik.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0346: Meeting on staff alignment for accounting $300.00 0.50 $150.00
advisory work and lease COE workstreams - Benedetti
and Yarris.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0347: Meeting with A. Sutter (PwC) to discuss $300.00 1.50 $450.00
IS&S lease accounting workstream, which is part of Plan
B.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0348: Meet with various members of PwC Team $300.00 0.80 $240.00
(C Yarris, C Whitley, J Benedetti, R Mihaalko, A Cowan,
M Stachnik) (PwC) for general introductions.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0349: Coordination with Whitley on IS&S $300.00 1.70 $510.00
workstream and project plan issues.

6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0350: Nonworking Travel Time Chicago/Detroit $300.00 2.00 $600.00

(50% of time, no work performed).
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6/8/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0351: Nonworking Travel Time (4 hours total) - $133.00 2.00 $266.00
50% Chargeable - Chicago/Detroit.

6/8/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0352: Travel from New York to Detroit Total $250.00 0.50 $125.00
Travel Time 4hours.

6/8/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0353: Travel from Chicago, IL to Detroit, M. $300.00 1.30 $390.00
Total non-working travel time - 3 hours.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0354: Travel from Chicago IL to Detroit Ml for $207.00 1.30 $269.10
weekly work with GM. Total non-working travel time of 4
hours.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0355: Travel from Chicago IL to Detroit MI for $207.00 1.50 $310.50
weekly work with GM. Total non-working travel time of 4
hours.

6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0356: Travel from Convent Station, NJ to Detroit, $300.00 1.50 $450.00
MI. Total non-working travel time - 7 hours.

6/8/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0357: Non-working travel between $207.00 1.70 $351.90
Minneapolis/Detroit (50% of total travel time).

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0358: Nonworking Travel Time Chicago/Detroit $300.00 2.00 $600.00
(50% of time, no work performed).

6/8/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0359: Financial Accounting Standard 144 research $133.00 1.00 $133.00
for C. Finn (PwC).

6/8/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0360: Update Financial Forecast. $300.00 2.50 $750.00

6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0361: Plan B Update Meeting preparation. $207.00 3.00 $621.00

6/8/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0362: Review next draft of Plan B Government $300.00 2.00 $600.00
Compliance project plan.

6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0363: Reviewed Plan B next steps and Bankruptcy $207.00 1.10 $227.70

Presberg materials.
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6/8/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0364: Create reports for financial forecast. $300.00 1.00 $300.00
6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0365: Prepare intercompany carve-out process $300.00 1.50 $450.00
documentation.
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0366: Update draft SoP 90-7 accounting model. $250.00 2.50 $625.00
6/8/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0367: Addressing comments on SOP 90-7 vs $207.00 3.00 $621.00
Financial Accounting Standard 141R whitepaper.
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0368: Reviewed forecasting data for GM client $207.00 1.40 $289.80
Presberg meeting.
6/8/2009 Robert W Khnittle 11 Director 0709H0369: Create reports for financial forecast. $300.00 3.50 $1,050.00
6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0370: Onboarding and logistics for Delphi work $207.00 1.00 $207.00
and broader project.
6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0371: Email P. Loubser update on Contracts $207.00 0.10 $20.70
workstream.
6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0372: Assemble matrix explaining recording of $207.00 1.50 $310.50
liabilities pre- and post-filing for IS&S workstream.
6/8/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0373: Checked status of GM Security badge with $300.00 0.20 $60.00
security personnel.
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0374: Reviewed Plan B next steps and Bankruptcy $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Presberg materials.
6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0375: Issue List Update. $207.00 1.00 $207.00
6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0376: Review of carve-out deck for Causey. $500.00 1.00 $500.00
6/8/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0377: Review of contract work plan. $300.00 0.60 $180.00
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0378: Reviewed and updated Issues Log and Status $207.00 3.00 $621.00

Presberg

Meeting updates.
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6/8/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0379: Read Master Purchase Agreement and $180.00 4.50 $810.00
related TSA.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0380: Review Delphi Resolution documents. $207.00 2.00 $414.00

6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0381: Draft write-up for Financial Accounting $250.00 1.40 $350.00
Standard 146 accrual, secured and unsecured debt and
asset retirement obligation.

6/8/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0382: Obtained temporary GM security badge $300.00 0.20 $60.00
from GM security office.

6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0383: Plan B Forecast Meeting preparation. $207.00 2.00 $414.00

6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0384: Assemble matrix explaining recording of $207.00 0.40 $82.80
liabilities pre- and post-filing for IS&S workstream.

6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0385: Review of carve-out deck for Causey. $500.00 1.30 $650.00

6/8/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0386: Prepare discussion presentation related to $207.00 1.30 $269.10
the APA.

6/8/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0387: Prepare intercompany carve-out process $300.00 2.90 $870.00
documentation.

6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0388: Review GMNA Accounting Implications of $300.00 1.30 $390.00
Reorganization Trainingv3 powerpoint document to get
GM project background information.

6/8/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0389: Financial Accounting Standard 146 Research $300.00 2.00 $600.00

Chambless including ARM section 1086.

6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0390: Review of liabilities analysis. $250.00 0.60 $150.00

6/8/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0391: Review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 4.00 $532.00
consolidation under FIN46R.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0392: Obtain Delphi documents from S. Schueller $207.00 0.30 $62.10

(PwC).
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6/8/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0393: Draft write-up for discounted and $250.00 1.50 $375.00
undiscounted prepetition liabilities.
6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0394: Instructions to G. Eyman regarding $207.00 0.20 $41.40
replication of binders of Delphi agreements.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0395: Review Bankruptcy Considerations 5-19- $300.00 0.60 $180.00
2009 V0.2 powerpoint document to get GM project
background information.
6/8/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0396: Read transitions services documents. $250.00 3.50 $875.00
6/8/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0397: Issues List Update. $207.00 1.00 $207.00
6/8/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0398: Reviewed and updated Issues Log and Status $207.00 1.60 $331.20
Presberg Meeting updates.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0399: Review PwC 5/12/2009 Fresh-Start Live $300.00 0.70 $210.00
Learning presentation slides to research Fresh-Start
accounting issues.
6/8/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0400: Review status of open items for updates to $300.00 0.70 $210.00
daily report.
6/8/2009  Shannon Kent Director 0709H0401: Financial Accounting Standard 146 Research ~ $300.00 2.70 $810.00
Chambless including ARM section 1086.
6/8/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0402: Addressing comments on SOP 90-7 vs $207.00 3.70 $765.90
Financial Accounting Standard 141R whitepaper.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0403: Email A. Yepes (PwC) about Fresh-Start $300.00 0.20 $60.00
Accounting issues.
6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0404: Research Fresh-Start Accounting $300.00 0.20 $60.00
information data sources on PwC Intranet and resources.
6/8/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0405: Review of notes around GM master sale and $207.00 1.30 $269.10

purchase agreement and TSA agreement.
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6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0406: Review email correspondence from A. $300.00 1.30 $390.00
Yepes (PwC) regarding Fresh-Start Accounting.

6/8/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0407: Review and analysis of 90-7 accounting $300.00 1.10 $330.00
model.

6/8/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0408: Review Delphi Resolution documents. $207.00 1.00 $207.00

6/8/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0409: Review of background documents regarding $207.00 0.30 $62.10
GMNA accounting implications, lease schedules and GM
controller requirements.

6/8/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0410: Continued review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 1.00 $133.00
consolidation under FIN46R.

6/8/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0411: Research Fresh-Start Accounting $300.00 2.50 $750.00
information data sources on PwC Intranet and resources.

6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0412: Assemble matrix for contracts model $207.00 1.90 $393.30
incorporating ideas and layout discussed at meeting.

6/8/2009 Robert W Khnittle 11 Director 0709H0413: Review Old GM TSA deck and make $300.00 0.60 $180.00
recommendations for further editing.

6/8/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0414: Discuss revisions and edits to contracts $207.00 1.40 $289.80
model summary.

6/8/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0415: Preparation for GM Assistant controller $500.00 1.20 $600.00
meeting.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0416: Prepare intercompany carve-out process $300.00 1.50 $450.00
documentation.

6/8/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0417: Review of notes around GM master sale and $300.00 1.00 $300.00

purchase agreement and TSA agreement.
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6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0418: GM -Tuesday 7am update call. Items $300.00 1.50 $450.00
discussed: Contract amendments (25000) sent to various
counterparties. Expected response is within 10 days.
Carve out of new GM expected to be done by 7/31.
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0419: Listening in and taking notes on weekly $207.00 1.50 $310.50
update call hosted by Russ.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0420: GM Assistant Controller Meeting. $500.00 1.50 $750.00
6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0421: Meet with various members of PwWC Team $300.00 0.80 $240.00
(R Knittle, M Presberg, A Sutter) (PwC) for general
introductions and background discussion.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0422: Discuss status of accounting issues with $500.00 0.50 $250.00
Brian Leiter.
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0423: Review National comments on Contract $207.00 0.30 $62.10
Liability Model for GM and DT with P. Loubser and J.
Wilhelm.
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0424: Contracts discussion: Whitley, Crouch, $300.00 0.80 $240.00
Loubser, Stachnik, Wilhelm.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0425: Discuss and edit Contract Liability Model $250.00 0.60 $150.00
for GM and DT - C. Whitley, J. Crouch, M. Stachnik.
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0426: Discuss and edit Contract Liability Model $207.00 0.50 $103.50
for GM and DT with C. Whitley, J. Crouch, P. Loubser,
and J. Wilhelm.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0427: Discuss 90-7 contract accounting model for $500.00 1.30 $650.00
GM paper - Doug Tanner and Jason Crouch.
6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0428: Meeting with D.Dotter,B.Conley, D.Snyder $250.00 1.00 $250.00

(GM),K.Chambliss (PwC) to discuss Financial
Accounting Standard 146 accruals.
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6/9/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0429: Financial Accounting Standard 146 $300.00 1.00 $300.00
Chambless discussion with Danielle Snyder, Brad Conley, Danielle
Dotter and Adriana Yepes.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0430: Client Meeting - R. Wenderski. $250.00 0.20 $50.00
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0431: Process Changes and Updates to Contract $207.00 1.00 $207.00
Liability Memo with C. Whitley and J. Crouch.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0432: Process Changes and Updates to Contract $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Liability Memo - Crouch & Stachnik.
6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0433: Follow-up lease meeting with J Yurecko, J $250.00 1.60 $400.00
Benedetti (PwC), E.Vogel, M.Crismyre (KPMG) and GM
COE lease team.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0434: Follow up lease meeting - PWC lease team $207.00 1.60 $331.20
(Jeff Yurecko, John Benedetti, Adriana Yepes), KPMG
valuation (Eric Vogel, Mike Crismyre), and GM COE
lease team).
6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0435: Internal Meeting with J Yurecko and J $250.00 0.40 $100.00
Benedetti to discuss lease meetings/agenda.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0436: PwC team process meeting (Jeff Yurecko, $207.00 0.40 $82.80
John Benedetti, Adriana Yepes) regarding previous lease
meeting.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0437: Client Meeting - R. Wenderski. $250.00 1.10 $275.00
6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0438: Preparation for and discussion with Abigail $180.00 1.50 $270.00
Fleming (PwC) regarding 1S&S and Plan B/Direct Drive.
6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0439: Meeting with Nick Schunck to discuss the $300.00 0.20 $60.00
status of the Treasury work plan.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0440: Discuss KPMG valuation approach contracts $500.00 1.00 $500.00
and issue identification with Benedetti.
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6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0441: Meeting with J.Yurecko, J.Benedetti, $250.00 1.30 $325.00
GMCOE lease team, GM Corporate accounting.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0442: Aircraft lease termination meeting - PwC $207.00 1.30 $269.10
team (Jeff Yurecko, John Benedetti, Adriana Yepes), GM
COE lease team, GM corporate accounting.
6/9/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0443: Meeting with Keifer/Russ Bratley to discuss $500.00 1.00 $500.00
TSA status and approach.
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0444: TSA discussion with Bratley & Keifer $300.00 1.00 $300.00
(yarris, whitley, decker).
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0445: Discuss Status Report and Overview Service $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Approach TSA - Keifer & Bratley - Decker, Mandler and
Rice.
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0446: Process Changes and Updates to Contract $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Liability Memo with C. Whitley and J. Crouch.
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0447: GM -Tuesday 7am update call. Items $300.00 1.50 $450.00
discussed: Contract amendments (25000) sent to various
counterparties. Expected response is within 10 days.
Carve out of new GM expected to be done by 7/31.
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0448: Follow up lease meeting - PWC lease team $300.00 1.60 $480.00
(Jeff Yurecko, John Benedetti, Adriana Yepes), KPMG
valuation (Eric Vogel, Mike Crismyre), and GM COE
lease team).
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0449: Internal Meeting with J Yurecko and A $300.00 0.40 $120.00
Yepes to discuss lease meetings/agenda.
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0450: Discuss KPMG valuation approach contracts $300.00 1.00 $300.00
and issue identification with Whitley.
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0451: Meeting with J.Yurecko, J.Benedetti, A. $300.00 1.30 $390.00

Yepes, GMCOE lease team, GM Corporate accounting.
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6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0452: GM management and controller group Plan $207.00 1.60 $331.20
B re-organization conference call.
6/9/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0453: Participation in GM weekly Plan B update $500.00 1.00 $500.00
with R. Bratley (GM).
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0454: Review Delphi Resolution presentation to $207.00 0.50 $103.50
GM CEO and Treasurer.
6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0455: GM mgmt / controller group Plan B re-org $250.00 1.60 $400.00
conference call.
6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0456: Weekly call with GM management. $180.00 1.30 $234.00
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0457: GM Tuesday morning accounting call with $207.00 1.50 $310.50
GM leadership.
6/9/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0458: R. Bratley (GM) conference call. $207.00 1.50 $310.50
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0459: Listen to weekly Controllers' call hosted by $300.00 1.50 $450.00
R. Bratley (GM).
6/9/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0460: Weekly GM accounting update call. $133.00 1.50 $199.50
6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0461: Listen to 7:00 am Project Renaissance $300.00 1.50 $450.00
Corporate Accounting Update Session to discuss status of
the project to date.
6/9/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0462: Attended R. Bratley's (GM) Plan B PMO $300.00 1.50 $450.00
weekly status update meeting.
6/9/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0463: Attended global controllers meeting to $207.00 1.10 $227.70
Presberg determine next steps and key dates.
6/9/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0464: Summarizing the preferred stock and warrant ~ $207.00 3.00 $621.00

whitepaper into preliminary views.
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6/9/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0465: Reconciled global 'Issues List' with PwC $207.00 2.50 $517.50
Presberg Issue Report and updated Plan B status reports for
discussion with GM and PwC leadership.
6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0466: Literature review of lease accounting and $180.00 1.80 $324.00
IS&S Plan B workplan development.
6/9/2009 Shannon Kent Director 0709H0467: Financial Accounting Standard 146 Research $300.00 2.30 $690.00
Chambless including ARM section 1086.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0468: Prepared team emails for SoP 90-7 Project. $250.00 0.60 $150.00
6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0469: Review of contract liability model. $300.00 0.50 $150.00
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0470: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.30 $62.10
and management presentation.
6/9/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0471: Plan B Update Meeting Prep. $207.00 1.50 $310.50
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0472: Reviewed and planned staff schedules and $300.00 0.40 $120.00
responsibilities for the week.
6/9/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0473: Review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 4.00 $532.00
Consolidation under FIN46R.
6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0474: Coordinate meeting to discuss contracts $207.00 0.10 $20.70
liabilities analysis.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0475: Review of various GM presentations around $207.00 1.60 $331.20
bankruptcy plan focusing on GM Accounting & Reporting
Bankruptcy Strategic Roadmap and the GM Separation
Requirements Summary.
6/9/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0476: Update the Corporate Center IS&S Plan B $300.00 0.60 $180.00
workplan.
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0477: Contracts document review. $300.00 0.30 $90.00
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6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0478: Review National comments on Contract $300.00 0.50 $150.00
Liability Model for GM and DT.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0479: Review national comments on Contract $250.00 0.30 $75.00
Liability Model for GM and DT - C. Whitley, J. Crouch,
M. Stachnik.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0480: Preparation for meeting on TSAs with Keifer $500.00 1.30 $650.00
and Bratley.
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0481: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 1.20 $248.40
and management presentation.
6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0482: Review TSA Master Lease documents. $250.00 1.80 $450.00
6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0483: Review Bankruptcy Admin policies (time & $300.00 0.70 $210.00
expense reporting policy and time tracking tool.
6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0484: Discuss and edit Contract Liability Model $300.00 0.50 $150.00
for GM and DT.
6/9/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0485: Review the draft TSA strategic plan and $300.00 1.10 $330.00
make recommendations.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0486: Review Contract Liability Model and $250.00 1.10 $275.00
prepare comments.
6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0487: Alteration of 1S&S Plan B Workplan. $180.00 0.80 $144.00
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0488: Reviewed reconciliation of lease listing $207.00 0.30 $62.10
received by COE to listing of properties within the TSA.
6/9/2009 Rebecca R Taylor Manager 0709H0489: Review and update current status of Plan B $250.00 0.20 $50.00
items for Brian L.
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0490: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.80 $165.60

and management presentation.
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6/9/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0491: Update draft of Plan B Government $300.00 1.50 $450.00
Compliance project plan per discussion and review
comments from S. Herbst (GM).

6/9/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0492: Review of TSA materials for meeting with $500.00 1.30 $650.00
R. Bratley (GM).

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0493: Update of carve-out requirements document. $300.00 0.60 $180.00

6/9/2009 Douglas G Tanner Partner (US 0709H0494: Discuss 90-7 contract accounting model for $610.00 0.60 $366.00

Technical) GM paper.
6/9/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0495: Updated forecasting data for client meeting. $207.00 1.50 $310.50
Presberg

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0496: Review summary draft of Master Lease $207.00 1.30 $269.10
Agreement.

6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0497: Lease guidance review and 1S&S workplan $180.00 1.20 $216.00
development/planning.

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0498: Reviewed updated copy National Office $250.00 0.80 $200.00
comments.

6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0499: Interpret application of SOP 90-7 related to $300.00 1.20 $360.00
Fresh-Start Accounting.

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0500: Additional contracts review. $300.00 0.40 $120.00

6/9/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0501: Received comments on Contract Liability $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Model. Responded to email, assembled comparison of
comments to model, and distributed to Contracts team.

6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0502: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.70 $144.90
and management presentation.

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0503: Amend carve-out requirements document. $300.00 0.20 $60.00
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6/9/2009 Paul Loubser Director 0709H0504: Review National comments on Contract $300.00 0.60 $180.00
Liability Model.
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0505: Set up meetings with GM contacts. $300.00 0.30 $90.00
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0506: Reviewed TSA work plan. $300.00 0.50 $150.00
6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0507: Continue to interpret application of SOP 90- $300.00 4.00 $1,200.00
7 related to Fresh-Start Accounting.
6/9/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0508: Updated Plan B status reports for discussion $207.00 2.70 $558.90
Presberg with GM and PwC leadership.
6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0509: Preparation of lease accounting guidance for $180.00 2.00 $360.00
IS&S leases.
6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0510: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.40 $82.80
and management presentation.
6/9/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0511: Reading TSAs. $207.00 0.80 $165.60
6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0512: Reviewed contracts accounting guidance. $300.00 1.10 $330.00
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0513: Reviewed final draft of Contract Liability $250.00 0.30 $75.00
Model before sent to GM.
6/9/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0514: Summarizing the preferred stock and warrant $207.00 1.40 $289.80
whitepaper into preliminary views.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0515: Prepare agenda for trial balance meeting $250.00 0.10 $25.00
with H. Williams.
6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0516: Meeting to discuss bankrupt legal entities' $250.00 0.70 $175.00
trial balances - H. Williams.
6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0517: Review of lease agreements. $500.00 1.00 $500.00
6/9/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0518: Update project forecast for revised budget $300.00 1.70 $510.00

numbers received.
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6/9/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0519: Review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 4.00 $532.00
Consolidation under FIN46R.

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0520: Prepare and review TSA status update slides. $300.00 1.90 $570.00

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0521: Review trial balance files. $250.00 0.80 $200.00

6/9/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0522: Addressing comments on SOP 90-7 vs $207.00 3.00 $621.00
Financial Accounting Standard 141R whitepaper.

6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0523: Retrieving and organizing hard copies of $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Delphi transaction documents.

6/9/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0524: TSA Planning. $207.00 3.00 $621.00

6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0525: Discussion with R. Bratley (GM) about $500.00 0.50 $250.00
MPSA.

6/9/2009 Brian C Kocinski Senior Associate 0709H0526: Organize and work with Detroit Repro. $207.00 0.50 $103.50
department on document production for C. Yarris (PwC).

6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0527: Review Draft Purchase and Sale Agreement. $250.00 1.00 $250.00

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0528: Review of master sale & purchase agreement $207.00 0.30 $62.10
between oldco and newco.

6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0529: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 1.80 $372.60
and management presentation.

6/9/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0530: Updated forecasting data for client meeting. $207.00 2.20 $455.40

Presberg

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0531: Update trial balance files. $250.00 0.90 $225.00

6/9/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0532: Update 1S&S Plan B Workplan. $180.00 1.00 $180.00

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0533: Review legal entities TBs and liabilities $250.00 0.70 $175.00
analysis from Alix.

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0534: Prepare status updates and scheduling. $300.00 0.50 $150.00
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6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0535: Update TSA documents and workplan. $500.00 1.30 $650.00

6/9/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0536: Continue Review of Draft Purchase and Sale $250.00 2.00 $500.00
Agreement.

6/9/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0537: Interpret application of PwC Accounting & $300.00 1.70 $510.00
Reporting Manual 5590 related to Fresh-Start Accounting.

6/9/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0538: Review of all the different versions of the $207.00 0.40 $82.80
TSA.

6/9/2009 Aditya Jain Senior Associate 0709H0539: TSA Review. $207.00 3.20 $662.40

6/9/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0540: Read Asset Purchase Agreement. $300.00 1.50 $450.00

6/9/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0541: Transitioned the project forecast. $300.00 1.10 $330.00

6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0542: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 1.10 $227.70
and management presentation.

6/9/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0543: Summarizing the preferred stock and warrant $207.00 2.10 $434.70
whitepaper into preliminary views.

6/9/2009 Brian C Kocinski Senior Associate 0709H0544: Pickup and deliver printouts for C. Yarris $207.00 0.40 $82.80
(PwC).

6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0545: Update Contract Deck - Brian Lieter $500.00 0.50 $250.00
Comments - Crouch and Stachnik.

6/9/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0546: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.10 $20.70
and management presentation.

6/9/2009 Anastasia S Brown Director 0709H0547: Update draft of Plan B Government $300.00 2.50 $750.00
Compliance project plan and submit to Ernst & Young
PMO.

6/9/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0548: Review APA contract. $500.00 1.10 $550.00

6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0549: Contracts document review. $300.00 2.30 $690.00
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6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0550: Continue to interpret application of SOP 90- $300.00 3.30 $990.00
7 related to Fresh-Start Accounting.
6/9/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0551: Update the Corporate Center IS&S Plan B $300.00 0.60 $180.00

workplan.

6/10/2009 Christopher J Allen  Associate 0709H0552: 4 hours - Updating the Issue tracker database $133.00 4.00 $532.00
for Rebecca Taylor.

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0553: Follow on discussion on issue identified in $500.00 1.50 $750.00
KPMG valuation approach for lease contracts - Benedetti.

6/10/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0554: Plan B Status meeting and discussion of next $207.00 0.30 $62.10

Presberg steps with C Whitley, A Kittle, A Jain and C Yarris (PwC).

6/10/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0555: Attended GM Bankruptcy training course $300.00 2.50 $750.00
hosted by PwC.

6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0556: Discussion with Brian Decker (PwC) $180.00 0.20 $36.00
regarding IS&S.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0557: Client Meeting - R. Wenderski. $250.00 0.20 $50.00

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0558: Meeting with B. Leiter to discuss SoP 90-7 $250.00 0.80 $200.00
deliverable - C. Whitley.

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0559: Meeting with Brian to discuss SoP 90-7 $500.00 0.80 $400.00
deliverable.

6/10/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0560: Discuss Carve-out requirements - K. Causey, $300.00 0.50 $150.00
C. Whitley.

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0561: Keith Causey Carve-out requirements $500.00 0.50 $250.00
discussion.

6/10/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0562: Discussion of next steps regarding workplan $500.00 0.50 $250.00

execution with Phil Koos.
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6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0563: Meeting with Abigail Fleming (PwC) to $180.00 0.70 $126.00
discuss IS&S Plan B.

6/10/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0564: Discuss background on legal structure of Old $300.00 0.50 $150.00
GM and New GM with PwC team (J Benedetti, PWC).

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0565: Client Discussion - B. Leiter. $250.00 0.30 $75.00

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0566: Updated Contracts Model for B. Leiter's $250.00 0.90 $225.00
comments.

6/10/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0567: Discuss Carve-out requirements - K. Causey, $300.00 1.00 $300.00
C. Whitley, Ernst & Young - J Deegan, B Khandelwal.

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0568: Meet K. Causey RE: Intercompany and $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Carve-out requirements - Yarris.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0569: Meeting to discuss Treasury Workstream $250.00 0.30 $75.00
and Debt Inventory Listing - R. Ferguson.

6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0570: Plan B with Abigail Fleming (PwC) and $180.00 0.70 $126.00
Marci Snyder (GM).

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0571: Review and update accounting requirements $500.00 1.30 $650.00
for carve-out workstream on leasing with Benedetti.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0572: Contracts workstream discussion - J. Crouch, $250.00 0.50 $125.00
P. Loubser, M. Stachnik.

6/10/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0573: Discuss Contracts workstream status and $207.00 0.50 $103.50
next steps with J. Crouch, J. Wilhelm, and P. Loubser.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0574: Discussing summaries of Delphi transaction $207.00 1.10 $227.70
documents with J Jennings (PwC).

6/10/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0575: Review of status with Shannon Herbst. $500.00 0.60 $300.00

6/10/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0576: Discussed Delphi FIN46R analysis with $133.00 1.10 $146.30
Aaron Cowarn, PwC.
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6/10/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0577: Plan B Status meeting and discussion of next $207.00 0.50 $103.50
Presberg steps with C Whitley, A Kittle, A Jain and C Yarris (PWC).

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0578: TSA Next Steps: Planning - Jain, Bishop, $500.00 1.00 $500.00
Decker, Mandler, Rice, Dimuzio.

6/10/2009 Rebecca Mihalko Director 0709H0579: Meet with Chris Yarris (PwC) to debrief on $300.00 0.20 $60.00
fresh-start accounting updates.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0580: Discuss Delphi structure with C Whitley $207.00 0.50 $103.50
(PwC) and get his thoughts directionally.

6/10/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0581: Follow on discussion on issue identified in $300.00 1.50 $450.00
KPMG valuation approach for lease contracts - Whitley.

6/10/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0582: Attended GM Bankruptcy training course $300.00 2.50 $750.00
hosted by PwC.

6/10/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0583: Discuss background on legal structure of Old ~ $300.00 0.50 $150.00
GM and New GM with PwC team (R Mihalko, PwWC).

6/10/2009 John Benedetti Director 0709H0584: Review and update accounting requirements $300.00 1.30 $390.00
for carve-out workstream on leasing with Whitley.

6/10/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0585: Update Plan B forecast. $300.00 1.70 $510.00

6/10/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0586: Documentation and various project $300.00 1.50 $450.00
administration.

6/10/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0587: Obtained feedback on Plan B forecast. $300.00 0.60 $180.00

6/10/2009 Robert W Knittle 11 Director 0709H0588: Update Plan B team forecast. $300.00 1.10 $330.00

6/10/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0589: Summarizing the preferred stock and warrant $207.00 2.20 $455.40
whitepaper into preliminary views.

6/10/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0590: Review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 2.00 $266.00

Consolidation under FIN46R.

Page 45 of 421

Friday, December 10, 2010



Motors Liguidation Company, et al (09-50026-REG) Exhibit C

PricewaterhouseCoopers LLP - Special Accountants and Tax Advisors

Details of Hours and Compensation by Project and Date - Hourly Professional Services

For the Period June 1, 2009 through July 9, 2009

Total

Date Name Position Description Rate  Hours Compensation

6/10/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0591: Coordinate meeting to update team on $207.00 0.20 $41.40
contracts workstream status.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0592: Review project workstream files. $250.00 0.60 $150.00

6/10/2009 Mary Katherine Senior Associate 0709H0593: Updated forecasting data for client meeting. $207.00 3.10 $641.70

Presberg

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0594: Review SOP 90-7 Deliverable for upcoming $500.00 1.30 $650.00
meeting.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0595: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.90 $186.30
and management presentation.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0596: Review Trial Balance data update and $250.00 0.90 $225.00
modify file for requirements.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0597: Review master lease agreement and sale- $207.00 2.30 $476.10
leaseback matrix.

6/10/2009 Adriana Yepes Manager 0709H0598: Review Financial Accounting Standard 98 $250.00 2.90 $725.00
issues related to Lease Matrix.

6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0599: Email coordination with A. Fleming (PwC) $180.00 0.40 $72.00
at IS&S to discuss TSA.

6/10/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0600: Review of workplan regarding government $500.00 1.00 $500.00
contracting.

6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0601: Preparation for TSA review through review $180.00 1.10 $198.00
of PwC template.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0602: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.40 $82.80
and management presentation.

6/10/2009 Troy P Van Beek Senior Associate 0709H0603: Addressing comments on SOP 90-7 vs $207.00 2.20 $455.40

Financial Accounting Standard 141R whitepaper.
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6/10/2009 Joe Jennings Associate 0709H0604: Review of Delphi Agreements for $133.00 2.10 $279.30
Consolidation under FIN46R.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0605: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 0.20 $41.40
and management presentation.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0606: Security office visit to obtain passes and $207.00 0.30 $62.10
access to GM building an relevant floors.

6/10/2009 Aaron Kevin Cowan  Senior Associate 0709H0607: Reviewing Delphi transaction documents $207.00 1.20 $248.40
and management presentation.

6/10/2009 Douglas G Tanner Partner (US 0709H0608: GM Plan B. $610.00 1.70 $1,037.00

Technical)

6/10/2009 Amy M Sutter Manager 0709H0609: Preparation of lease accounting guidance for $180.00 1.90 $342.00
IS&S leases and review of liability guidance for IS&S.

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Wilhelm Manager 0709H0610: Updated Contracts Model for B. Leiter's $250.00 1.10 $275.00
comments.

6/10/2009 Brian D Decker Partner 0709H0611: Review of updated forecast of staffing and $500.00 0.70 $350.00
timing.

6/10/2009 Mark Stachnik Senior Associate 0709H0612: Update IC diagram. $207.00 0.50 $103.50

6/10/2009 Jeffrey Yurecko Senior Associate 0709H0613: Creation of TSA excel schedule including $207.00 1.10 $227.70
matrix of role responsibilities for OldCo vs. NewCo, fees
being charged and relevant properties.

6/10/2009 Christopher Yarris Director 0709H0614: Staffing planning for inventory and contracts $300.00 0.50 $150.00
work stream.

6/10/2009 Robert C Whitley Partner 0709H0615: Review MPSA documents and contracts $500.00 0.50 $250.00
post-close.

6/10/2009 Robert W Knittle Il Director 0709H0616: Review Plan B forecast updates and plan. $300.00 0.80 $240.00
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